BIDDER AND LOCATION

2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Associates LLC Printet's Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc,
Elk Grave, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale, AZ 85260
. - A. WORK SHIRTS ) .
A-1, Men's Polo Shirts
Blue Generation, BG72086, Short Sleeve, Light Blue
Ttem# Size ;’:"; :t‘: Total | Unit Price QE:: Total [ unit Price ;,q‘t Total | Unit Price ;:: Total  JUnit Price QE:: Total ;:‘é: QE:: Total — QE:V" Total ;’r'.‘":: ;:: Total ;’:: ;ty’t Total
A-1-1 |Small - Large $10.46 10 $104.60) 2049 10 $204.90] No Bid 10] NoBid $12.65( 10 $125‘50| s15.25| 10 $152.50] $11.38 10 $113.80] $13.75| 10 $137.50]  $15.22| 10 $152.20] #1460 10 $146,00
A-1-2 | IX-Large $10.46] 20 $209.20| $20.49| 20 $409.80 No Bid 20l NoBid $12.65 20| szsa.ool $15.25 zo| $305.00] $11.38 20| $227.600 41375 20 $275.000 s$15.22| 20 $304.400 $14.60| 20 $292.00
A-1-3 |2X-Large $11.54 30 $346.20I $25.49| 30 $764.70] No Bid 30] NoBid $13.99| 30 $419.7o| $15.25 3o| $457.50] $12.52 30| $375.600 $14.25] 30 s427.508  $1822| 30 $546.60] $16.08| 30 $482,40
A-1-4 |3x-Large $13.74 10 s137.40] $25.49| 10 $254.90] No Bid 10 NoBid $16.65 10 $166.50I $1525| 10 s152.50] $14.81 10 $148.100 51625 10 $162.500  $19.22| 10 $192.200 s$18.88| 10| $188.80
Subtotal A-1 $797.40| Subtotal A-1 $1,634.30] Subtotal A-1 50.00] Subtotal A-1 $955.7o| Subtotal A-1 $1,067.50| Subtotal A-1 $865.10) Subtotal A-1 $1,002,50] Subtotal A-1 $1,195.40] Subtotal A-1 $1,109.20
A-2. Ladles’ Polo Shirts
Blue feneration, BG6209, Short Sleeve, Light Blue
Items# Size l"j:m_ _g: Total | Unit Price E:;‘ Total | Unit Price ft’vt Tol  [uniterice| = |  votal  |unitprice E: Total :,’r'l'f; 5:: Tota ;?;:_ _;:vt Total ;’;:_ _QE;vt Total ;:;':_ _iv“ Total
A-2-1 |Smalf - Large $9.98 15 $149.70 $19.49| 15 $292.350 No Bid 15| Mo Bid $11.93| 15 $178.95]  $14.55 15 $218.25] 410.77 15 $161,55] $10.85] 15 $162.75)  $10.22] 15 $153.30] $13.93 15 $208.95
Subtotal A-2 $149.70| Subtotal A-2 $292.35] Subtotal A-2 $0.00] Subtotal A-2 $178.95| Subtotal A-2 $218.25| Subtotal A-2 $161,55) Subtotal A-2 $162.75] Subtotal A-2 $153-30| Subtotal A-2 $208.95
A-3. Men's Polo Shirts
Blue Generation, BG7208, Long Sleeve, Light Blue
Item# Size :::I:: ;: Total Unit Price QEt‘yt Total Unit Price QEf: Total Unit Price QE:: Total Unit Price ;ts; Total :::: QE: Total ;’:; ;: Total :r'i‘c': QE:: Total :’r;':e QE:: Total
A-3-1 | Small - Large $14.19 15 $212.85 $26.49] 15 $397.35] No Bid 15  NoBid $17.20 15 $258.000  419.95] 15 $299.25| $15.28 15 $229.2o| $16.95 15 $254.250  $20.22| 15 $303.30§ 41948 15 $291.90
A-3-2 |1X-Large $14.19| 25 $354.75 $26.49] 25 $662.25] No Bid 25] NoBd $17.20 25 $430.00]  $19.95] 25 $498.75] s$15.28] 25 $382.0{JI $16.95| 25 $423.750  $20.22| 25 $505.50] $19.46 25 $486.50
A-3-3 |2X-targe $1533| 20 $306.60]  $3149| 20 $629.80§ No Bid 20] NoBid $18.53| 20 $370.600  $19.95] 20 $399.00] s$1642| 20 $328.40] $17.95| 20 $359.000 $21.22| 20 $424.40] %2085 20 $417.20
A-34 |3X-Large $17.49 10 $174.9o| $31.49] 10 $314.90] No Bid 10] Mo Bid $21.200 10 $212.00]  $19.95 10 $199.50] $18.71 10 $187.10] $19.95| 10 $190.500  $23.22| 10 $232.200 $23.66] 10 $236.60
Subtotal A-3 $1,049.10| Subtotal A-3 $2,004.30] Subtotal A-3 $0.00] Subtotal A-3 $1,270.60] Subtotal A-3 $1,396.50| Subtotal A-3 $1,126.70] Subtotal A-3 $1,236.50] Subtotal A-3 $1,465.40] Subtotal A-3 $1,432.20
A-4. Ladles’ Polo Shirts
Blue Generation, BG6207, Long Sleeve, Light Blue
Item# Size Er;‘:_ Est Total | Unit Price 'ftsvt Total IUnit Price 5:;‘ Total | unitprice | o> Total  |unit Price Ei Total o f:vt Total o :'c";_ Etsvt Total :n:;; f:vt Total U"I i P Total
A-4-1 |Smatt - Large $12.97 15 $194.55 $24.49| 15 $367.35I No Bid 15 No Bid $15.67| 15 $235.05]  $18.75| 15 $281.25] $13.97 15 $209.55| $12.35| 15 $155.25| $12.22| 15 $1s3.3o| $17.85| 15 $267.75
Subtotal A-4 $194.55] Subtotal A-4 $367.35| Subtotal A-4 $0.00] Subtotal A-4 $235.05] Subtotal A-4 $281.25] Subtotal A-4 $209.55| Subtotal A-4 $185-25| Subtotal A-4 $183.30I Subtotal A-4 $267.75
A-5. Men's Button Down Collar Shirts
Blue Generation, BG7216S, Short Sleeve, Light Blue
Item# size :;:_ _E:: Total | Unit Price s:vt Total | unit Price sts: Total | Unit Price Etsvt Total  |unit Price é; Total :['I‘; E;_t Total ;‘l‘;;_ _;:;‘ Total od ';tg Etsvt Total ;'r"';_ _;s: Total
A-5-1 |targe $12.14 20 $24280] 32349 20 $469.80§  No Bid 20 No Bid $14.65 20 $203.00] $17.74| 20 $354.80] si13.10) 20 $262.00] $14.95| 20 $299.00]  $1762| 20 535240 $16.66| 20 $333.20
A-5-2 |Ix-Large $12.14 20] $242.BOI $23.45] 20 $469.80  No Bid 20 No Bid $14.65 20 $293.00] 41774 20 $354.80| $13.10 20 $262.00I $14.95| 20 3,299.00' $17.62| 20 $352.40| $16.66 20| $333.20
A-5-3 |2x-targe $13.19 10} $131.90| $28.43| 10 $284.900 No Bid 10 No Bid $15.99| 10 $159.90] $17.74 10 s177.40] s14.24 10 $142.4o| $16.35] 10 $163.50I $18.62| 10 s186.20) s18.18] 1o $181.80
Subtotal A-5 $617-50| Subtotal A-5 $1,224.50] Subtotal A-5 $0.00] Subtotal A-5 $745.90] Subtotal A-5 $887.00] Subtotal A-5 $666.40| Subtotal A-5 $751-50| Subtotal A-5 $891.00] Subtotal A-5 $848.20
A-6. Men's Button Down Collar Shirts
Blue Generation, BG7216, Long Sleeve, Light Blue
Item# Size :rll‘;_ _5: Total | Unit Price Etsvt Total | Unit Price g:: Total | unit Price (ftsvt Total  |unit Price E"t. Total ;’r'lfte E:vt Total :’;‘E 3:: Total - '1:;_ _QE:: Total p":;‘::_ _::: Total
A-6-1 |iarge $12.14| 20 524280  $2349| 20 $469.80] No Bid 20|  NoBid 414,65 20 $293.000 $17.74| 20 $354.80] $13.10 20 szsz.ool $14.95] 20 $299.UOI $17.62| 20 g352.40] $16.78] 20 $335.60
A-6-2 |1X-Large $12.14| 20 $242.80I $23.49| 20 $469.80] No Bid 20| No Bid $14.65| 20 $293.000  $17.74] 20 $354.80] $13.10] 20 $262.00I $14.95( 20 $299.00| $17.62| 20 $352.4o| $16.78] 20 $335.60
A-6-3 |2X-targe $13.19] 20 $263.80 $28.49| 20 $569.800 No Bid zol No Bid $15.59] 20 $319.80) $17.74] 20 $354.80] $14.24 20 $2ea80] $1635] 20 $327.oo| $18.62| 20 $372.4o| $18.18| 20 $363.60
Subtotal A-6 $749.40] subtotal A-6 $1,509.40] Subtotal A-6 $0.00] Subtotal A-6 $905.80] Subtotal A-6 $1,064.40] Subtotal A-6 $808.80] Subtotal A-6 $925.00| Subtotal A-6 $1,077-20| Subtotal A-6 $1,034.80




BIDDER AND LOCATION
2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group A8A Sales Associates LLC Printer's Ink LL.C Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale, AZ B5260
A. WORK SHIRTS ( continued) ,,,, ] ) ] =]
A-7. Men's Button Pocket T-Shirts
Fruit of the Loom, 5930P, Short Sleeve, Light Blue
I Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered
Item# Size
Unlt | Est Est Est Est Est Omit ] Est Est Est Unit | Est
Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total . Total Total Total
Price 1 Qtv, L9i1/ oly, Oty Price L Oty, L Oty Oty Price. LDI'
A-7-1 |Medium $4.73 5| $23.65 $9.00 5 $45.0DI $5.07 5 $25.35 $6.32 5 $31.60 $5.95 5 $29.75 $4.60 5 $23.00, $6.95 5 S $32.75 $7.30 5 $36.50
A-7-2 |large $4.73 30 $141.90| $9.00] 30 $270.00I $5.07 30 $152.10 $6.32 30 $189.60| $5.95 30 £178.50 $4.60 301 $138.00 $6.95 30 $208.SDI $6.,55 30 $196.50 £7.30 30 $215.00
A7-3 | 1x-Large sa73| 80 sa7840]  s9.00] s0 s7000f  s507] 0 $405.60 $632| 80 ssos.60]  ¢5.95] 80 s476.00] ¢4.60] 80 s360.00] 3695 80 sss6.00]  ¢6.55] 80 ss24.000 730 &0 $584.00
A-7-4 |2X-Large $6.54 60 $392.40| $11.00| 60 $660.00l $7.01 60 $420.60] $9.24| 60 $554.40| $7.24 60 $434.40| $6.54 60 $392.4tﬂ $8.50| 60 $s1o.ool $8.65| 60 $519.00I $9.57| 60 $574.20
A-7-5 |3X-Large $6.71 20 $134.20 $11.00] 20 $220.00I $7.19 20 $143.80I $10.45 20 $209.00I $7.50 20| $150.00] $7.97 20 $159.40 $8.50 20 $170.00 $9.65 20 $193.00I $5.78 20 $195.60
Subtotal A-7 $1,070.55| Subtotal A-7 $1,915.00I Subtotal A-7 $1,147.45| Subtotal A-7 $1,490.20] Subtotal A-7 $1,268.65| Subtotal A-7 $1,080.80] Subtotal A-7 $1,479.25] Subtotal A-7 $1,465-25| Subtotal A-7 $1,609.30
A-8. Men's Work Shirts
Red Kap, SC30LB, Long Sleeve, Light Blue
Unit Est Est - ; Est . Est | | —— | Est Unit Est Unit Est Unit Est Unit Est
Item# Size I Price Qty. Total Unit Price Oty. Total |Umt Price Qty. Total Unit Price Qty. Total Unit Price| Qty. Total Price Qty. Total I Price | Qty. Total I Price Qty. Total Price | Qty. Total
Reguiar Back Length '
Substitute Product Offered
A-8-1 Large $19.46 20 $389.20] $21.49| 20 $429.80) $16.92 20 $338.40 $16.91 20 $338.20] $17.50 20 $350.00( $16.65 20 $333.00 $13.95 20 $279.00 $15.10 20 $302.00
$16.49 20 $329.80
A-8-2 |1X-Large $19.46 20 $389.20 $21.49] 20 $429.80 $16.52 20 $338.40 $16.91 20 $338.20 $17.50 20 $350.00] %$16.65 20 $333.00 $13.95 20 $279.00 $16.49 20 $329.80| $15.10 20 $302.00
A-8-3 | 2X-Large $23.24 10 $232.40I $25.49 1D| $254.90I $20.31 10 $203.10I $20.08 10 $200.80I $18.95 10 $189.50| $19.89 10 $198.90 $16.35 10 $163.50 $18.49 i0 $1B4.90I $1B.12 10 $181.20
Long Back Lengtly .
A-B-4 | IX-Large $21.76 10 $217.60 $21.,49 10 $214.90I $16.92 10 $169.20| $16.91 10 $169.10I $18.95 10 $189.50| $16.65 10 $166.50I £13.95 10 $139.50I $17.49 10 $174.90| $15.10 10 $151.00
A-8-5 |2X-large $25.79 10 $257.90 $25.42 10 $254.90I $20.31 10 $203.10i $20.08 10 $200.86I $18.95 10 $189.50I $15.89 10 $198.90I $16.35 10 $163.50I $19.49 10 $194.90I $18.12 10 $181.20
Subtotal A-8 $1,486.30| Subtotal A-8 $1,584.30I Subtotal A-8 $1,252.20] Subtotal A-8 $1,247.1o| Subtotal A-8 $1,268.50| Subtotal A-8 $1,230.3o| Subtotal A-8 $1,024.50] Subtotal A-8 $1,214.30| Subtotal A-8 $1,117.40
A-9. Reflective T-Shirts
Forester, 009051, Short Sleeve, Safety Green
Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered Unit - Substitute Product Offered
Item# Size = Eot et = Unit Price QEtsvt Total Unit Price] QBtyt Total Unit = it 1 5 P:oe Qty Total =" Tot
n . - - ni n . n
price | Qty. Total Unit Price Qty. Total Unit Price Qty. Total price | aty. Total price | Qty. Total price | Oty. Total
A-9-1 |Small - 5X-Large $12.64 60 $758.40 $23.49 60 1,409,408 $7.88 21) $472.80| $12.93 &0 $775.BOI $5.15 60 $549.00] $10.59 60 $635.40| $11.85 60 $711.0{)| $14.00 60 $840.00| $12.35 60 $741.00
Subtotal A-9 $758.40| Subtotal A-9 $1,409.40 Subtotal A-9 $472.80I Subtotal A-9 $775.80| Subtotal A-9 $549.00| Subtotal A-9 $635.40I Subtotal A-9 $711.00I Subtotal A-9 $840.00I Subtotal A-9 £741.00
A-10. Reflective T-Shirts
Forester, 009051LONG, Long Sleeve, Safety Green
Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered I Substitute Product Offered Est Est Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered Unit Est Substitute Product Offered
n
Item# Size Unit Pri Total i i Total . Total
Unit | Est Total | unitprice| |  Totat  Junitprice| B Total T . Ut ereel . i Unit | Est | otal Unit | Est | ropal Price | Qty. Unit | Est Total
Price | Qty. Qty. Qty. Price | Qty. Price | Qty. Price | Qty.
A-10-1 |Smalf - 5X-Large $15.49 60 $929.40 $28.45 60 $1,709.40I $11.75 60 $705.00| $13.88 &0 $B32.80| $9.50 60 $570.000 $14.71 60 $882.60 $15.65 60 $939.00 $16.00 60 $960.00 $13.65 60 $815.00
Subtotal A-10 $929.40] Subtotal A-10 $1,709.40I Subtotal A-10 $705.00| Subtotal A-10 $832.80I Subtotal A-10 $570.00| Subtotal A-10 $882.60f Subtotal A-10 $939.00] Subtotal A-10 $960.00f Subtotal A-10 $819.00|
B. WORK PANTS
B-1. Men's Work Pants
e _ . Dickies, 85283, Dark BlueE - — _ - -
. Unit . Est . Est st st Unit Est Unit Est I Unit Est Unit st
Item# Size Pri oty Total Unit Price oy, Total Unit Price Oty. Total Unlt Price oy, Total Unit Price Otv. Total Pri Otv. Total price | Otv, Total Price | .oty Total Pd oty Total
28,30, 31, 32, 33,
34, 36, 38, 40, 42,
44, 46, 48, 50, 52, . -
B-1-1 |54 56 59 $19.74] 25 $493.50 $24.99] 25 $624.75 $20.10] 25 $502.508 $21.57] 25 $539.25 $21.25) 25 $531.25] No Bid 25 $0.00 $22.50| 25 $562.500 No Bid 25 40.00 $21.26| 25 $531.50
Inseam: 30, 32, 4,
36
48, 50, 52, 54, 56, 58]
B-1-2 $22.74] 10 $227.40 $30.95| 10 $309,90 $22.02| 10 $220.20 $23.72| 10 $237.30 $24.65| 10 $246.50] No Bid 10 $0.00 $23.50] 10 $235.008 No Bid 10 $0.00 $22.03] 10 $220.30
Inseam: 30, 32, 34, 31 I I | I




BIDDER AND LOCATION

2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group AZA Sales Associates LLC Printer's Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Aubtirn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdaile, AZ 85260
B. WORK PANTS (continued)
B-2. Ladles’ Work Pants
Dickies, FP774, Dark Blue
Unit | Est ~ | Est - Est o Est | Est Umt | Est Unit | Est Unit | Est Unit | Est
Itemi# - bSi;ew Price a5, Total Unit Price Oty Total Unit Price Oty Total Unit Price Oty. Total Unit Price Otw. Total price | Otv. Total Pri ] Total price |.0fv. Total Pri X Total
12, 14, 16, 18,
B-2-1 |27 272 24 $18.45| 10 $184.504 $24.99| 10 $249.90Q $18.06| 10 $180.60 $19,40| 10 $194.004 $18.95| 10 $189.50] No Bid 10 $0.00 $14.50( 10 $145.000 No Bid 10 $0.00 $19.82| 10 $198.20
Length: Petite,
Reguiar, Tall
Subtotal B-2 $184.50] Subtotal B-2 $249.90} Subtotal B-2 $180.60] Subtotal B-2 $194.00] Subtotal B-2 $189.50] Subtotal B-2 %0.00 Subtotal B-2 %$145.00f Subtotal B-2 $0.00] Subtotal B-2 $198.20
B-3. Men's Work Pants
Red Kap, PT10NY, Up to 36" Length, Navy Blue _—
unit | Est Est Est Est Est unit | Est - I oty ] To@! el ol R I unit | Est
Item# Size P n Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total P n Total . . Pri Total
rice | Qty. Qty. Qty. Qty. Qty. rice | Qty. Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered ce | Qty.
B-3-1 327 $21.23) S $106.15 $16.99] 5 $84.95 $17.94 5 $89.70 $17.01] S $85.05 $17.35) 5 $86.75] No Bid 5 $0.00 $13.90] S $69.50 $21.49| 5 £107.45 $16.18| 5 $80.90
B-3-2 347 $21.23] 15 $318.45 $16.99] 15 $254.85 $17.94] 15 $269.10| $17.01] 15 $255.15 $17.35] 15 $260.25] No Bid 15 $0.00 $13.90] 15 $208.50I $21.49| 15 $322.35 $16.18| 15 $242.70
B-3-3 35" $21.23] S $106.15 $16.99] 5 $84.95 $17.94 5 $89.70I $17.01] 5 $85.05 $17.35] 5 $86.75] No Bid 5 $0.00| $13.90) S $69.50I $2149] 5 $107.45I $17.16] 5 $85.80
B-34 36" $21.23] 10 $212.30§ $16,99| 10 $169.904 $17.94| 10D $179.40I $17.01] 10 $170.10] $17.35] 10 $173.50] No Bid 10 $0.001 $13.90| 10 $139.00| $21.49| 10 $214.90I $16.18] 10 $161.80
B-3-5 38" $21.23] 15 $318.45 $16.99] 15 $254.85 $17.94| 15 $269.10I $17.01] 15 $255.15 $17.35] 15 $260.25] No Bid 15 $0.00I $13.90] 15 $208.50 $2149| 15 $322.35I $16.18] 15 $242.70
B-3-6 407 $21.23) 5 $106.15 $1699] 5 $84.95 $17.94] 5 $89.70| $17.01] 5 $85.05 $17.35| 5 $86.75] No Bid 5 $0.00I $13.90] 5 $69.50] $2149| S $107.45I $17.16| 5 $85.80)
B-3-7 46" $24.98| 5 $124.90 $20.99] S $104.95 $21.35] 5 $106.75) $20.23) 5 $101.15 $1995| 5 $99.75] No Bid 5 $0.00I $1590| 5 $79.50] $23.49| 5 £117.45 $19.22| 5 $96.10|
Subtotal B-3 $1,292.55] Subtotal B-3 $1,039.40§ Subtotal B-3 $1,093.45 Subtotal B-3 $1,036.70] Subtotal B-3 $1,054.00| Subtotal B-3 $0.0¢Subtolal B-3 $844.00] Subtotal B-3 $1,299.40f Subtotal B-3 $995.80
B-4. Men's Work Pants
Red Kap, PTEONV, Up to 36" Length, Navy Blue
- Unlt | Est Est Est Est | Bt Est Unit ] Est Unlt | Est
Item# Size Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Total N Total - Total
prica | Oty Oty, Otv, . oty, oty Price_} Oty, Price 1 Oty,
B-4-1 32" $16.49] 5 $82.45 $16.99] 5 $84.95 $17.10] 5 $85.501 $16.23] 5 $81.15 $1649| 5 $82.45] No Bid 5 $0.00 $15.25| 5 $76.25 $21.49| 5 $107.45 $15.43) 5 $77.15
B4-2 34" $16.49] 15 $247.35 $16.99] 15 $254.85 $17.10] 15 $256.50| $16.23] 15 $243.45 $16.49) 15 $247.35] No Bid 15 $0.00] $15.25| 15 $228.75 $21.49| 15 $322.35 $15.43] 15 $231.45
B4-3 36" $16.49] 15 $247.35 $16.99] 15 $254.85 $17.10] 15 $256.50I $16.23] 15 $243.45 $16.49] 15 $247.35] No Bid 15 $0.00I $€15.25| 15 $228.75 $21.49| 15 $322.35 $1543] 15 $231.45
B44 38" $1649] 15 $247.35 $16.99) 15 $254.85 $17.10| 15 $256.50| $16.23] 15 $243.45 $16.49] 15 $247.35] No Bid 15 $0.00I $15.25| 15 $22B.75 $21.49| 15 $322.35 $1543] 15 $231.45
B4-5 q0" $1649| 5 $82.45 $16.99] 5 $84.95 $17.10] S $85.50| $16.23] S $81.15 $16.49] 5 $82.45| No Bid 5 $0.00 $15.25] 5 $76.25 $2149] 5 $107.45 $1543] 5 $77.15
B-4-6 16" $18.69] 5 $93.45 $20.99] 5 $104.95 $20.34| 5 $101.70I $19.28] 5 $96.40) $19.20| 5 $96.00| No Bid 5 $0.00 $18.35] S $91.75I 423491 S $117.45 $18.33] &5 $91.65
Subtotal B-4 $1,000.400 Subtotal B-4 $1,039.40 Subtotal B-4 $1,042.20| Subtotal B-4 $989.05] Subtotal B-4 $1,002.95] Subtotal B-4 $0.00§ Subtotal B-4 $930.50I Subtotal B-4 $1,299.40I Subtotal B-4 $940.30]
B-5. Men's Work Pants
- e = . Dickies, WP314, Dark Na — e - o= T r
. Uni st . e e st Est e st Unit st Unit st Unit Unit st
Item3# Size , Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unft Price Total Unit Price Total . Total . Total N Total . Total
Price 1 _Oty, Qty, Oty Oty, Oby Price L Otv, Brice _LOty, Price 1 Oty Prce L Oty,
28, 30, 31, 32,
33, 34, 36, 35,
B-5-1 |40 42 44, 46 £17.83] 60 $1,069.800 $23.99] &0 $1,439.40 $17.34] 60 $1,040.404 $19.30] &0 $1,158.00Q8 $18.45| 60 $1,107.00] No Bid 60 $0.00] $19.95| 60 $1,197.008 No Bid 60 $0.00f $19.69] 60 $1,181.40
Inseam: 30, 32,
34, 36
Subtotal B-5 $1.059-30| Subtotal B-5 $1,439.40 Subtotal B-5 $1,040.40) Subtotal B-5 $1,158.00| Subtotal B-5 $1,107.00] Subtotal B-5 $0.00| Subtotal B-5 $1,197.00) Subtotal B-5 $0.00f Subtotal B-5 $1,181.40|




BIDDER AND LOCATION
2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group ASA Sales Associates LLC Printer’s Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesvilie, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 627063 Scottsdale, AZ 85260
B, WORK PANTS (continued)
B-6. Men's Work Pants
3 m: ; Rec Kop, PP, Rany T T ; e
B Unit st st 1 Est st — 1 Est Unit st nit Unlt st Unlt st
Item# Size . Total uUnit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Total . Total Total Total
Brce 1 Oty, oty, I oy, Oty, I Oty Prce 1 Otv, I Brice 1Oty Price 1 Oty Price 1L Oty
B-6-1 |32"- Inseam: 30 $19.89| 7 $139.23 $22.99] 7 $160.93I $20.52| 7 $143.64 $20.29) 7 $142.03| $20.201 7 $141.40| No Bid 7 $0.00| $17.60| 7 $123.20I $24.99] 7 $174.93 $18.31 7 $128.17
B-6-2 |32"- Inseam: 32 $19.89] 3 $59.67 $22.99] 3 $68.97I $20.52( 3 $61.56) $20.29) 3 $60.87 $20.20] 3 $60.50| No Bid 3 $0.00 $17.60] 3 $52.BOI $2459] 3 $74.97 $18.31] 3 $54.93
B-6-3 | 34" - Inseam: 30 $19.895] 18 $358.02 $22.99] 18 $413.BZI $20.52| 18 $369.36 $20.29| 18 $365.22 $20.20| 18 $363.60I No Bid 18 $0.00 $17.60| 18 $316.80 $24.99| 18 $449.82 $18.31] 18 $329.58
B-64 |34"- Inseam: 32 $19.85| 7 $139.23) $22.99] 7 $160.93I $20.52( 7 $143.644 $20.29| 7 $142.03) $20.20| 7 314 1.40| No Bid 7 $0.00I $17.601 7 $123.20 $24.99| 7 $174.93I $18.31] 7 $128.17
B-6-5 |36"- Inseam: 30 $19.89] 15 $258.35 $22.99] 15 $344.85 $20.52| 15 $307.80 $20.29] 15 $304.35 $20.20| 15 5303.00' No Bid 15 $0.DOI $17.60] 15 $264.00I $24.99| 15 $374.35I $18.31] 15 $274.65
B-6-6 |36"- Inseamn: 32 $19.89| 10 $198.904 $22.99] 10 $229.50 $20.52| 10 $205.20| $20.29| 10 $£202.90§ $20.20] 10 $202.00I No Bid 10 $0.00I $17.60] 10 $176.00I $24.99] 10 $249.90I $18.31| 10 $183.10
B-6-7 |38"- Inseam: 30 $19.89] 15 $258.35 $22.99| 15 $344.85 $20.52| 15 $307.80] $20.29| 15 $304.35 $20.20) 15 $303.00I No Bid 15 $0.00 $17.60 15 $264.00I $24.99] 15 $374.8£| $18.31| 15 $274.65
B-6-8 |38"- Inseam: 32 $19.89| 10 $198.904 $22.99] 10 $229.50 $20.52| 10 $205.20] $20.29| 10 $202.908 $20.200 10 $202.00I No Bid 10 $0.00 $17.60| 10 $176.00I $2499] 10 $249.50 $18.31| 10 $183.10
B-6-9 |40"- Inseam: 30 $19.89] &5 $99.45 $22.99] 5 $114.95 $20.52| &5 $102.60I $20.29] 5 $101.45 $20.20) 5 $101.00I No Bid 5 $0.00] $17.60 S $88.00 $24.99] S $124.95 $18.31] 5 $91.55
B610| 0 ‘;”;,’e""”"' $19.89| 5 $99.45 $22.99 5 $114.95 $2052| s smz.sol $2029| 5 $101.45] s$2020] s $101.ou| NoBid | 5 so.ool $17.60| 5 $88.00] $24.99| 5 $124.95] $1831] s $91.55
B-6-11 W&" - Insearn: 36l $22.29] 5 $111.45 $28.99] 5 $144.95 $20.52| S $102.60I $24.15] 5 $120.75 $23.200 5 $116.00I No Bid 5 $0.00I $19.95| S $99.75 $27.49] 5 $137.45 $21.97| S $109.85
Subtotal B-6 $2,001.00| Subtotal B-6 $2,329,00] Subtotal B-6 $2,052.00] Subtotal B-6 $2,048.30] Subtotal B-6 sz,oas.ool Subtotal B-6 so.ool Subtotal B-6 $1,771.75| Subtotal B-6 $2,511.50] Subtotal B-6 $1,849.30
B-7. Women's Work Pants
. e - . Red Kap PT89NV, Navy Blue - - . - .
- Uni = st = Est e Est Un 5t Est Unit
Item# Size price | O, Total Unit Price atv, Total Unit Price oty Total Unit Price Oty Total Unit Price aty. Total Price | Oty Total Oty Total price | oty, Total
B-7-1 04 - 34U $29.73| 5 £198.65 42299 5 $154.95 $41.041 S $205.20 521,91 s $109.55 $2099] 5 $104.95] No Bid 5 40,00 $17.50) 5 $87.50§0 No Bid 5 $104.35
B-7-2 06 - 34U $29.73] 5 £148.65 $22.99] 5 4154.95 s4104) 5 £205.20 $2191 5 $109.55 $2099] 5 $104.95] No Bid 5 S0, $17.500 5 $87 500 No Bid 5 $104.35
B-7-3 10 - 34U/ $20.73| 5 £148.65 £2298) 5 114,85 £41.04 5 £205.20 g21.91] 5 $109.55 $2099] § $104.95] No Bid 5 &0, $17.501 5 $87.500 No Bid 5 $104.35
Subtotal B-7 $445.950 Subtotal B-7 53449.85 Subtotal B-7 $615.60 Subtotal B-7 $328.65] Subtotal B-7 $314.85] Subtotal B-7 50, Subtotal B-7 £262.50) Subtotal B-7 $313.05
C. SWEATSHIRTS AND JACKETS
C-1. Men's Hooded Sweatshirt
The Berne Apparel Corporation, SZ101NV,Long Sleeve, Navy Blue
- Unit Est Est . Est . Est —— Est Unit Est Unit Est uUnit Est Unit Est
Item3# Size Price Qty. Total Unit Price Qty. Total unit Price ] Total Unit Price Qty. Total Unit Price Qty. Total price | Qty. Total price | Qty. Total Price | Qty. Total price | Qty. Total
] Regular
C-1-1 |Medium $27.36 4 $109.44 $31.99 4 $127.96] No Bid 4 No Bid $27.36 4 $109.44 $31.50 4 $126.00| No Bid 4 $0.00I $29.50 4 $119.60 $32.30 4 $129.20 $29.82 4 $119.28
C-1-2 |Large $27.36 5 $136.80) $31.99 5 $159.95 No Bid 5 No Bid $27.36 5 $136.80 $31.50 5 $IFI.SUI No Bid 5 $U.00I $29.90 5 $149.50 $32.30 5 $161.50 $29.82 5 $149.10
C-1-3 |iX-Large $27.36 12 $328.32 $31.99 12 $383.88] No Bid 12 No Bid $27.36 12 $328.32 $31.50 12 $37B.OUI No Bid 12 $0.00I $29.90 12 $358.80 $32.30 12 $387.60 $29.82 12 $357.84
C-1-4 |2X-Large $27.36 7 $191.52 $31.9% 7 $223.93 No Bid 7 No Bid $27.36 7 $191.52 $31.50 7 $220.50I No Bid 7 $0.00I $31.90 7 $223.30 $32.30 7 $226.10 $29.82 7/ $208.74
C-1-5 |3X-Large $29.44 2 $58.88I $39.9% 2 4$79.98] No Bid 2 No Bid 430,08 2 $60.18 $33.50 2 $67.00I No Bid 2 $0.UUI $33.90 2 $67.80 $34.30 2 $68.60 $32.66 2 $65.32
Talf
C-1-6 |IX-Large $27.36 2 $54.72 $31.99 2 $63.98] No Bid 2 No Bid $27.36 2 $54.72 $33.50 2 $67.00] No Bid 2 $0.UOI $29.90 2 $59.BOI $32.30 2 $64.60I $20.30 2 $40.60
C-1-7 |2X-Large $27.36 2 $54.72 $31.9% ? $63.98] No Bid 2 No Bid $30.08 2 $60.18 $33.50 2 $67.00] No Bid 2 $0.00 $31.90 2 $63.80 $32.30 2 $64.60 $20.30 2 $40.60
Subtotal C-1 $934.40| Subtotal C-1 $1,103.66] Subtotal C-1 $0.00]  Subtotal C-1 $941.16] Subtotal C-1 $1,083.00| Subtotal C-1 $0.00] SubtotalC-1 | $1,042.60] SubtotalC-1 | $1,102.20] Subtotal C-1 $981.48
C-2. Men's Hooded Pullover
The Berne Apparel Corporation, SP300,Long Sleeve, Navy Blue
Unit | Est Est Est . Est | Est Unit | Est Unit | Est Unit | Est Unit I Est
Item# Size I P Total Unit Price Oty. Total Unit Price Oty Total Unit Price Otv, Total Unit PrlceI Otv. Total price | otv. Total Price | Okv. Total Price | i Total I pri ) Total
Regular
C-2-1 |Medium $26.74 4 $106.96 $33.99 4 $135.96] No Bid 4 No Bid $26.60 4 $106.40I $31.25 4 $125.00] No Bid 4 $0.00 $32.50 4 $130.000 No Bid 9 $0.00I $29.03 4 $116.12
C-2-2 |Large $26.74 =1 $123.700 $33.99 5 $169.95 No Bid 5 No Bid $26.60 5 $133.00| $31.25 5 $156.25] No Bid 5 $0.00 $32.50 5 $162.50Q0 No Bid 5 $0.00I $29.03 5 $145.15
C-2-3 |IX-Ltarge $26.74 12 $320.88 $33.99 12 $407.88 No Bid 12 No Bid 426.60 12 $319.20I $31.25 12 $375.00] No Bid 12 50.00 $32.50 12 $390.00§ No Bid 12 $0.0UI $29.03| 12 $348.36
C-2-4 |2X-Large $26.74 7 $187.18] $33.99 7 $237.93 No Bid 7 No Bid $26.60 7 $186.20| $31.25 7 $218.75( No Bid 7 $0.00) $35.50 7 $248.50l No Bid 7 $0.00| $29.03 7 $203.21
C-2-5 |3x-Large $28.81 2 $57.62 $38.99 2 $77.98] NoBid 2 No Bid $29.27 2 $58.54| $33.25 2 $66.50] No Bid 2 $0.00 $37.50 2 $75.00I No Bid 2 $0.00I $31.79 2 $63.58|

Tall

L



BIDDER AND LOCATION
2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Associates LLC Printer's Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental |  Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale, AZ 85260
|c. SWEATSHIRTS AND JACKETS (continued)
C-3. Men's Jacket
White Bear, WB-4040, Long Sleeve, Navy Blue
Ttemst Size ll’.'r'I‘si:_ _5; Total | Unit Price Ets: Total [ unit rice E:vt Total | Unit Price 0';5;‘ Total  Junit Price g:vt Total l‘,’r'::; Ef Total | OO I ;E“ Total ;’l‘j‘; ] vomi U“r't I :E’tl | ot
Reguilar
C-3-1 |Medium $38.88 2 $77.76| No Bid 2| NoBid No Bid 2| NoBid $40.00 2 $80.00]  $41.50 2 $83.00] No Bid 2 $0.00y $42.00] 2 saa.00] 4250 2 $85.80] No Bid 2 $0.00
C-3-2 |Large $38.88 5 $194.40|  No Bid 5| NoBid No Bid 5/  NoBid $40.00 5 $200.00]  $41.50 5 $207.50] No Bid 5 s0.00] #4200 s $21000] s42.50] 5 $214.50] No Bid 5 $0.00
C-3-3 |1x-Large s3m88| 12 $466.56|  No Bid 12 No Bid No Bid 12| NoBid $40.00| 12 $480.00|  $41.50| 12 $498.00] No Bid 12 s0.00f s42.00] 12 $504.00]  g42.90[ 12 $514.80] No Bid 12 $0.00
C-34 |2x-Large $38.88 7 $272.16|  No Bid 7|  NoBid No Bid 7|  NoBid $40.00 7 $280.00|  $41.50 7 szgo.sol No Bid 7 s0.00] s44.00 7 $308.00] ¢42.00f 7 $300.30] No Bid 7 $0.00
C-3-5 |3X-Large $38.88 2 $77.76| No Bid 2| NoBid No Bid 2| NoBid $40.00 2 $80.00|  $41.50 2 saa.oo] No Bid 2 s0.00f s46.00) 2 $92.00] 4290 2 $85.80§ No Bid 2 $0.00
Subtotal C-3 $1,088.64] Subtotal C-3 $0.00]  Subtotal C-3 $0.00] Subtotal C-3 $1,120.00) Subtotal C-3 $1,162.00] Subtotal C-3 $0.00] SubtotalC-3 | $1,198.00] Subtotal C-3 $1,201.20] Subtotal C-3 $0.00
C-4. Men's Jacket
Dickies, TJ100, Long Sleeve, Navy Blue
Ttemit Size ::O': st’: Total | unit Price ;t’; Total | Unit Price ;:: Total | Unit Price ;ts; Total  |unit Price g Total ::c:: ;:; Total ::"'; ;:; Total ;";‘; ;t’; Total ;’:é: ;tsvt Total
Regular
C-4-1 |Medium $31.95 2 $63.90 $40.08| 2 s81.98]  $32.58 2 $65.16 $33.33 2 $66.66§  $35.60 2 $71.20f No Bid 2 $o.oo| $2000 2 $58.00] No Bid 2 $o.oo| $36.40 2 $72.80)
C4-2 |Large $31.95 5 $159.75 $4099| 5 $204.95 $32.58 5 $162.90]  $33.33 5 $166.65]  $35.60 5 $178.00] No Bid 5 $0.oo] $29.00 5 $145.00] No Bid 5 $0.00] $36.40 5 $182.00
C4-3 |1x-Large $31.95| 12 $383.40 $40.99| 12 seores)  g3258) 12 $390.96 $33.33| 12 $390.96)  $35.60| 12 5427.20| No Bid 12 $0.00] $29.00] 12 $348.000 No Bid 12 s0.00] $36.40| 12 $436.80
C-44 |2x-Large $31.95 7 $223.65 $40.99| 7 $286.93I $32.58 7 $228.06 $33.33 7 $233.310  $35.60 7 $249.20| No Bid 7 s0.00f 32000 7 $224.00] No Bid 7 $0.000  $36.40 7 $254.80
C4-5 |3X-Large $34.95 2 $69.90 $45.99| 2 so108]  ¢35.82 2 $71.64 $36.67 2 $73.34]  $38.15 2 $76.30] No Bid 2 $0.000 $32.00] 2 $64.000 No Bid 2 $0.00]  $39.90 2 $79.80
Subtotal C-4 $900.60{ Subtotal C-4 $1,157.72} Subtotal C-4 $918.72] Subtotal C-4 $939.92| Subtotal C-4 $1,001.90| Subtotal C-4 $0.00] Subtotal C-4 $839.00] Subtotal C-4 $0.00] Subtotal C-4 $1,026.20
C-5. Men's Hooded Jacket
Carhartt, J131, Long Sleeve, Dark Navy
Ttem# Size ;"r;:: g Total | Unit Price ;ty‘t Total [ unit Price ;t’; Total | unitPrice ;t’yt Total  Junit Price QE:: Total ;:;‘; QE:: Total ::oﬁe QEts: Total ;";‘:: g Total ;’:; ;: Total
Reguilar
C-5-1 |Medium $61.77 2 $123.54 $70.99| 2 $141.98I $51.00 2 $102.00 $76.67 2 $15334]  $72.45 2 $144.90] No Bid 2 $o.oo| $61.00 2 $1zz.oo| No Bid 2 $0.00| $60.90 2 $121.80
€52 |Large $61.77 5 $308.85 $7099| 5 $354.95| $51.00 5 $255.00 $76.67 5 $383.35]  $72.45 5 $362.25] No Bid 5 $o.oo| $61.00] 5 $305.oo| No Bid 5 $o.oo| $60.90 5 $304.50
C-5-3 |1x-tage $61.77] 12 $741.24 $70.99| 12 $851.88| $51.00[ 12 $612.00 $76.67] 12 $920.04]  $72.45| 12 $869.40| No Bid 12 $o.oo| $61,00] 12 $73z.oo| No Bid 12 $o.00| $60.90] 12 $730.80
C5-4 |2X-Large $61.77 7 $432.39 $70.99| 7 $495.93| $51.00 7 $357.00 $76.67 7 $536.60]  $72.45 7 $507.15| No Bid 7 $o.oo| $61.00] 7 $427.00§ No Bid 7 $o.oo| $60.90 7 $426.30
C-5-5 |3x-Large $68.37 2 $136.74 $78.99| 2 $157.98I $57.00 p) $114.00 $86.67 2 $173.34]  $77.95 2 $155.90| No Bid 2 $o.00| $68.00] 2 $136.00] No Bid 2 $o.oo| $67.90 2 $135.80
Talf
C-5-6 |2x-Large $68.37 2 $136.74 $78.99| 2 sm.gsl $57.00 2 $114.00 $86.67 2 $173.34]  $77.95 2 $155.90| No Bid 2 s0.00] #6300, 2 $126.00I No Bid 2 $o.oo| $67.90 2 $135.80
Subtotal C-5 $1,879.50] Subtotal C-5 $2,161.70| Subtotal C-5 $1,554.00]  Subtotal C-5 $2,340.10] Subtotal C-5 $2,195.50| Subtotal C-5 $0.00] Subtotal C-5 $1.848.00| Subtotal C-5 $0.00| Subtotal C-5 $1,855.00|
C-6. Men's Hooded Sweatshirt
Forester, 028020, Long Sleeve, Safety Green
Itemd# Size ;’:é: :t’: Total | Unit Price st’yt Total | unit Price QE:; Total | Unit Price ;: Total  |Unit Price ;ts: Total ";:';: ;:: Total :r'l‘;: st’; Total ;’::: ;w“ Total ;’:l'; :ty‘t Total
C-6-1 |Smali - 4x-targe| $39.13] 25 $978.25]  No Bid 25| NoBid No Bid 25|  NoBid $32.28] 25 $807.00] 2075 25 $518.75F No Bid 25 s0.00] s38.00| 25 $950.oo| $38.49| 25 $962.25] No Bid 25 $0.00
Subtotal C-6 $978.25] Subtotal C-6 $0.00] Subtotal C-6 50,00] subtotal C-6 $B807.00} Subtotal C-6 $518.75| Subtotal C-6 $0.00] Subtotal C-6 $950-00| Subtotal C-6 $962.25] Subtotal C-6 $0.00|




BIDDER AND LOCATION

2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group AEA Sales Associates LLC Printer’s Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale k AZ 85260
D. COVERALLS AND OVERALLS
Bi-1. Coveralls
Red Kap, CT10NY, Logg_;ileeve, Navy
Ttem# size L::; ;:vt Total | Unit Price ;f: Total | Unit Price ;;t Total | Unit Price QEf; Total  fUnit Price st’yt Total ;’:; ;:y‘ Total ::::: ;ts: Total ::; ;t‘vt Total ;:‘; ;:: Total
Short Length (5'3" - 57
D-1-1 |Medium $284 1 s284  gsa00] 1 ssaoo]  gstool 1 ssLoof 2205 s s2.05]  $2595] 1 $25.95| No Bid 1 sooo] s31o0f 1 s31.00] No Bid 1 socof s3830] 1 $38.3(
D-1-2 |Large s2.84) 1 s32.84]  ¢5440] 1 ssaq9]  ss1o0| 1 ssLoof 2295 1 s2.05| $2595 1 $25.95| No Bid 1 soo] ¢3toof 1 531.00] No Bid 1 so00] s3] 1 438,31
D-13 |iX-Large $3284) 1 si284]  g5e49| 1 ssea9]  ss100] 1 sstoo]  g2295] 1 $2205]  $2595 1 $25.95| No Bid 1 so00] $3t00] 1 $31.00] No Bid 1 so.00f s$3830) 1 $38.31
Regular Length (5'7" - 5' - 117)
D-14 | Medium s34 1 $33.44] 33049 1 3049  s2550] 1 sa5.50]  s2295 1 s205] $2595 1 $25.95| No Bid 1 so.oof 2150 1 52.50§ o Bid 1 sooof saesl 1 §21.8
0-1-5 |Large 3344 5 $16720]  $3049] s sis245]  g2550) s $127.50]  §2095 s s114.75]  s2595 5 $129.75] No Bid 5 s000f $2150] 5 $107.50] No Bid 5 soo0] ¢2184) s $109.21
D-1-6 |1x-Large s34 12 sao128]  $30.0] 12 si6s88] 2550 12 s306.00]  s2205] 12 s275.40]  s2595) 12 $31140] noBid | 12 so00] s2150] 12 $258.00 NoBid | 12 sooo] sasa| 12 $262.0
D-17 |2X-Large $3738] s s1g6.00|  $3049| 5 s15245]  s3060 s $153.00]  s205] s s11475|  s2505) 5 $129.75] No Bid 5 so00] s2450) 5 $122.50] No Bid 5 so.0] 2620 5 $13L.0
D-18 |3X-Large s3s48| 2 $76.96] 53549 2 soo8]  s30e0] 2 s61.20]  s2295 2 sasg0]  gaas| 2 $62.50| No Bid 2 so.00] saa50) 2 540.00] No Bid 2 sooo] s2620 2 $52.41
Long Length (511" - 63%)
D-1-9 |1x-Large $aa26] 2 $88.52 $0.00] 2 s049]  gass0] 2 ssioo] 2205 2 sas90] g3l 2 $62.50| No Bid 2 so00] s270] 2 $55.00] No Bid 2 soo0] s21ee] 2 $43.6

D-1-10 | 2¥¢-Large ¢45.76] 2 $91.52 so00| 2 s3649]  s3060] 2 se120]  s2205] 2 saso0]  s3125] 2 $62.50| No Bid 2 so.00] 2750 2 $55.00§ No Bid 2 soo0] s620] 2 $52.4

Subtotal D-1 $1,144.24| Subtotal D-1 $1,002.21] Subtotal D-1 $938.40| Ssubtotal D-1 $734.40| subtotal D-1 $862.20| Subtotal D-1 $0.00] Subtotal D-1 $761.50] Subtotal D-1 $0.00| Subtotal D-1 $787.5
D-2. Men’s Blb Overalls
Carhartt, R41-DNY, Straps, Dark Navy (Available Inseams of 30, 32, and 34)

Ttem# size ",’:;: QE:; Total | Unkt Price ;ty’t Total | unit Price Q?; Total | unit Price g Total  Junit Price :t’: Totat ;";'; QE;' Total ;":‘; QE: Total l‘,’r'i:: g Total ;’r'i'; Q?; Total
D-2-1 32 ses92] 1 s85.92]  somoo| 1 so0.00] 7140 1 e IR s7933] ssra0] 1 $81.40] No Bid 1 so.oo] sssrof 1 $88.10] No Bid 1 sooo] $7735] 1 $77.3
D22 E” $8592) 5 $42060]  $9899| 5 sa0a95] ¢71.40] s s IEEEE s396.65] sar40| 5 $407.00] No Bid 5 s0.00] s¢ss.10] s $440.50] Mo Bid 5 5000y $7735) s $386.7
D-2-3 36 se592| 5 sa2960]  s9899| 5 $404950  $7140] 5 sasz00]  s7933) s $396.65| $81.40] 5 $407.00] No Bid 5 so00] sesio] s $440.500 No Bid 5 so00] $7735 s $386.7
D-2-4 38 85.92| 8 se07.36]  so8.99] B e IR ss71.20] 7933 8 s634.64] s¢sr40| 8 $651.20] No Bid 8 soo0] sss10 8 $704.80] No Bid 8 soo] $77.35 8 $618.8
D-2-5 40 52| 2 si7.8q]  goms9[ 2 sio7.98)  s7140] 2 sizs0]  s7033] 2 s158.68] s8L40] 2 $162.80] No Bid 2 so00] ses10] 2 $176.20] No Bid 2 soo0] $7735] 2 §1547
D-2+6 P 8592 2 si7.84]  go800[ 2 s17.98]  $7140] 2 e EERE sise66]  $8140] 2 $162.80 No Bid 2 so.0o] sss.10 2 s176.20] No Bid 2 so00] $7735] 2 $154.7
D-2-7 P s85.02| 2 si71.84]  s1099) 2 s21108]  $71.40] 2 si280] s793 2 sise66] $8140 2 $162.80] No Bid 2 s0.00] see10] 2 $176.20] N Bid 2 s000] $7735] 2 $154.7
D-2-8 46 ses.02[ 2 s171.84]  $105.99 2 s21108] 47140 2 s1a280]  $7033) 2 $158.66] ¢81.40| 2 $162.80| Mo Bid 2 sooof sss10] 2 $175.zo| No Bid 2 soo0f $7735) 2 $154.7

Subtotal D-2 |  $2,919.84] subtotaip-2 | $270073] subtotaip-2 |  $1,927.80] subtotal D-2 $2,141.91] Subtotal D-2 $2,197.80| subtotal D-2 $0.00] subtotalp-2 |  $2,378.70] subtotal D-2 $0.00] subtotaip-2 |  $2,088.4
D-3. Coveralls
Red Kap, CC18NV, Long Sleeve, Navy
Ttem# size ;’:;: ;:: Total | Unit Price QE: Total |Unit Price ;t‘; Total | Unit Price QEt’yt Total  [unit Price ;:vt Total ;"r;'; ;ts; Total ;’r'i'; QE: Total ",’r'i'; ;ts: Total ::: ;:vt Total
Short Length (53" - 577)
D-3-1 |Medium w4183 1 sag3|  g7049] 1 $7049]  se264| 1 s6264]  s3a80 1 sas0]  s3075] 1 $30.75] No Bid 1 e I E s44.00] No Big 1 sooof ¢s327] 1 $53.2
D-3-2 |Large sare3) 1 sa183]  s7049] 1 sroas]  ge2e4l 1 s62.64]  ¢3480 1 s3:a80]  $3075) 1 $30.75| No Bid 1 sooo] s4a.00 1 s44.00] NoBid 1 sooof ¢s327] o $53.2
D-33 |2x-Large sa183 1 sar83] g8 1 s7040]  se26a] 1 s6264]  se0[ 1 s3480) 3075 1 $30.75| No Bid 1 so.oo] se00l 1 $44.00] No Bid 1 s000] $327] 1 $53.2
Regular Length (57" -5"-11")
D-34 |Medium sa264] 1 sa264]  ga049] 1 sa049] s3132f 1 s30.32]  g3480 1 s3a80] s3075 1 $30.75| No Bid 1 sooof $8s0f 1 $28.50] No Bid 1 so00] $3036] 1 §30.2
D-3-5 |tLarge $a264] 5 521320  $40.49] 5 s20245] 3132 s s156.60]  g3am0] s si74.00] s3075] 5 $153.75| No Bid 5 sooo] s8s0] s s142.50] o Bid 5 so.00] 43038 5 $151.¢
D-3-6 | Li-Large $a264] 12 ssites] 4049 12 sassee] 3032 12 s375.84]  ¢3a80] 12 sazeo]  s3075) 12 $360.00] NoBid | 12 s0.00] 250 12 s342.00] Nomd | 12 so.oo] s$3036] 12 $364.2
D-37 |2X-Large s4678] 5 s233.90]  sa649] s s23245]  $3759] s s18795]  s3a80| s sizao0] $3075) s $153.75| No Bid 5 s0.00] $3200 s $160.00f No Bid 5 so00] s38as| s $1682.;
D-3-8 | IX-Large sa005| 2 so0.00]  se640] 2 so208] s37s0| 2 s7518] gm0 2 seocol g3475] 2 $69.50] No Bid 2 sooof s3200 2 s64.00] No Bid 2 so00] 43645 2 $72.¢




| BIDDER AND LOCATION
2017-014 I International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group ARA Sales Associates LLC Printer's Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Hendersan Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Elk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburn, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baltimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale k AZ 85260
E. RAIN GEAR
E-1. Rain Parka
N _ Grundens, PHD44HY, Long Sleeve, Yellow _

Ttemi# size ::i"';_ _QE;: Total  |unitprice| | votat  Junit Price e~ Total | Unit Price é:: Total  funit price] = Total :r?:; S Total :r'i‘;;_ _;;t Total :r'i“':; ol L ~Unlt _gg Total
E-1-1 |Medium NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBd | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid s90.75; 2 | $199.50 NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid
E-1-2 |Large NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | S No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBd | 5 No Bid 59075 5 | $458.75 NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid [ 5 No Bid
E-1-3 |1X-Large NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBld | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid 59975 12 | $1,197.00 | Nomd | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid
E-1-4 |2x-Large NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBd | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid 59975 7 | s¢698.25 NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid
E-1-5 |3X-Large NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid s1g50] 2 | $237.00 NoBld | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid

Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $0.000 Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $2,830.50] Subtotal E-1 $0.00] Subtotal E-1 $0.00
E-2. Rain Bib Pant
Grundens, PHD16HV, Yellow

Ttem# Size :;‘:_ _g; Total | Unit Price 5‘: Total [ Unit Price s:: Total | Unit Price Fj Total  |Unit Price m’: Total :'t'::_ _n:: Yotal l?:s: E:: Toml | :"I‘liitﬂ_ _:: Total e E’t_ Total
E-2-1 |X-Smai NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBd | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid $88.20] 1 $88.20 NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid
E-2-2 |Medium NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBd | 1 No Bid NoBd | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid s88.20] 1 $88.20 NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid
E-2-3 |Large NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid s88.20( 5 | s$a41.00 NoBid | 5 No Bid NoBid | 5 No Bid
E-2+4 |ix-Large NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid $88.20( 12 | 105840 | womid | 12 No Bid NoBid | 12 No Bid
E-2-5 |2¥-Large NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBd | 7 Na Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid sae20] 7 | $617.40 NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid
E-2-6 |3X-Large NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid $10350] 2 | s207.00 NoBid | 2 No Bid NoBid | 2 No Bid

Subtotal E-2 s0.00] Ssubtotal £-2 $0.00] Subtotal E-2 s0.00] subtotal E-2 $0.00] Subtotal E-2 $0.00] Subtotal E-2 $0.00] subtotalE-2 | $2,500.20] Subtotal E-2 $0.00] Subtotal E-2 $0.00
E-3. Slush Boots
Cordova, BYS17
it Price | E5 Total  [junit Prioel = Total : , .
Ttem# size ;’r'['o': g Total | unit Price ;:: Total  ||Unit Price QE:; Total Lo Qty. ° Qty. ",":: QE:: Total ::; ;t‘; Total ':":‘; QE:: Total ;’:O': QE: Total
Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered
E-3-1 NoBid | 1 No Bid $18.99) 1 s1899 moBid | 1 No Bid $30.40 1 $3840] s2150] 1 $21.50] NoBid | 1 No Bid $22.95] 1 $22.95 NoBid | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid
E-3-2 NoBid | 1 No Bid $18.99| 1 $1s:j NoBid | 1 No Bid $38.40] 1 s3040]  s2150] 1 $21.500 NoBid | 1 No Bid $22.95 1 $2295|| momia | 1 No Bid NoBid | 1 No Bid
E-3-3 NoBid | 3 No Bid s18.99 3 $56.97] moBd | 3 No Bid $38.40| 3 s11520f  s21s0| 3 $64.500 NoBid | 3 No Bid $22.95| 3 s68.85]l Nomid | 3 No Bid NoBid | 3 No Bid
E-3-4 10 NoBid | 7 No Bid $18.99 7 s13293 NoBid | 7 No Bid $38.40| 7 s2880]  $21.50] 7 4150508 NoBid | 7 No Bid $22.95) 7 $160.Gj|> NoBid | 7 No Bid NoBid | 7 No Bid
E-3-5 11 NoBid | 6 No Bid $18.99 6 st3odfl nosd | 6 No Bd 43840 6 s23040]  $2150) 6 $120.00] NoBid | 6 No Bid $22.95| & $137.70 Nomid | 6 No Bid NoBid | 6 No Bid
E-36 12 NoBid | 4 No Bid $18.99] 4 $7598 NoBid | 4 No Bid $38.40 4 15360  $21.50] 4 $86.00] NoBid | 4 No Bid $22.95 4 $91.80 NoBid | 4 No Bid NoBid | 4 No Bid
E-3-7 13 NoBid | 4 No Bid $18.99) 4 $75.961 NoBid | 4 No Bid 43840 4 $153.60| 2150 4 s86.00| NoBid | 4 No Bid $22.95| 4 $91.80( NoBid | 4 No Bid4" NoBid | 4 No Bid
Subtotal E-2 $0.00] subtotal E-3 $493.74||  subtotal E-3 $0.00] Subtotal E-3 $998.40] Ssubtotal E-3 $559.00] Subtotal E-3 $0.00|( subtotal E-3 | $596.70|| subtotal £-3 $0.00]| Subtotal E-3 $0.00
F. HATS '
F-1. Summer Hats
Unit ]| Est Est Est EstwearGuard’ e A EB:t' . Unmit | Est Unit | Est Unit | Est Unlt | Est
Item# Slze Price Otw. Total Unit Price ofy, Total Unit Price Oty. Total Unit Price Otv. Total Unit Price Oty Total prica | Oty. Total price | Otv, Total price | Oty Total I price | Oty Total
_ Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered I Substitute Product Offered I
F-1-1 | One Size Fits Alf No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid
$2.86 26 $74,36] 48.2% 26 $214.50 $1.96 26 $50.96] $6.50 26 $169.00 $5.00 | 26 $130-00| $2.99 26 $77-74|
Subtotal E-2 $74.36] Subtotal F-1 $214.50] subtotal F-1 $0.00|  subtotal F-1 $50.96] Subtotal F-1 $169.00| Subtotat F-1 $0.00| Subtotal F-1 $130.00] Subtotal F-1 $77.74] subtotal F-1 $0.00
F-2. Winter Hats
WearGuard, WEB-1697, Navy
| o ::l: :ts: Total | Unit Price QE:; Total  Junit Price ::; Total | Unit Price ;t’; Total  Junit Price ;ts; Total :;';: ;fyt Total ;’r'i‘; ét‘; Total ;’r'l'g gts: Total ;’:; ;:: Total
Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered Substitute Product Offered | Substitute Product Offered
No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid
F-2-1 |OnesireFisar | $3.19 | 26 sg204] ¢85 | 26 $214.50] $239 | 26 se2.14] 4595 | 26 $154.70 $4.75 | 26 s123.50] $299 | 26 s77.74




BIDDER AND LOCATION

2017-014 International Promotional Cintas #393 Mastermans LLP Feury Image Group A&A Sales Associates LLC Printer's Ink LLC Chesapeake Uniform Rental Henderson Advertising Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.
Ellk Grove, IL 60007 Hughesville, MD 20637 Auburh, MA 01501 Newark, NJ 07105 Quakertown, PA 18951 Springfield, MO 65802 Baitimore, MD 21224 Springfield, IL 62703 Scottsdale k AZ B5260
TOTAL BID
ESTIE‘IB::EE: A(:INNU AL TOTAL BID $26,286.82] TOTAL BID $32,681.00 TOTAL BID $16,815.95 TOTAL BID $27,343.82 TOTAL BID $27,038.45] TOTAL BID $7,667,201] TOTAL BID $31,714.200 TOTAL BID $17,976.58] TOTAL BID $24,243.88F
QUANTITIES)
G. ONE TIME SET-UP FOR EMBROIDERY
$35.00 $0.00 $20.00 $125.00 No Charge $0.00 No Charge $50.00 $40.00
H. DIRECT EMBROIDERY (Unit Cost per Item)
All Tkems Requiring Embrodiery
5 K . . .80 5.95 .25 1.00
Except for Hats $5.75 $7.50 $6.42 $3.95 $4.80 $4 $ $4 $
Hats Only $4.00 $4.50 $2.70 $3.10 $2.45 No Bid $3.95 $4.25 No Bid




