CCG PURCH RFQ 2017-005
UNIFORM SHIRTS AND JACKETS - EMERGENCY COMMUNICATIONS

BID TABULATION (See Summary on Page 27)
Bidder Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
A. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3361 - OMNI SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
AL i S Unit Price | Embroidery T::]I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T;:L::e Unit Price | Embroidery T:TIE: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'IZ': Unit Price | Embroidery T::_llz;:e
AL - small - Large 1to 23 $11.50 $3.50 $15.00 $11.98 $3.00 $14.98 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50] $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.75 $3.50 $12.25 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $12.65 $3.45 $16.10 $8.74 $12.50 $21.24
A2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $11.50 $3.50 $15.004 $11.98 $3.00 $14.98 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.75 $3.50 $12.25 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98] $12.65 $3.45 $16.10 $8.74 $12.50 $21.24
A3 -2x-Large 1to 23 $13.50 $3.50 $17.00] $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $23.98 $50.00 $73.98I $14.25 $3.45 $17.70 $10.65 $12.50 $23.15
23 to 143 $10.75 $3.50 $14.25 $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $23.98 $50.00 $73.98I $13.85 $3.45 $17.30 $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
A4 - 3x-Large 1to 23 $14.50 $3.50 $18.00] $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $23.58 $50.00 $73.58I $16.25 $3.45 $19.70 $13.32 $12.50 $25.82
23 to 143 $11.75 $3.50 $15.25 $11.98 $3.00 $14.98 $23.58 $50.00 $73.58I $15.85 $3.45 $19.30 $12.49 $12.50 $24.99
AS - 4X-Large 1023 $15.50 $3.50 $19.00§ $13.71 $3.00 $16.71 $25.18 $50.00 $7S.18I $17.45 $3.45 $20.90 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $12.75 $3.50 $16.25 $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $25.18 $50.00 $75.18| $17.05 $3.45 $20.50 $16.24 $12.50 $28.74
A5 - SX-Large 1to 23 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00] $14.28 $3.00 $17.28 $25.78 $50.00 $75.78 $18.65 $3.45 $22.10 $22.65 $12.50 $35.15
23 to 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $£3.00 $16.13 $25.78 $50.00 $75.78 $18.20 $3.45 $21.65 $21.24 $12.50 $33.74
TOTAL $191.50 $184.38 $884.96 $224.35 $310.02
B. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3359 - OMNI SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

ftem Number/Information Unit Price | Embroidery TI;':;::"? Unit Price | Embroidery T::_L:‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T::;::;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::llz::e Unit Price | Embroidery T;:Lf:'
B1 - small - Large 1to23 $11.50 $3.50 $15.00] $11.98 $3.00 $14.98| $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50} $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.75 $3.50 $12.25 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $12.65 $3.45 $16.10I $8.74 $12.50 $21.24
B2 - 1x-Large lto 23 $11.50 $3.50 $15.00] $11.98 $3.00 $14.98| $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50I $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.75 $3.50 $12.25 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $21.98 $50.00 $71.98 $12.65 $3.45 $16.10I $8.74 $12.50 $21.24
B3 -2x-Large 1to 23 $13.50 $3.50 $17.00] $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $23.98 $50.00 $73.98 $14.25 $3.45 $17.7D| $10.65 $12.50 $23.15
23 to 143 $10.75 $3.50 $14.25 $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $23.98 $50.00 $73.98 $13.85 $3.45 $17.30I $9.99 $12.50 $22.49)
B4 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $14.50 $3.50 $18.00) $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $24.58 $50.00 $74.58 $16.25 $3.45 $19.70I $13.32 $12.50 $25.82
23 t0 143 $11.75 $3.50 $15.25 $11.98 $3.00 $14.98 $24.58 $50.00 $74.58 $15.85 $3.45 $19.30I $12.49 $12.50 $24.99)
BS - 4x-Large 1to 23 $15.50 $3.50 $19.00 $13.71 $3.00 $16.71 $25.18 $50.00 $75.18 $17.45 $3.45 $20.90I $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $11.75 $3.50 $15.25 $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $25.18 $50.00 $75.18 $18.20 $3.45 $21.65 $16.24 $12.50 $28.74
TOTAL $153.25 $150.97 $735.40 $181.75 $241.13|
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Bidder Ad-Wear 8& Specialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
C. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3560 - TEAM SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
AL LG e o Unit Price | Embroidery T:::II:: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T;:'I:;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::'IZ‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'IZ‘:
C1 - Small - Large 1to23 $10.50 $3.50 $1“’1.00i $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98 $12.50 $3.45 $15.95] $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.25 $3.50 $11.75 $10.26 $3.00 $13.26 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98 $12.15 $3.45 $15.60 $8.74 $12.50 $21.24
C2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $10.50 $3.50 $14.00] $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98 $12.50 $3.45 $15.95 $9.32 $12.50 $21.82
23 to 143 $8.25 $3.50 $11.75]  $10.26 $3.00| s$13.26] 2098 $50.00] s$7098] $12.15 $3.45 $15.60]  $8.74 $12.50| $21.24
C3 -2x-Large 1to 23 412.50 $3.50 $16.00] $11.98 $3.00 $14.98 $22.68 $50.00 $72.88 $13.75 $3.45 $17.20I $10.65 $12.50 $23.15
2310143 $10.25 $3.50 $13.75 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $22.88 $50.00 $72.88 $13.35 $3.45 $16.80I $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
I—— 1to23 $13.50 $3.50 $17.00]  $12.56 $3.00| $1556] $23.45 $50.00| §73.45]  $15.75 $3.45 s19.20] s13.32 $12.50]  $25.82
23 to 143 $11.25 $3.50 $14.75]  $11.41 $3.00| $14.41] $2345 $50.00] $73.45]  $15.35 $3.45 s1880]  $12.40 $12.50]  $24.99
C5 - 4X-Large 1to23 $14.50 $3.50 $18.00 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $24.10 $50.00 $74.10) $16.95 $3.45 $20.40| $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $12.25 $3.50 $15.75|  $11.98 $3.00| 3$1498] $24.10 ss0.00] ¢74.10] 41655 $3.45 s2000]  $16.24 $12.50  $28.74
—— 1to23 $15.50 $3.50 $19.00]  $13.71 $3.00] $1671]  $24.65 $50.00] $74.65]  $18.15 $3.45 $2160]  $22.65 $12.50|  $35.15
231to 143 $13.25 $3.50 $16.75 $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $24.65 $50.00 $74.65 $17.70 $3.45 $21.15 $21.24 $12.50 $33.74
TOTAL $182.50 $177.50| $874.08 $218.25 $310.02
D. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3332 - TEAM SERIES- SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL nit Price | Embroidery T::'I:‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I::;‘:I Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:::"I Unit Price | Embroidery T:r"lz‘;‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T:;'I:::
D1 - Small - Large 1to 23 $10.50 $3.50 $14.00 $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98] $12.50 $3.45 $15.95 $8.65 $12.50 $21.15
23 to 143 $8.25 $3.50 $11.75 $10.26 $3.00 $13.26 $20.98 $50.00 $7U.98I $12.15 $3.45 $15.60 $8.11 $12.50 $20.61
D2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00 $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98 $12.50 $3.45 $15.95 $8.65 $12.50 $21.15
2310 143 $10.25 $3.50 $13.75 $10.26 $3.00 $13.26 $20.98 $50.00 $70.98 $12.15 $3.45 $15.60 $8.11 $12.50 $20.61
Tl taros 1t0 23 $13.50 $3.50 $17.00]  $11.98 $3.00] s1498] $22.88 $50.00] ¢72.88]  $13.75 $3.45 $17.20 $9.99 $12.50]  $22.49
23 to 143 $11.25 $3.50 $14.75 $10.83 $3.00 $13.83 $22.88 $50.00 $72.8B8 $13.35 $3.45 $16.80 $9.36 $12.50 $21.86
ID4 - 3x-Large 11023 $14.50 $3.50 $18.00 $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $23.45 $50.00 $73.45 $15.75 $3.45 $19.20 $12.65 $12.50 $25.15
23 to 143 $12.25 $3.50 $15.75 $11.41 $3.00 $14.41 $23.45 $50.00 $73.45 $15.35 $3.45 $18.80] $11.86 $12.50 $24.36
- xtarge 1to 23 $15.50 $3.50 $19.00]  $13.13 $3.00] 31613 $24.10 $50.00] ¢74.10]  s$16.95 $3.45 s2040]  $16.65 $12.50]  $29.15
23 to 143 $13.25 $3.50 $16.75|  $11.98 $3.00| $1498| $24.10 $50.00] $74.10]  $16.55 $3.45 2000  s15.61 $12.50|  $26.11
TOTAL $156.75 $145.23 $724.78 $175.50 $234.64
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
E. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® 57657 -SPORT-WICK® - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Ttem Number/Information | it erice Embroidery T::'I:‘:’ Unit Price | Embroidery T';':'I:::I Unit Price | Embroidery T:::'I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:": Unit Price | Embroidery T::'Iz:e
le1 - xsman 1to 23 £21.50 $3.50 $25.00 $17.38 $3.00 $20.38 $25.78 $50.00 $75.78 $17.80 $3.45 $21.25 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $16.25 $3.50 $19.75]  $15.43 $3.00] $1843] 2578 $50.00] $75.78]  $17.40 $3.45 $2085]  $16.24 $12.50|  $28.74
E2 - Small 1to 23 $21.50 $3.50 $25.00 $17.38 $3.00 420.38 $25.78 $50.00 $75.78 $17.80 $3.45 $21.25 $17.32 $12.50 $25.82
23 to 143 $16.25 $3.50 $19.75]  $15.43 $3.00] ¢$1843] ¢25.78 $50.00| $75.78]  $17.40 $3.45 $20.85)  $16.24 $12.50| $28.74
= vedium 11023 $21.50 $3.50 $2500] $17.38 $3.00 $2038] $25.78 $50.00| $75.78]  $17.80 $3.45 $21.25]  $17.32 $12.50] $29.82
23 to 143 $16.25 $3.50 $19.75|  $15.43 $3.00] $18.43] s$2578 $50.00] $7578]  $17.90 $3.45 $20.85]  $16.24 $12.50] $28.74
T 1to23 $21.50 $3.50 $25.00] $17.38 $3.00] s$2038] $25.78 $s0.00] $75.78]  $17.80 $3.45 $21.25]  $17.32 $12.50] $29.82
23 to 143 $16.25 $3.50 $19.75]  $15.43 $3.00] s$18.43] s$25.78 $50.00| ¢75.78]  417.40 $3.45 $2085]  $16.24 $12.50|  $28.74
ES - 1X-Large 1023 $21.50 $3.50 $25.00 $17.38 $3.00 $20.38 $25.78 $50.00 $75.78] $17.80 $3.45 $21.25 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $16.25 $3.50 $19.75 $15.43 $3.00 $18.43 $25.78 450.00 $75.78| $17.40 $3.45 $20.85 $16.24 $12.50 $28.74
= e 1to 23 $23.50 $3.50 327.00]  $18.68 $3.00] s$21.68]  $28.67 $50.00] $78.67] $18.95 $3.45 $22.40]  $18.65 $12.50| $31.15
23 to 143 $18.25 $3.50 $21.75 $16.58 $3.00 $19.58 $28.67 $50.00 $78.67 $18.55 $3.45 $22.004 $17.49 $12.50 $29.99
S —— 1to 23 $24.50 $3.50 s28.00] $21.28 $3.00] $24.28] $29.15 $50.00] $79.15]  $2130 $3.45 $24.75]  $21.32 $12.50|  $33.82
23to 143 $19.25 $3.50 $22.75]  $18.68 $3.00] s¢2188]  $20.15 $50.00] $79.15]  $20.90 $3.45 $24.35]  $19.99 $12.50|  $32.49
E8 - 4X-Large 1to23 $25.50 $3.50 $29.00 $22.58 $3.00 $25.58 $29.95 $50.00 $79.95 $22.45 43.45 $25.90] $22.65 $12.50 $35.15
23 to 143 $23.25 $3.50 $26.75 $20.03 $3.00 $23.03 $29.95 $50.00 $79.95 $22.40 $3.45 $25.85 $21.24 $12.50 $33.74
TOTAL $289.50 $252.46 $930.22 $271.55 $372.02
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
F. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® ST650 -SPORT-WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number;/Information Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:i: Unit Price | Embroidery T::]I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T:lz:l;::el Unit Price | Embroidery T::;::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::zrll::e
IF1 - x-small 11023 $19.50 $3.50 $23.00 $14.78 $3.00f $17.78 $22.58 $50.00) $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90]  $14.65 $12.50]  $27.15
23 10 143 $15.00 $3.50 $18.50 $13.13 $3.00f  $16.13 $22.58 $50.00|  $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50| $26.24
Ie2 - smat 1to 23 $19.50 $3.50 $23.00 $14.78 $3.00] $17.78 $22.58 $50.00) $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.50 $14.65 $12.50] $27.15
23 to 143 $15.00 $3.50 $18.50 $13.13 $3.00f $16.13 $22.58 $50.00] $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50| $26.24
le3 - Medium 1to 23 $19.50 $3.50 $23.00 $14.78 $3.00) $17.78]  $22.58 $50.00] $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.50 $14.65 $12.50| $27.15
23 to 143 $15.00 $3.50 $18.50 $13.13 $3.00] $16.13 $22.58 $50.00] $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50] $26.24
le4 - Lorge 1023 $19.50 $3.50 $23.00 $14.78 $3.00f $17.78]  $22.58 $50.00|  $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90 $14.65 $12.50] $27.15
23 to 143 $15.00 $3.50 $18.50 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13| $22.58 $50.00)  $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50/ $13.74 $12.50| $26.24
FS - 1X-Large 1to23 $19.50 $3.50 $23.00 $14.78 $3.00 $17.78I $22.58 $50.00)  $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90 $14.65 $12.50| $27.15
23 to 143 $15.00 $3.50 $18.50 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13l $22.58 $50.00] $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50|  $26.24
F6 - 2X-Large 1to23 $21.50 $3.50 $25.00 $16.08 $3.00] $19.08 $24.85 $50.00| $74.85 $14.60 $3.45 $18.05 $15.99 $12.50| $28.49
2310 143 $17.00 $3.50 $20.50 $14.28 $3.00] $17.28 $24.85 $50.00|  $74.85 $14.20 $3.45 $17.65 $14.99 $12.50)  $27.49
F7 - 3x-Large 1to23 $23.50 $3.50 $27.000  $18.68 $3.00f $21.68 $25.55 $50.00f  $75.55 $16.90 $3.45 $20.35 $18.65 $12.50]  $31.15
2310 143 $15.00 $3.50 $22.50| $16.58 $3.00] $19.58 $25.55 $50.00]  $75.55 $16.50 $3.45 $15.95 $17.49 $12.50]  $29.99]
F8 - 4X-Large ito23 $24.50 $3.50 $28.00I $19.98 $3.00f $22.98 $27.58 $50.00] $77.98]  $18.05 $3.45 $21.50)  $19.99 $12.50 $32.49]
23 to 143 $15.00 $3.50 $22.50I $17.73 $3.00f $20.73 $27.58 $50.00] $77.98 $17.65 $3.45 $21.10I $18.74 $12.50] $31.24
F9 - 5X-Large 11o 23 $25.50 $3.50 $29.00I $22.58 $3.00f $25.58 $26.50 $50.00)  $76.30 $20.35 $3.45 $23.80| $22.65 $12.50] $35.15
2310 143 $20.00 $3.50 $23.50I $20.03 $3.00)  $23.03 $26.90 $50.00)  $76.90 $19.95 $3.45 $23.40 $21.24 $12.50] $33.74
F10 - 6X-Large 1to 23 $26.50 $3.50 $30.00I $23.88 $3.00] $26.88 $28.78 $50.00| $78.78 $21.50 $3.45 $24.95 $23.99 $12.50] $36.49
23 to 143 $21.00 $3.50 $24.50| $21.18 $3.00] $24.18 $28.78 $50.00| $78.78 $21.10 $3.45 $24.55 $22.49 $12.50] $34.99
TOTAL $294.00 $254.91 $913.28 $248.70 $374.61
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Spedialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
G. LADIES' MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® LT650 -SPORT-WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Ttem Number/Information Unit Price | Embroidery Tzzll:::e Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II:::E Unit Price | Embroidery T:z;:::e Unit Price | Embroidery T:z;::::e Unit Price | Embroidery T:?;Z‘:
le1 - x-small 1to 23 $18.00 $3.50 $21.50 $14.78 $3.00] $17.78 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90 $14.65 $12.50| $27.15
23 to 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $3.00I $16.13 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50 $26.24
le - smal 1to 23 $18.00 $3.50 $21.50) $14.78 $3.00 $17.78 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90 $14.65 $12.50 $27.15
23t0 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50 $13.74 $12.50 $26.24
G3 - Mediumn 1t 23 $18.00 $3.50 $21.50) $14.78 $3.00 $17.78) $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.45 $3.45 $16.90] $14.65 $12.50 $27.15
F 23to 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58 $13.05 $3.45 $16.50| $13.74 $12.50 $26.24
64 - Large 1to 23 $18.00 $3.50 $21.50 $14.78 $3.00 $17.78) $22.58 $50.00 $72.58) $13.45 $3.45 $16.90| $14.65 $12.50 $27.15
23 1o 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58I $13.05 $3.45 $16.50| $13.74 $12.50 $26.24
G5 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $18.00 $3.50 $21.50 $14.78 $3.00 $17.78] $22.58 $50.00 $72.58I $13.45 $3.45 $16.90I $14.65 $12.50 $27.15
23 1o 143 $13.75 $3.50 $17.25 $13.13 $3.00 $16.13 $22.58 $50.00 $72.58I $13.05 $3.45 $16.50| $13.74 $12.50 $26.24
G6 - 2X-Large 1to 23 $20.00 $3.50 $23.50 $16.08 $3.00 $19.08 $24.85 $50.00 $74.85 $14.60 $3.45 $18.05 $15.99 $12.50 $28.49
23 to 143 $15.75 $3.50 $19.25 $14.28 $3.00 $17.28 $24.85 $50.00 $74.85 $14.20 $3.45 $17.65 $14.99 $12.50] $27.49
G7 - Ix-Large 1to 23 $22.00 $3.50 $25.50 $18.68 $3.00 $21.68 $25.55 $50.00 $75.55 $18.05 $3.45 $21.50) $18.65 $12.50) $31.15
23 to 143 $17.75 $3.50 $21.25 $16.58 $3.00] $19.58 $25.55 $50.00 $75.55 $17.65 $3.45 $21.10 $17.49 $12.50] $29.99
68 - 4%-Large 1to 23 $23.00 $3.50 $26.50 $19.98 $3.00l $22.98 $27.98 $50.00 $77.98 $20.35 $3.45 $23.80 $19.99 $12.50) $32.49
23to 143 $18.75 $3.50 $22.25 $17.73 $3.00| $20.73 $27.98 $50.00 $77.98 $19.95 $3.45 $23.40 $18.74 $12.50 $31.24
TOTAL $254.50 $223.06 $892.24 $225,70 $341.02
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Speclalty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M, Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
H. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® K500/K500ES - SILK TOUCH™ - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

e et Unit Price | Embroidery T:::II:::! Unit Price | Embroidery T::;:::l Unit Price | Embroidery T;:::‘:' Unit Price | Embroidery T;‘:IIE: Unit Price | Embroidery T::_;gr:e
H1 - X-Small 1to23 $12.00 $3.50 $15.50 $10.23 $3.00] $13.23 $18.10 $50.00f $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10] $9.99 $12.50| $22.49
23 o 143 $9.40 $3.50 $12.90 $9.11 $3.00| $12.11 $18.10 $50.00) $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50] $21.86
H2 - Small 1to 23 $12.00 $3.50 $15.50]  $10.23 $3.00] $13.23 $18.10 $50.00{ $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10| $9.99 $12.50] $22.49]
23 to 143 $9.40 $3.50 $12.90I $9.11 $3.00] $12.11 $18.10 $50.00] $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50] $21.86
H3 - Medium 1to 23 $12.00 $3.50 $15.50I $10.23 $3.00] $13.23 $18.10 $50.00] $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10 $9.99 $12.50] $22.49
23 to 143 $9.40 $3.50 $12.90| $9.11 $3.00f $12.11 $18.10 $50.00] $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50| $21.86
H4 - Large 1to 23 $12.00 $3.50 $15.50I $10.23 $3.00f $13.23 $18.10 $50.00] $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10] $9.99 $12.50| $22.49
23 to 143 $9.40 $3.50 $12.90I $9.11 $3.00{ $12.11 $18.10 $50.00]  $68.10] $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50| $21.86
IHs - 1x-Large 1to23 $12.00 $3.50 $1S.50I $10.23 $3.00( $13.23 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10I $9.65 $3.45 $13.10 $9.99 $12.50| $22.49
23 to 143 $9.40 $3.50 $12.90I $5.11 $3.00 $12.11 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10I $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50 $21.86
IH6 - 2x-Large 1to 23 $14.00 $3.50 $17.50 $11.53 $3.00 $14.53 $19.75 $50.00f $69.75 $10.80 $3.45 $14.25 $11.32 $12.50] $23.82
23 to 143 $11.40 $3.50 $14.90 $10.26 $3.00| $13.26 $19.75 $50.00] $69.75 $10.35 $3.45 $13.80 $10.61 $12.50] $23.11
H7 - 3x-Large 1to 23 $16.00 $3.50 $19.50 $14.13 $3.00) $17.13] $19.75 $50.00] $69.75 $13.10 $3.45 $16.55 $13.99 $12.50] $26.49
23 to 143 $13.40 $3.50 $16.90 $12.56 $3.00) $15.56 $19.75 $50.00( $69.75 $12.65 $3.45 $16.10 $13.11 $12.50] $25.61
HB - 4X-Large 1to 23 $17.00 $3.50 $20.50 $15.43 $3.00] $18.43 $20.25 $50.00] $70.25 $14.25 $3.45 $17.70] $15.32 $12.50] $27.82
23 to 143 $14.40 $3.50 $17.90 $13.71 $3.00] $16.71 $20.25 $50.00] $70.25 $13.80 $3.45 $17.25 $14.36 $12.50] $26.86
HO - 5X-Large 1to 23 $19.00 $3.50 $22.50 $18.03 $3.00] $21.03 $20.25 $50.00] $70.25 $16.55 $3.45 $20.00] $17.99 $12.50| $30.49
23 to 143 $16.40 $3.50 $19.90 $16.01 $3.00| $19.01 $20.25 $50.00] $70.25 $16.10 $3.45 $19.55 $16.86 $12.50] $29.36
H1D - 6X-Large 1to 23 $20.00 $3.50 $23.50] $19.33 $3.00| $22.33 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $18.85 $3.45 $22.30] $19.32 $1250] 431.82
23 to 143 $17.40 $3.50 $20.90I $17.16 $3.00] $20.i6 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $18.25 $3.45 $21.70I $18.11 $12.50( $30.61
Hil - 7X-Large 1to23 $27.50 $3.50 $31.00| $25.18 $3.00] $2B.18 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $22.85 $3.45 $26.30I $25.32 $12.50| $37.82
23 to 143 $23.75 $3.50 $27.25 $22.33 $3.00] $25.33 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $22.45 $3.45 $25.90I $23.74 $12.50] $36.24
H12 - BX-Large 1to 23 $28.50 $3.50 $32.00] $26.48 $3.00] $29.48 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $24.00 $3.45 $27.45 $26.65 $12.50 $39.15
23 to 143 $24.75 $3.50 $28.25 $23.48 $3.00] $26.48 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $23.60 $3.45 $27.05 $24.99 $12.50| $37.49
H13 - 9X-Large 1to 23 $30.50 $3.50 $34.00) $29.08 $3.00) $32.08 $21.75 $50.00] %$71.75 $25.15 $3.45 $28.60 $29.32 $12.50| 4$41.82
23 to 143 $26.75 $3.50 $30.25 $25.78 $3.00f $28.78 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $24.75 $3.45 $28.20 $27.49 $12.50) $39.99
JH14 - 10X-Large 1to 23 $23.00 $3.50 $26.50] $30.38 $3.00] © $33.38 $21.75 $50.001 %71.75 $26.30 $3.45 $29.75 $30.65 $12.50) $43.15
23to 143 $20.40 $3.50 $23.90I $26.93 $3.00] $29.93 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $25.90 $3.45 $29.35 $28.74 $12.50] $41.24
TOTAL $319.95 $316.17 $858.00 $306.15 $439.18
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Spedalty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
1. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® L500 - SILK TOUCH™ - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
bl L Unit Price | Embroidery T::?'Izi: Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II:': Unit Price | Embroidery T::II::::E Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II::': Unit Price | Embroidery T;:;:::
I - X-Small 1to 23 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00] $10.23 $3.00 $13.23 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10} $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
23 to 143 $9.35 $3.50 $12.85 $9.11 $3.00] $12.11 $18.10 $50.00] $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50] $21.86
12 - Small 1to 23 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00 $10.23 $3.00 $13.23 $16.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10) $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
23 to 143 $9.35 $3.50 $12.85 $9.11 $3.00 $12.11 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50 $21.86
13 - Medium 1to023 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00 $10.23 $3.00 $13.23 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10 $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
23 t0 143 $9.35 $3.50 $12.85 $9.11 $3.00 $12.11 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50 $21.86
. 1to 23 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00 $10.23 $3.00] $13.23 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10 $9.65 $3.45 $13.10 $9.99 $12.50] $22.49
23 to 143 $9.35 $3.50 $12.85 $9.11 $3.00 $12.11 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10] $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50 $21.86
15 - 1x-Large lto 23 $12.50 $3.50 $16.00] $10.23 $3.00 $13.23 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10| $9.65 $3.45 $13.10 $9.99 $12.50 $22.49
23 to 143 $9.35 $3.50 $12.85 $9.11 $3.00] $12.11 $18.10 $50.00 $68.10I $9.20 $3.45 $12.65 $9.36 $12.50] $21.86
16 - 2X-Large 1to23 $14.50 $3.50 $18.00) $11.53 $3.00 $14.53 $19.75 $50.00 $69.75 $10.80 $3.45 $14.25 $11.32 $12.50 $23.82
23 to 143 $11.35 $3.50 $14.85 $10.26 $3.00 $13.26 $19.75 $50.00 $69.75 $10.35 $3.45 $13.80) $10.61 $12.50 $23.11
17 - 3X-large 1to 23 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00] $14.13 $3.00 $17.13 $15.75 $50.00 $69.75 $13.10 $3.45 $16.55 $13.59 $12.50 $26.49)
23 to 143 $13.35 $3.50 $16.85 $12.56 $3.00 $15.56 $15.75 $50.00 $69.75 $12.65 $3.45 $16.10] $13.11 $12.50 $25.61
I8 - aX-Large 1t023 $17.50 $3.50 $21.00) $15.43 $3.00 $18.43 $20.25 $50.00 $70.25 $14.25 $3.45 $17.70| $15.32 $12.50 $27.82
23 to 143 $14.35 $3.50 $17.85 $13.71 $3.00 $16.71 $20.25 $50.00 $70.25 $13.80 $3.45 $17.25 $14.36 $12.50 $26.86
19 - Sx-Large 1to23 $15.50 $3.50 $23.00 $18.03 $3.00 $21.03 $20.25 $50.00 $70.25 $16.55 $3.45 $20.00 $17.99 $12.50 $30.49
23 to 143 $16.35 $3.50 $19.85 $16.01 $3.00 $19.01 $20.25 $50.00 $70.25 $16.10 $3.45 $19.55 $16.86 $12.50 $29.36
110 - 6X-Large 1to 23 $20.50 $3.50 $24.00 $19.33 $3.00 $22.33 $21.75 $50.00 $71.75 $18.85 $3.45 $22.30 $19.32 $12.50 $31.82
231to 143 $17.35 $3.50 $20.85 $17.16 $3.00] $20.16 $21.75 $50.00] $71.75 $18.25 $3.45 $21.70 $18.11 $12.50| $30.61
TOTAL $225.10 $203.49 $839.70 $204.95 $320.34
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Spedialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M, Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
K. MEN'S FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8097 - MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL P Unit Price | Embroidery T:;"I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T';':'I:::I Unit Price | Embroidery T::"I::;:e unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:‘: Unit Price | Embroidery 7::;:*:
K1 - X-Small 1023 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80 nfa $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23t0 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00 n/a $25.30 $50.00 $75.30] $16.24 $12.50 $28.74
b2 - smal 1t0 23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80]  $24.25 $3.00| $27.25]  $2530 $50.00  $75.30| $17.32 $12.50] $29.82
23 to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $2000]  $21.62 $3.00| s$24.62] $2530 ss0.00]  $75.30] $16.24 $12.50| $28.74
s - mMedium 1t 23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80]  $24.25 $3.00] $27.25}  $25.30 $50.00]  $75.30] $17.32 $12.50|  $29.82
23 to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00]  $21.62 $3.00] s$24.62] $25.30 $50.00]  $75.30] $16.24 $12.50|  $28.74
lks - Large 1to23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80]  $24.25 $3.00] s$27.25] $2530 $50.00]  $75.30| NG BID $17.32 $12.50]  $29.82
23 o 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00I $21.62 $3.00 $24.62 $25.30 $50.00 $75.30| $16.24 $12.50 $28.74
lks - 1xctarge 1to023 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80] $24.25 $3.00] $27.25] $2530 $s0.00]  $75.30) $17.32 $12.50] $29.82
23 to 143 $16.50 $3.50 s2000] $2162 $3.00] $24.62] 2530 $50.00]  $75.30 $16.24 $12.50] 42874
Iks - 2x-Large 1023 $24.80 $3.50 $23.30I $26.25 $3.00 $29.25 $27.65 $50.00 $77.65 $19.99 $12.50 $32.49
23 to 143 $19.00 $3.50 s2250]  $23.39 $3.00] ¢2639] 42765 $50.00| $77.65 $18.74 $12.50]  $31.24
Ik7 - 3x-Large 1to23 $26.30 $3.50 $29.80| $28.26 $3.00 $31.26 $29.98 $50.00 $79.98 $21.32 $12.50 $33.82
23 to 143 $20.50 $3.50 s2400] 2517 $3.00] s$2817] ¢$29.98 $50.00]  79.98 $19.99 $12.50|  $32.49
TOTAL $287.80| $322.55 $917.66 $0.00] $364.28
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Bidder Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas Inc. Artees Corporation C.M. Contracts, Inc. Concept Uniform Co. Feury Image Group
L. LADIES' FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8197 - MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information . . . .
Unit Price | Embroidery T::,II:": Unit Price | Embroidery T::lll:l;e Unit Price | Embroidery T::;::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::II::: Unit Price | Embroidery T:EII::
L1 - X-Small 1023 $22.30 $3.50 $25.804 $18.89 $3.00 $21.89) $25.30 $50.00 $75.30] $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.DOI $16.68 $3.00 $19.68| $25.30 $50.00 $75.30| $16.87 $12.50 $29.37
L7 - Small 1023 $22.30 $3.50 $25.BOI $18.89 $3.00 $21.89I $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23tc 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00| $16.88 $3.00 $19.BBI $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $16.87 $12.50 $29.37
13 - Medium 1to 23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80 $18.89 $3.00 $21.89| $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00 $16.88 $3.00 $19.88I $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $16.87 $12.50 $29.37
IL4 - Large 1to23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80 $18.89 $3.00 $21.89 $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 NO BID $17.32 $12.50 $29.82
23 to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00 4$16.88 $3.00 $19.88 $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $16.87 $12.50 $29.37
Iis - 1x-targe 1to23 $22.30 $3.50 $25.80 $18.89 $3.00 $21.89 425.30 $50.00 $75.30 $17.32 412.50 $29.82
231to 143 $16.50 $3.50 $20.00 $16.88 $3.00 $19.88 $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $16.87 $12.50 $29.37
L6 - 2X-Large 1023 $24.80 $3.50 $28.30 $20.89 $3.00 $23.89 $25.30 $50.00 $75.30 $19.99 $12.50 $32.49]
23 t0 143 $19.00 $3.50 $22.50 $1B.65 $3.00 $21.65] $27.64 $50.00 $77.64 $19.47 $12.50 $31.97
|17 - 3%-Large 1to23 $26.30 $3.50 $29.80 $22.91 $3.00 $25.91 $29.98 $50.00 $79.98] $21.32 $12.50 $33.82
23 to 143 $20.50 $3.50 $24.00 $20.44 $3.00 $23.44 $25.98 $50.00 $79.98| $20.77 $12.50 $33.27
TOTAL $287.80 $261.97 $915.30 $0.00 $368.31
TOTAL BASED ON ONE ITEM
WITH EMBROIDERY $2,642.65 $2,492.69 $9,485.62 $2,056,50 $3,675.57

ONE-TIME SET UP FEE FOR LOGO $0.00 270.040 $3.00 205,00 $145.00
EMBROIDERY FEE PER PIECE $3.50 £3.00 $50.00 $3.45 $12.50
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Bidder Intemational Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor OQutfits Printer's Ink LLC
A. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3361 - OMNI SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information . . 7 1 Pri
Unit Price | Embroidery T:zllt:: Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II:': Unit Price | Embroidery T;:L:': Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:-I: Unit Price | Embroidery T:ar Iter:m
A1 - Small - Large 1to23 $13.25 $0.00 $13.25 $12.45 $6.95 $19.40 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
23to 143 $12.75 $0.00 $12.75 $11.45 $6.95 $18.40 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
A2 - 1X-Large 1023 $13.25 $0.00 $13.25 $12.45 $6.95 $19.40 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
23 to 143 $12.75 $0.00 $12.75 $11.45 $6.95 $18.40 $13.04 $6.67| $15.71
A3 -2x-Large 1023 $14.35 $0.00 $14.35 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70 $16.07 $6.67 $22.74
23 to 143 $13.95 $0.00 $13.95 $12.75 $6.95 $15.70 $16.07 $6.67 $22.74 No Bid No Bid
A4 - 3X-Large 1to23 $16.35 $0.00 $16.35 $14.95 $6.95 $21.90 $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
23 to 143 $16.25 $0.00 $16.25 $13.95 $6.95 $20.90 $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
AS - 4x-Large 1to23 $17.85 $0.00 $17.85 $16.35 $6.95 $23.30 $21.40 $6.67 $28.07
23 to 143 $17.35 $0.00 $17.35 $14.95 $6.95 $21.90 $21.40 $6.67 $28.07
A5 - 5X-Large 1to23 $19.95 $0.00 $19.95 $16.35 $6.95 $23.30 $24.22 $6.67 $30.89]
23 to 143 $19.65 $0.00 $19.65 $14.95 $6.95 $21.90 $24.22 $6.67 $3D.89I
TOTAL $187.70 $245.20 $292.98| $0.00 $0.00
B. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3359 - OMNI SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information . . .
Unit Price | Embroidery T:::II::: Unit Price | Embroldery T::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'Iz': Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T:z'l:'r‘:’
B1 - Small - Large 1023 $13.25 $0.00 $13.25 $12.45 $6.95 $19.40 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
2310 143 $12.75 $0.00 $12.75 $11.45 $6.95 $18.4{)| $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
B2 - 1x-Large 1to23 $13.25 $0.00 $13.25 $12.45 $6.95 $19.4{ll $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
23 to 143 $12.75 $0.00 $12.75 $11.45 $6.95 $18.40I $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
B3 -2x-Large 1to23 $14.35 $0.00 $14.35 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70I $16.07 $6.67 $22.74 No Bid .
23 to 143 $13.95 $0.00 $13.95 $12.75 $6.95 $19.7DI $16.07 $6.67 $22.74
B4 - IX-Large 1to 23 $16.35 $0.00 $16.35 $14.95 $6.95 $21.90I $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
23to 143 $16.25 $0.00 $16.25 $13.95 $6.95 $20.90I $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
BS - 4X-Large 1to 23 $17.85 $0.00 $17.85 $16.35 $6.95 $23.3ﬂ $21.40 $6.67 $28.07
23 to 143 $17.35 $0.00 $17.35 $14.95 $6.95 $21.90I $21.40 $6.67 $28.07
TOTAL $148.10 $204.00] $231.20 $0.00| $0.00|
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Bidder International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printer's Ink LLC
C. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3560 - TEAM SERIES - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information . . . .
Unit Price | Embroidery T:zllzi'r Unit Price | Embroidery T::L':‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T::I;:;:el Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II:': Unit Price | Embroldery r::;g‘:
C1 - Small - Large 1to 23 $12.85 $0.00 $12.85 $11.95 $6.95 $18.90 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
23 to 143 $12.35 $0.00 $12.35 $10.95 $6.95 $17.90 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
C2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $12.85 $0.00 $12.85 $11.95 $6.95 $18.90 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
23 to 143 $12.35 $0.00 $12.35 $10.95 $6.95 $17.90 $13.04 $6.67 $19.71
3 -2x-Large 1to 23 $13.95 $0.00 $13.95 $13.25 $6.95 $20.20 $16.07 $6.67 $22.74
23 to 143 $13.45 $0.00 $13.45 $12.25 $6.95 $19.20 $16.07 $6.67 $22.74 No Bid No Bid
C4 - 3x-Large 1to 23 $15.95 $0.00 $15.95 $14.25 $6.95 $21.20 $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
23 1o 143 $15.85 $0.00 $15.85 $13.25 $6.95 $20.20 $18.70 $6.67 $25.37
€5 - 4x-Large 1to 23 $17.45 $0.00 $17.45 $15.35 $6.95 $22.30 $21.40 $6.67 $28.07
23 to 143 $16.95 $0.00 $16.95 $14.35 $6.95]  $21.30 $21.40 $6.67|  $28.07
6 - 5X-Large 1to23 $19.45 $0.00 $19.45 $15.35 $6.95 $22.30 $24.22 $6.67 $30.89
23 to 143 $19.25 $0.00 $19.25 $14.35 $6.95 $21.30 $24.22 $6.67 $30.89
TOTAL $182.70 $241.60 $202.98 $0.00 $0.00]
D. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3332 - TEAM SERIES- SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information q q . .
Unit Price | Embroidery T::'g': Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T:::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T:z'lz::'
D1 - Small - Large 1023 $12.85 $0.00 $12.85 $11.95 $6.95 $18.90 $12.02 $6.67 $18.69
23 to 143 $12.35 $0.00 $12.35 $10.95 $6.95]  $17.90 $12.02 $6.67]  $18B.69
D2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $12.85 $0.00 $12.85 $11.95 $6.95 $18.90 $12.02 $6.67 $18.69
23 to 143 $12.35 $0.00 $12.35 $10.95 $6.95| $17.90 $12.02 $6.67] $18.69
D3 -2x-Large 1to23 $13.95 $0.00 $13.95 $13.25 $6.95 $20.20 $14.99 $6.67 $21.66 No Bid No Bid
23 to 143 $13.45 $0.00 $13.45 $12.25 $6.95|  $19.20 $14.99 $6.67| $21.66
D4 - 3X-Large 1to23 $15.95 $0.00 $15.95 $14.25 $6.95 $21.20 $17.62 $6.67 $24.29
23 to 143 $15.85 $0.00 $15.85 $13.25 $6.95|  $20.20 $17.62 $6.67]  $24.29
D5 - 4X-Large 1to 23 $17.45 $0.00 $17.45 $15.35 $6.95 $22.30 $20.34 $6.67 $27.01
23 to 143 $16.95 $0.00 $16.95 $14.35 $6.95 $21.30 $20.34 $6.67 $27.01
TOTAL $144.00 $198.00 $220.68 $0.00] $0.00}
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Bidder Intemational Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printers Ink LLC
E. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® ST657 -SPORT-WICK® - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

ftem Number/Information | it price Embroidery T::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T:e?'lz‘;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:::I Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:::“ Unit Price | Embroidery T:::';::"
% - sl 1to 23 $18.74 $0.00 $18.74]  $16.35 $6.95| $23.30]  $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00  $23.30|
23 to 143 $18.44 $0.00 $18.44]  $15.90 $6.95| $22.85]  $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00]  $23.30]
L oo 1to 23 $18.74 $0.00 $18.74]  $16.35 $6.95| $2330]  $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 s0.00]  $23.30]
23 to 143 $18.44 $0.00 $18.44]  $15.90 $6.95| $22.85] 42165 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00]  $23.30
. 1to 23 $18.74 $0.00 $1874]  $16.35 $6.95| $2330] $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00| $23.30
23to 143 $18.44 $0.00 $18.44 $15.90 $6.95 $22.85 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $15.30 $8.00 $23.30
E4 - Large 1to23 $18.74 $0.00 $18.74 $16.35 $6.95 $23.30] $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $15.30 $8.00 $23.30
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $1844]  $15.90 $6.95| ¢$22.85|  $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 S $15.30 $8.00|  $23.30
o 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $18.74]  $16.35 $6.95| $2330] s$21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00| $23.30
23 to 143 $18.44 $0.00 $18.44]  $15.90 $6.95| $22.85] s$21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $15.30 $8.00|  $23.30
E6 - 2X-Large 1t023 $19.74 $0.00 $19.74 $17.35 $6.95 $24.30] $23.32 $6.67 $29.99 $16.45 $8.00 $24.45
23 to 143 $19.44 $0.00 $19.44]  s16.90 $6.95| ¢23.85] $23.32 $6.67)  $29.99 $16.45 $8.00] $24.45
N 1to 23 $21.74 $0.00 $21.74]  $19.35 $6.95| $2630]  $26.66 $6.67] $33.33 $18.74 $8.00|  $26.74
23 t0 143 $21.44 $0.00 $21.44 $18.90 $6.95 $25.85 $26.66 $6.67 $33.33 $18.74 $8.00 $26.74
ES - 4X-Large 1te 23 $22.74 $0.00 $22.74 $20.35 $6.95 $27.30] $28.32 $6.67 $34.99 $19.88 $8.00 $27.88
23 to 143 $22.44 $0.00 $2244]  $19.90 $6.95| $26.85|  $28.32 $6.67|  $34.99 $19.88 $8.00| $27.88
TOTAL $239.08] $292.90] $366.54 $0.00 $297.94
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Bidder International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Qutfits Printers Ink LLC
F. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® ST650 -SPORT-WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL ST Unit Price | Embroldery T::-II::: Unit Price | Embroldery T::IIzl;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T:EII:': Unit Price | Embroidery T;:II::::B Unit Price | Embroidery T;:L:':
Fi - X-Small 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95| $20.70] $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95| $20.45 $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
- Small 1to23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95| $20.70] $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95|  $20.45 $18B.32 $6.67] $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
F3 - Medium 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95| $20.70] $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95| $20.45 $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
F4 - Large 1o 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95| $20.70 $18.32 $6.67| $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95| $20.45 $18.32 $6.67{ $24.99] $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
FS - 1X-Large 1t023 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95| $20.70 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99| $13.02 $8.00( $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95| $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99| No Bid $13.02 $8.00( $21.02
F6 - 2X-Large 1to 23 $17.74 $0.00 $17.74 $14.85 $6.95| $21.80 $19.99 $6.67| $26.66 $14.16 $8.00( $22.16
23 to 143 $17.44 $0.00 $17.44 $14.65 $6.95| $21.60 $19.99 $6.67] $26.66 $14.16 $8.00| $22.16
F7 - 3%-Large 1to23 $19.74 $0.00 $19.74 $16.95 $6.95| $23.90 $23.32 $6.67|  $29.99] $16.45 $8.00( $24.45
23 to 143 $19.44 $0.00 $19.44 $16.75 $6.95| $23.70 $23.32 $6.67 $29.99| $16.45 $8.00( $24.45
F8 - 4X-Large 1o 23 $20.74 $0.00 $20.74 $17.95 $6.95| $24.90 $24.99 $6.67| $31.66 $17.59 $8.00f  $25.59]
23 to 143 $20.944 $0.00 $20.44 $17.00 $6.95| $23.95 $24.99 $6.67| $31.66 $17.59 $8.00 $25.59I
F9 - SX-Large 1o 23 $22.74 $0.00 $22.74 $19.95 $6.95| $26.90 $28.32 $6.67)  $34.99 $19.88 $8.00] $27.88
23 to 143 $22.44 $0.00 $22.44 $19.00 $6.95| $25.95 $28.32 $6.67] $34.99 $19.88 $8.00] $27.88]
F10 - 6X-Large 1023 $23.74 $0.00 $23.74 $19.95 $6.95| $26.90 $29.99 $6.67| $36.66 $21.02 $8.00] $29.02
23 to 143 $23.44 $0.00 $23.44 $19.00 $6.95| $25.95 $29.99 $6.67| $36.66 $21.02 $8.00] $29.02
TOTAL $241.08 $286.70 $369.90 $0.00 $300.24
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Bidder International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printers Ink LLC
G. LADIES' MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® LT650 -SPORT-WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL Lkl st Unit Price | Embroidery T;e'f'lz‘: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:': Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:::
G1 - X-Small 1to23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $6.00] $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95 $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00| $21.02
l2 - small 10 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70] $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00 $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95 $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00 $21.02
G3 - Medium 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00 $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95 $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
le4 - Large 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70| $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00f $21.02
230 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95 $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 No Bid $13.02 $8.00] $21.02
les - 1x-targe 1to 23 $16.74 $0.00 $16.74 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70| $168.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.000 $21.02
23 to 143 $16.44 $0.00 $16.44 $13.50 $6.95 $20.45 $18.32 $6.67 $24.99 $13.02 $8.00 $21.02
l6 - 2x-Large 1to 23 $17.74 $0.00 $17.74 $14.85 $6.95 $21.80] $19.99 $6.67 $26.66 $14.16 $8.00] $22.16
23 to 143 $17.44 $0.00 $17.44 $14.65 $6.95 $21.60| $19.99 $6.67 $26.66) $14.16 $8.00] $22.16
|67 - 3x-Large 1to 23 $19.74 $0.00 $19.74 $16.95 $6.95 $23.90| $23.32 $6.67| $29.99| $16.45 $8.00( $24.45
23 to 143 $19.44 $0.00 $19.44 $16.75 $6.95 $23.70| $23.32 $6.67 $29‘99| $16.45 $8.00( $24.45
I8 - 4x-Large 1to 23 $20.74 $0.00 $20.74 $17.95 $6.95 $24.90| $24.99 $6.67 $31.66 $17.59 $8.00| $25.59
23t0 143 $20.44 $0.00 $20.44 $17.00 $6.95 $23.95 $24.99 $6.67 $31.66 $17.59 $8.00( $25.59
TOTAL $215.08 $263.30 $326.56 $0.00 $270.52
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Bidder

Intemational Promotional Ideas

Chesapeake Uniform Rental

KNC Marketing

OQutdoor Outfits

Printers Ink L1C

Item Number/Information

H. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® K500/KS500ES - SILK TOUCH™ - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Unit Price | Embroidery T::;:I: Unit Price § Embroidery T:et:II:i':e Unit Price | Embroidery T::]I::‘;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::_;::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::;:::

Hi - X-Small 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00f $17.01

23t0 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01

H2 - Small 1to23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00| $17.01

23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.55 $16.70] $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00] $17.01

H3 - Medium 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00f $17.01

23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01

M4 : Large 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90| $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00f $17.01

23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70| $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00f $17.01

HS - 1X-Large 1to23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00f $17.01

23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.000 $17.01

HG - 2X-Large 1to 23 $14.24 $0.00 $14.24 $10.95 $6.95 $17.90I $14.15 $6.67 $20.82 $10.16 $8.00| $18.16

23 to 143 $13.94 £0.00 $13.94 $10.75 $6.95 $17.70I $14.15 $6.67 $20.82 $10.16 $8.00] $18.16

H7 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $16.24 $0.00 $16.24 $12.95 $6.95 $19.90I $17.49 $6.67 $24.16 $12.44 $8.00| $20.44

23 to 143 $15.94 $0.00 $15.54 $12.75 $6.95 $19.70I $17.49 $6.67 $24.16 No Bid $12.44 $8.00{ $20.44

H8 - 4X-Large 1to 23 $17.24 $0.00 $17.24 $13.95 $6.95 $20.90I $19.15 $6.67 $25.82 $13.59 $8.00( $21.59

23 to 143 $16.94 $0.00 $16.94 $13.75 $6.95 $20.70I $19.15 $6.67 $25.82 $13.59 $8.00] 4$21.59

H9 - 5X-Large 1t023 $19.24 $0.00 $19.24 $15.95 $6.95 $22.90I $22.49 $6.67 $29.16 $15.88 $8.00( $23.88

23 to 143 $18.94 $0.00 $18.94 $15.75 $6.95 $22.70I $22.49 $6.67 $29.16 $15.88 $8.00( $23.88

H10 - 6X-Large 1to 23 $20.24 $0.00 $20.24 $16.95 $6.95 $23.90I $24.15 $6.67 $30.82 $17.02 $8.00( $25.02

23 to 143 $19.94 $0.00 $19.94 $16.75 $6.95 $23.70I $24.15 $6.67 $30.82 $17.02 $8.00( $25.02

lH11 - 7x-Large 1to 23 $24.24 $0.00 $24.24 $15.00 $6.95 $25.95 $31.66 $6.67 $38.33 $22.17 $8.00( $30.17
23 to 143 $23.94 $0.00 $23.94 $19.00 $6.95 $25.95 $31.66 $6.67 $38.33 $22.17 $8.00( $30.17

lH12 - Bx-Large 1to 23 $25.24 $0.00 $25.24 $20.00 $6.95 $26.95 $33.32 $6.67 $39.99 $23.31 $8.00( $31.31
23 to 143 $24.54 $0.00 $24.94 $20.00 $6.95 $26.95 $33.32 $6.67 $39.99 $23.31 $8.00( $31.31

IH13 - 9x-Large ito23 $27.24 $0.00 $27.24 $22.00 $6.95 $28.95 $36.66 $6.67 $43.33 $25.60 $8.00( $33.60
23 to 143 $26.94 $0.00 $26.94 $22.00 $6.95 $28.95 $36.66 $6.67 $43.33 $25.60 $8.00( 4$33.60

IH14 - 10x-Large 1to 23 $28.24 $0.00 $28.24 $23.00 $6.95 $29.95 $368.32 $6.67 $44.99 $26.74 $8.00] $34.74
23 to 143 $27.94 $0.00 $27.94 $23.00 $6.95 $29.95 $38.32 $6.67 $44.99 $26.74 $8.00| $34.74

TOTAL $287.08 $316.80 $453.24 $0.00 $357.44
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Bidder International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printers Ink LLC
I. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® L500 - SILK TOUCH™ - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL AR S Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I::: unit Price | Embroidery T::_'I:::’ Unit Price | Embroidery T::"I::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::'I:;‘:" Unit Price | Embroidery T:::'I:::'
I - X-Small 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90] $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70I $12.49 $6.67] $19.16 $9.01 $6.00| 3$17.01
12 - Small 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90| $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70I $12.49 $6.67] $19.16 $9.01 $8.00] $17.01
13 - Medium 1o 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70I $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
14 - Large 1t0 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95 $16.90 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
I5 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $13.24 $0.00 $13.24 $9.95 $6.95| $16.90 $12.49 $6.67| $19.16 $9.01 $8.00] $17.01
23 to 143 $12.94 $0.00 $12.94 $9.75 $6.95 $16.70 $12.49 $6.67 $19.16 No Bid $9.01 $8.00 $17.01
16 - 2X-Large 1to 23 $14.24 $0.00 $14.24 $10.95 $6.95 $17.90 $14.15 $6.67 $20.82 $10.16 $8.00 $18.16
23 to 143 $13.94 $0.00 $13.94 $10.75 $6.95] $17.70 $14.15 $6.67| 4$20.82 $10.16 $8.00] $18.16
17 - 3X-Large 1to0 23 $16.24 $0.00 $16.24 $12.95 $6.95 $19.90 $17.49 $6.67 $24.16 $12.44 $8.00 $20.44
23 to 143 $15.94 $0.00 $15.94 $12.75 $6.95 $19.70 $17.49 $6.67 $24.16 $12.44 $8.00 $20.44
18 - 4x-Large 1t0 23 $17.24 $0.00 $17.24 $13.95 $6.95]  $20.90 $19.15 $6.67| $25.82 $13.59 $8.00] $21.59
23 to 143 $16.94 $0.00 $16.94 $13.75 $6.95] $20.70 $19.15 $6.67| $25.82 $13.59 $8.00] $21.59
19 - 5X-Large 1to 23 $19.24 $0.00 $19.24 $15.95 $6.95] $22.90 $22.49 $6.67| $29.16 $15.88 $6.00( $23.88
23 1o 143 $18.24 $0.00 $18.24 $15.75 $6.95 $22.70 $22.49 $6.67 $29.16 $15.88 $8.00 $23.88
110 - 6x-Large 1to0 23 $20.24 $0.00 $20.24 $16.95 $6.95] $23.90 $24.15 $6.67] $30.82 $17.02 $8.00| $25.02
23 to 143 $19.94 $0.00 $19.94 $16.75 $6.95| $23.70 $24.15 $6.67| $30.82 $17.02 $8.00| $25.02
TOTAL $198.38] $243.60 $299.88 $0.00 $252.20
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Bidder International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printers Ink LLC
K. MEN'S FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8097 - MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

AL R S Unit Price | Embroidery T:zllz;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::L:::I Unit Price | Embroidery T:zlnp:;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::?II::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::;z:

lc1 - x-smat 1023 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95| $24.80 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 N/A

23 to 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95| $24.45 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 N/A
lk2 - smar 1023 $18.98 $0.00 $1B.98 $17.85 $6.95( $24.80 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $B.00| $29.06
2310 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95( $24.45 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $8.00] $29.06
K3 - Medium 1to23 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $8.00] $29.06
23t0 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $8.00] $25.06
K4 - Large 1to 23 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 No Bid $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 to 143 $10.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $8.00] $29.06
K5 - 1X-Large 1to23 $1B.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 t0 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67| $28.32 $21.06 $8.00]  $29.06
K6 - 2X-Large 11023 $19.98 $0.00 $19.98 $18.85 $6.95 $25.80 $24.15 $6.67| $30.82 $22.83 $8.00]  $30.83)
23 to 143 $19.58 $0.00 $15.58 $18.50 $6.95| $25.45 $24.15 $6.67|  $30.82 $22.83 $8.00] $30.83
K7 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $21.98 $0.00 $21.98 $19.95 $6.95 $26.90 $26.66 $6.67| $33.33 $24.60 $8.00] $32.60
2310 143 $21.68 $0.00 $21.68 $19.50 $6.95 $26.45 $26.66 $6.67F $33.33 $24.60 $8.00] $32.60
TOTAL $233.06 $301.60 $354.86 $0.00 $359.34
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International Promotional Ideas Chesapeake Uniform Rental KNC Marketing Outdoor Outfits Printers Ink LLC
L. LADIES' FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8197 - MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information q . . .

Unit Price | Embroidery T::_]I:::e Unit Price | Embroidery T::II::"? Unit Price | Embroidery T:EII::: Unit Price | Embroldery T::]I:i: Unit Price | Embroidery T:ZII:::
L1 - X-Small 11023 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80] $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00| $29.06
23to 143 $16.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
L7 - Small 1to 23 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80] $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 to 143 $168.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
L3 - Medium 1to 23 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80] $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 to 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
- Large 1to 23 $16.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80) $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 No Bid $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 to 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
L5 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $18.98 $0.00 $18.98 $17.85 $6.95 $24.80§ $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
23 to 143 $18.48 $0.00 $18.48 $17.50 $6.95 $24.45 $21.65 $6.67 $28.32 $21.06 $8.00 $29.06
LLG - 2X-Large 1to 23 $19.98 $0.00 $15.98 $18.85 $6.95 $25.80) $24.15 $6.67 $30.82 $22.83 $8.00 $30.83
23 to 143 $19.58 $0.00 $19.58 $18.50 $6.95 $25.45 $24.15 $6.67 $30.82 $22.83 $8.00 $30.83
I7 - 3x-Large 11023 $21.98 $0.00 $21.98 $19.95 $6.95 $26.90] $26.66 $6.67 $33.33 $24.60 $6.00 $32.60
23 to 143 $21.68 $0.00 $21.68 $19.50 $6.95 $26.45 $26.66 $6.67 $33.33 $24.60 $8.00 $32.60
TOTAL $233.06 $301.60| $354.86 $0.00] $359.34

TOTAL BASED ON ONE ITEM

WITH EMBROIDERY $2,309.32 $2,899.30 %$3,563.68 %$0.00 $2,197.02

ONE-TIME SET UP FEE FOR LOGO £50.00 £75.00 £05.00 No Bid $65.00
EMBROIDERY FEE PER PIECE £0.00 $6.95 $6.67 No Bid $8.00
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Bidder

Sundog Productions

Uniforms Manufacturing

Item Number/Information

A. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3361 - OMNI SERIES -

SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

e . Total Price S . Total Price
Unit Price | Embroidery per Item Unit Price | Embroidery per Item
A1 - Small - Large 1to 23 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
23 to 143 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
A2 - 1X-Large 1to 23 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
23 to 143 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
A9 2large —— —— 2.9 — Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
1 . ) A
i 1] L L) PSS Stipulated a Minimum Order for
A4 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $13.37 $3.19 $16.56] Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 to 143 $13.37 $3.19 $16.56
AS - 4X-Large 1t023 $15.31 $3.19 $18.50
23 to 143 $15.31 $3.19 $18.50
AS - 5X-Large 1to 23 $17.32 $3.19 $20.51
23 to 143 $17.32 $3.19 $20.51
TOTAL $192.06 $0.00]

Item Number/Information

B. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3359 - OMNI SERIES -

SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Unit Price | Embroidery T;:I;;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::_II:::F
B - Small - Large 1to 23 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
23 to 143 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
B2 - 1X-Large 1to23 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
23 to 143 $9.56 $3.19 $12.75
Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
B3 -2x-large Hiolds JaLd 2 $14.96 Stipulated a Minimum Order for
23 to 143 $11.77 $3.19 $14.96] Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
B4 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $13.37 $3.19 $16.56
23 to 143 $13.37 $3.19 $16.56
1 3 15.31 3.1 18.50
B5 - 4X-Large fo2 3 EE1 ) $
23 to 143 $15.31 $3.19 $18.50
TOTAL $151.04 $0.00
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Bidder

Sundog Productions

Uniforms Manufacturing

C. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - DUNBROOKE® 3560 - TEAM SERIES -
SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Item Number/Information
oo . Total Price R . Total Price
Unit Price | Embroidery per Ttem Unit Price | Embroidery per Item
lc1 - smai - Largeb— L1023 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00
23 to 143 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00
le2 - xLarge 1t023 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00
23 to 143 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00
IC3 -2x-Large 1023 #1150 $850H planic Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
23 to 143 $10.98 $3.19 $14.17| Shpulated a Minimum Order for
Embroldery is Twelve (12)
lc - 3%-Large 1023 $12.60 $3.19 $15.79 e
23 to 143 $12.60 $3.19 $15.79
les - ax-Large 1to23 $14.53 $3.19 $17.72
23 to 143 $14.53 $3.19 $17.72
g . 71
lcs - sx-Large 1023 $16.52 $3.19 $19
23to 143 $16.52 $3.19 $19.71
TOTAL $182.78 $0.00
SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information Total Pri E——
P r q ce 0 A oe
Unit Price | Embroidery per Item Unit Price | Embroidery per Item
Io1 - Small - Large 1to23 48.81 $3.19 $12.00]
23to 143 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00|
Io2 - 1x-Large 1to 23 $8.81 $3.19 $12.00I
Hto143 e iR b Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
lo3 -2x-Large lto 23 $10.98 $3.19 $14.17 sméula;teqda Ml_nlr_:_\urnI Ordlezr for
2310 143 $10.98 $3.19 $14.17 mbroidery is Twelve (12)
Pieces+F589
D4 - 3X-Large 1to 23 $12.60 $3.19 $15.79]
23 to 143 $12.60 $3.19 $15.79I
1to 23 14.53 3.19 17.72
ID5 - 4X-Large $ $ ¥
23 to 143 $14.53 $3.19 $17.72
TOTAL $143.36 $0.00|
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Bidder Sundog Productions Uniforms Manufacturing
E. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® S$T657 ~-SPORT-
WICK® - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Item Number/Information - -
Unit Price | Embroidery T';.:L:': Unit Price | Embroidery T::e:ll:;‘::‘e
e 1to23 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
23 to 143 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
Sla 1to23 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
23 to 143 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
Sl e 1to23 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
23to 143 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
E4 - Large 1to23 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78)
- Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
e gty L0 $1B'78I Stipulated a Minimum Order for
ES - 1x-Large 1to23 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78) Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 to 143 $15.59 $3.19 $18.78
E6 - 2X-Large 1to23 $16.79 $3.19 $15.98
23 to 143 $16.79 $3.19 $19.98
£7 - 3-Large 1to 23 $19.03 $3.19 $22.22
23to 143 $19.03 $3.19 $22.22
£8 - 4X-Large 1to 23 $20.22 $3.19 $23.41
23 to 143 $20.22 $3.19 $23.41
TOTAL $243.90 $0.00
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Bidder Sundog Productions I Uniforms Manufacturing
F. MEN'S MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® ST650 -SPORT-
Item Number/Information WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Unit Price | Embroidery T::?II::: Unit Price | Embroidery T::II::::B
B - oSl 1to23 $13.19 $3.19]  $16.38
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.28
F2 - Small 1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
£3 - Medium 1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
F4 - Large 1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
23 o 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
F5 - 1X-Large .
Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
2310 143 pan $3.19 $16.38 Stipulated a Minimum Order for
F6 - 2X-Large 11023 $14.39 $3.19 $17.58] Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 o 143 $14.39 $3.19 $17.58
F7 - 3X-Large 1to23 $16.65 $3.19 $19.84
23 to 143 $16.65 $3.19 $19.84
- 1to 23 $17.84 $3.19]  $21.03
23 to 143 $17.84 $3.19 $21.03
Irs - sx-Large 1to23 $20.22 $3.19 $23.41
23to 143 $20.22 $3.19 $23.41
1 21.41 3.19 24.60
|F10 - 6X-Large — $ $ $ 1
23 to 143 $21.41 $3.19 $24.60|
TOTAL $245.68 $0.00
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Bidder

Sundog Productions

Uniforms Manufacturing

Item Number/Information

G. LADIES' MICROPIQUE POLO SHIRTS - SPORT-TEK® LT650 -
SPORT-WICK® - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

Unit Price | Embroidery T::;::;:e Unit Price | Embroidery T::';:;:e

P xismal 1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
G2 - Small 1023 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38|
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38
&3 - Medium 1to23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38]
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38|
G4 - Large 1to 23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38|

Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor

4 3 . 5

2 to 143 2310 $3.19 $16.38 Stipulated a Minimum Order for

G5 - 1X-Large 1to23 $13.19 $3.19 $16.38] Embroidery Is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 to 143 $13.19 $3.19 $16.£|
G6 - 2X-Large 1023 $14.39 $3.1% $17.58
23 to 143 $14.39 $3.19 $17.58)
67 - 3x-Large 1to23 $16.65 $3.19 $19.84
23 to 143 $16.65 $3.19 $19.84
E . RIK] |
68 - 4x-Large 1to 23 $17.84 $3.19 $21.03
23 to 143 $17.84 $3.19 $21.03

TOTAL $215.18 $0.00
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Bidder Sundog Productions Uniforms Manufacturing
H. MEN'S POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® K500/K500ES - SILK
Item Number/Information TOUCH™ - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Unit Price | Embroidery T::IIS:: Unit Price | Embroidery T;:|I:::
[ — 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19]  s$12.19]
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.00]  $12.4
lh2 - smail 1to23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18|
H3 - Medium 1to 23 $8.95 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18|
. Laroe 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18]
HS - 1x-Large 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
L lorge 1to 23 $10.19 $3.19]  $13.38
23 to 143 $10.19 $3.19 $13.3a|
iz - 3xLarge —— = B et Accept Bid - Contractor
23 to 143 12.48 5 d
i $12 8 $15.67 Stipulated a Minimum Order for
H8 - 4X-Large 11to 23 $13.67 $3.19 $16.86] Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 to 143 $13.67 $3.19 $16.86
e 1to 23 $16.05 $3.19]  $19.24
2310 143 $16.05 $3.19 $19.24
H10 - 6X-Large 1to 23 $17.24 $3.19 $20.43
23 to 143 $17.24 $3.19 $20.43
H11 - 7X-Large 1to 23 $22.60 $3.19 $25.79)
23 to 143 $22.60 $3.19 $25.79
H12 - 8X-Large 1to 23 $23.79 $3.19 $26.98
23 to 143 $23.79 $3.19 $26.98
H13 - xLarge 1to 23 $26.17 $3.19]  $29.36
231to 143 $26.17 $3.19 $29.36
1o 23 27.36 3.1 30.55
H14 - 10X-Large ° $ $3.19 $
23 o 143 $27.36 $3.19 $30.55
TOTAL $304.70 $0.00
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Bidder Sundog Productions Uniforms Manufacturing
I. LADIES' POLO SHIRTS - PORT AUTHORITY® L500 - SILK TOUCH™
Item Number/Information - SHORT SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
oo . Total Price oo . Total Price
Unit Price | Embroidery per Ttem Unit Price | Embroidery pEntEm
L sl 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
B - sl 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
|
13 - Medium 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 to 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
1 - Large 1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
23 t0 143 $8.99 $3.19 $12.1a|
1to 23 $8.99 $3.19 $12.18
I5 - 1X-Large N
Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
23t0 143 .99 3.19 12.18]
il $ $ Stipulated a Minimum Qrder for
16 - 2X-Large 1t023 $10.19 $3.19 $13.38]  Embroider is Twelve (12) Pieces
23 to 143 $10.19 $3.19 $13.38)
(7 - Ix-Large 1to 23 $12.48 $3.19 $15.67
23 to 143 $12.48 $3.19 $15.67
I8 - 4X-Large 1to 23 $13.67 $3.19 $16.86
23 to 143 $13.67 $3.19 $16.86
19 - 5X-Large 1to 23 $16.05 $3.19 $19.24
23 to 143 $16.05 $3.19 $19.24
1to23 17.24 3.19 20.43
110 - 6X-Large 0 $ $ $
231to 143 $17.24 $3.19 $20.43
TOTAL $195.52 $0.00
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Bidder Sundog Productions Uniforms Manufacturing
K. MEN'S FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8097 -
Item Number/Information MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
o . Total Price . . Total Price
Unit Price | Embroidery per Ttem Unit Price | Embroidery per Item

l«1 - x-smait 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
lkz - smail 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
I3 - Medium 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25

Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor

23 16.06 . .

|K4 - Large 1o il $5:19 1L Stipulated a Minimum Order for

23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25]  Embroider is Twelve (12) Pieces
K5 - 1X-Large 1to23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
K6 - 2X-Large 1to23 $17.90 $3.19 $21.09
23 to 143 $17.90 $3.19 $21.09
K7 - 3x-Large 1to 23 $19.76 $3.19 $22.95
23 to 143 $19.76 $3.19 $22.95

TOTAL $242.08 $0.00
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Bidder Sundog Productions Uniforms Manufacturing
L. LADIES' FULL ZIP FLEECE JACKETS - RIVER'S END - 8197 -
Item Number/Information MICROFLEECE - LONG SLEEVE - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
A Total Price I . Total Price
Unit Price | Embroidery per Item Unit Price | Embroidery per Item
11 - x-Sl 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
3 < Smmall 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 to 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
S - Medium 1to 23 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
23 t0 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
1to 23 16.06 3.19 19.25
L4 - Large $ $ $ Stipulated a Minimum Order for
2310 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25] Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces
(5 - 1X-Large 1t023 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
2310 143 $16.06 $3.19 $19.25
L6 - 2x-Large 1t023 $17.90 $3.19 $21.09
23t 143 $17.90 $3.19 $21.09
I - 3x-Large ito23 $19.76 $3.19 $22.95
23to 143 $19.76 $3.19 $22.95
TOTAL $242.08 $0.00
TOTAL BASED ON ONE ITEM
WITH EMBROIDERY LS8 e
Cannot Accept Bid - Contractor
-TIME i
ONE-TIME SETUR FEEFOR 1OGD i Stipulated a Minimum Order for
Embroidery is Twelve (12) Pieces.
EMBROIDERY FEE PER PIECE £3.19
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LOWEST TO HIGHEST

EMBORIDERY
FEE PER ITEM

$3.19

$0.00

$3.50

$6.95

$6.67

$12.50

$3.00

$3.45

$8.00

~ SUMMARY BASED ON ONE ITEM EACH WITH_
EMBROIDERY
BIDDER TOTAL
Sundog Productions $1,714.45
International Promotional Ideas $2,309.32
AdWear & Speciality of Texas Inc. $2,642.65
Chesapeake Uniform Rental $2,899.30
KNC Marketing $3,563.68
Feury Image Group $3,675.57
C.M. Concepts $9,485.62
Concept Uniform? $2,056.90
Printers Ink LLC? $2,197.02
Artees Corporation? $2,492.69
Outdoor Outfits No Bid

$3.00

Uniform Manufacturing

Cannot Accept Bid

No Bid

1 Did not bid on all items. Not lower on items for which pricing was submitted.

ONE-TIME SET
UP FEE FOR
LOGO

$35.00

$50.00

$0.00

$75.00

$95.00

$145.00

$50.00

$65.00

$65.00

$70.00

No Bid

Cannot Accept Bid]

Cannot Accept Bid




