RFQ 2019-061-UNIFORMS

BUILDINGS & GROUNDS
BID COMPARISON
PRODUCTS Bidder
PANTS
International
A8A Sales | Aramark | promotional
ITEM | MFR . AND SIZE Ideas
# ITEM # DESCRIPTION INSEAM (WAIST) COLOR
UNIT PRICE
Men’s Work
Red Kap Pants -
1 PT60 Traditional 30-36 28-42 Navy Blue $17.95 $11.99 $17.59
Easy Fit
Men’s Work
Red Kap Pants
2 PT60 Traditional 38-48 44-48 Navy Blue $20.50 $13.99 $21.43
Easy Fit
Red Kap Jean Cut Work
3 TS0 Pants 30-36 28-42 Navy Blue $18.90 $12.99 $21.97
Red Kap Jean Cut Work
4 PT50 - 38-48 44-48 Navy Blue $21.50 $14.99 $25.82
Wrangler®
Riggs i v
5 Wordciair Ranger Pants 30-36 30-42 Navy Blue $30.75 $19.99 NO BID
Ripstop
Wrangler®
Riggs 3 ’
6 ar ki Ranger Pants 38-48 44-60 Navy Blue $32.75 $21.99 NO BID
Ripstop
Dickies Flannel Lined
7 WEB-9799 |Works Pants 30-36 38-48 Navy Blue $33.95 $34.99 $29.98
Industrial Work <
REDKAP : White or
8 Sp14 Shirts (long Small-X Large P Navy Blue $15.75 $17.99 $19.99
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap i White and
9 Sp14 Shirts (long 2-X Large " Navy Blue $17.75 $19.99 $23.20
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap & White and
10 P14 Shirts (long 3-X Large Wousibyar Navy Blue $17.75 $19.99 $23.20
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap - White and
11 Sp14 Shirts (long 4 X Large ———— Navy Blue $17.75 $19.99 $23.20
sleeve)
Industrial Work )
Red Kap - White and
12 P14 slr;g\t/s(e§long X Large Tall Heather Navy Blue $15.75 $19.99 $19.99




Industrial Work

Red Kap ; White and
13 Sp14 Shirts (long 2 X Large Tall Hesathr Navy Blue $17.75 $21.99 $23.20
sleeve)
Industrial Work ’
Red Kap . White and
14 Sp24 Shirts (long Small-X Large Lisathar Navy Blue $14.40 $16.99 $16.49
sleeve)
Industrial Work )
Red Kap ; White and
15 Sp24 Shirts (long 2-X Large Pty Navy Blue $16.00 $18.99 $18.79
sleeve)
Industrial Work )
Red Kap § White and
16 Sp24 Shirts (long 3-X Large Heathar Navy Blue $16.00 $18.99 $18.79
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap ; White and
17 Sp24 Shirts (short 4 X Large Mt Navy Blue $16.00 $18.99 $18.79
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap i White and
18 Sp24 Shirts (Short X Large Tall T Navy Blue $14.40 $18.99 $16.79
sleeve)
Industrial Work
Red Kap X White and
19 Sp24 Shirts (short 2 X Large Tall Heather Navy Blue $16.00 $20.99 $20.99
sleeve)
Industrial Work .
Red Kap : White and
20 Sp24 Shirts (short 3 X Large Tall Heathar Navy Blue $16.00 $20.99 $20.99
sleeve)
Industrial Work z
Red Kap : White and
21 Sp24 Shirts (Short |4 X Large Tall st Navy Blue $16.00 $22.99 $20.99
Sleeve)
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
22 |Generation |Shirt (Short Small-X Large |Heather, or Rissuss Bl $17.95 $18.99 $14.95
BG7206  [Sleeve) Navy Blue L
Blue Pigue Polo White, White or
23 |Generation |Shirt (Short 2-X Large |Heather, or ———— $18.95 $20.99 $15.95
BG7206  [Sleeve) Navy Blue VY
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
24 |Generation [Shirt (SHORT 3-X Large |Heather, or on liare $20.95 $20.99 $18.25
BG7206 SLEEVE) Navy Blue vy
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
25 |Generation [Shirt (Short 4 X Large |Heather, or Mo Bl $21.95 $20.99 $19.35
BG7206  [Sleeve) Navy Blue vy
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
26 |Generation [Shirt (Short X Large Tall Heather, or Navy Blue $17.50 NO BID $18.80
BG7206  |Sleeve) Navy Blue i
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
27 |Generation |Shirt (Short 2 X Large Tall |Heather, or Navv Blia $18.50 NO BID $19.80
BG7206  |Sleeve) Navy Blue vy
Blue Pique Polo White, White or
28 |Generation [Shirt (Short 3 X Large Tall |Heather, or Nawv Blue $20.50 NO BID $22.10
BG7206 _|Sleeve) Navy Blue VY




Blue Pique Polo White, White or
29 |Generation [Shirt (Short 4 X Large Tall |Heather, or Misas Ml $21.50 NO BID $23.20
BG7206  [Sleeve) Navy Blue ¥y
Wearguar| Pique Polo : 2
30 | d® FBG- | Shirts (long | Small - X large Ix\;'xeslﬁg N";’C;f%ﬁ; NOBID | $20.99 $16.49
12120 sleeve)
Wearguar | Pique Polo : i
31 | d®FBG- | Shirts (long | 2X Large Qﬁ'xemgg &’Z h'tzl‘:; NOBID | $22.99 $18.69
12120 sleeve) v
Wearguar | Pique Polo . .
32 | d® FBG- | Shirts (long | 3 X Large I\\f; C‘;eBlS; ,\YZ h't%'i; NOBID | $22.99 §19.79
12120 | Sleeve) "
Wearguar | Pique Polo ‘ )
33 | d® FBG- | Shirts (long 4 X Large NwarxeBIS; &l:wzﬁj; NO BID $22.99 $20.89
12120 Sleeve)
Wearguar| Pique Polo _ )
% | d® FBG- | Shirts (long | X Large Tall | ’xemgg l\}’;’w‘gl‘l’; NOBID | NOBID | NOBD
12120 Sleeve)
Wearguar | Pigue Polo _ s
35 | d® FBG- | Shirts (long | 3X Large Tall rz\; rxeBlS; &’;’ h'tzlire NOBID | NOBID NO BID
12120 | Sleeve) >
Wearguar | Pique Polo ; ;
36 | d® FBG- | Shirts (long | 4X Large Tal | White or | Whiteor | o g | nogD | NOBID
Navy Blue Navy Blue
12120 Sleeve)
: T Shirt (short Heather or |White or
37 I 5 Small - X 1 \ . g
Gildan®500, sleeye) ma arge Newy Blue sy Blos $8.25 $8.99 $5.79
; T Shirt (short Heather or [White or
38 |Gild 500 L : : 7.24
ildan® Sieee) 2 X Large Navy Blue |Navy Blue $9.75 $10.99 $
. T Shirt (short Heather or |White or
39 | 5 X ; ; ;
Gildan®500 slecve) 3 X Large Navy Blue |Navy Blue $10.50 $10.99 $8.89
: T Shirt (short Heather or |White or
40 |Gild 500 4 X L g ? ‘
ildan® deeva) arge Navy Blue |Navy Blue $10.50 $12.99 $8.89
Gildan®50 | T Shirt (short Heather or |White or
41 X L ; ;
00 sleeve) Brge Tal Navy Blue |Navy Blue i NOBID i
Gildan®50 | T Shirt (short Heather or [White or
42 Tall i 74
00 sleeve) & Luge e Navy Blue [Navy Blue $12.25 O B i
Gildan®50 | T Shirt (short Heather or |White or
43 X L Tall ; :
00 sleeve) gl Navy Blue |Navy Blue 2l NaBLa .
; T Shirt (short Heather or [White or
44 |Gild 500 ; B
ildan® seeve) 4X Large Tall Navy Blue |Navy Blue $12.95 NO BID NO BID
; T Shirt (long Heather or [White or
45 [ 24 Small - X | S ; :
Gildan®G sloie) ma arge Navy Blue | Navy Blue $10.25 $12.99 $7.94
. T Shirt (long Heather or [White or
46 |Gild 2 : ; i
ildan®G24 sjeeve) X Large Navy Blue |Navy Blue $12.15 $14.99 $10.29
) T Shirt (long Heather or |White or
47 |Gild 24 : i :
ildan®G € i 3 X Large Navy Blue |Navy Blue $13.70 $14.99 $12.62
; T Shirt (long Heather or |Heather or
48 |Gild 24 L : ] :
ildan®G sleeve) 4 X Large Navy Blue |Navy Blue $13.70 $16.99 $12.62
Gildan®G2 | T Shirt (long Heather or [Heather or
49 X | ; J
40 oave) Large Tal Navy Blue |Navy Blue $11.40 NO BID $9.58




50 Gildan®G2 | T Shirt (long 2 X Large Tall Heather or [Heather or $12.60 NO BID $10.98
40 sleeve) Navy Blue |[Navy Blue
Gildan®G2 | T Shirt (long Heather or |Heather or
51 3 X Large Tall 2. 11.24
40 sleeve) g Navy Blue |Navy Blue e Nl ¥
Gildan®G2 | T Shirt (long Heather or [Heather or
52 4 X Large Tall ! 1D 11.57
40 sleeve) = Navy Blue |Navy Blue ¥15.20 | NoB $
UnderArmor [UA Tech polo White or
53 1290140 S Small - X large o Navy Blue NO BID $16.99 $37.39
UnderArmor |UA Tech polo White or
54 1290140 fibist dleasi) 2 X Large ssiling Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 $37.39
UnderArmor |UA Tech polo White or
55 1290140 (ot dleeve) 3 X Large Heather Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 $41.79
UnderArmor| UA Tech polo White or
56 1290140 et sl 4 X Large Heather Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 $41.79
UnderArmor| UA Tech polo White or
57 1290140 et aleeve X Large Tall Heather Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 NO BID
UnderArmor| UA Tech polo White or
58 1290140 (it gleevd) 2 X Large Tall esthies Navy Blue NO BID $20.99 NO BID
UnderArmor| UA Tech polo White or
59 1290140 it alacd 3 X Large Tall Heather Navy Blue NO BID $20.99 NO BID
UnderArmor| UA Tech polo White or
60 1290140 iliedlinee) 4 X Large Tall Heather Navy Blue NO BID $22.99 NO BID
Polo shirts Heather,Navy, |[Navy Blue or
61 |UnderArmor Aot Slesid) Small - X large Blue,or White |White NO BID $19.99 $39.98
Polo shirts Heather,Navy, [Navy Blue or
62 |UnderArmor (e Slsevi 2 X Large Blue,or White |White NO BID $21.99 $39.98
Polo shirts Heather,Navy, [Navy Blue or
63 |UnderArmor T s Slised 3 X Large Blue,or White |White NO BID $21.99 $45.58
Polo shirts Heather,Navy, [Navy Blue or
64 [UnderArmor o Sloessd 4 X Large Blue,or White |White NO BID $23.99 $45.58
UnderArmor |Polo shirts Heathe ,Navy, |Navy Blue or
65 11285067 |(LongSleeve) | X 29 Tal |5iic or White |White NOBID | NOBIR HSIEE
UnderArmor |Polo shirts Heather,Navy, |Navy Blue or
66 1285067 |(LongSieove) [2 X129 TAN |5y o or White [White HOBID | NOBID NOEID
Heather
UnderArmor |Polo shirts ’ Navy Blue or
67 1285067 g STooi) 3 X Large Tall Nav.y, Blue, or White NO BID NO BID NO BID
White
UnderArmor |Polo shirts Heather,Navy, |Navy Blue or
68 11285067 |(LongSleeve) |1X1Ar9CTAN |5 o or White |White NOBID | NOBID N B
Urides (Szgl’aarr?li?egoli?g White or
69 |Armor 4 Small - X large Navy Blue NO BID $16.99 $36.84
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
Under (S:g‘aarl'?li(ljegols:)olg White or
70 |Armor . 2 X Large Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 $36.84
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
Unger g?l'aizlrr?li(ljegols:)(l)g White or
71 |Armor . 3 X Large Navy Blue NO BID $18.99 $41.79
Shirt (short Hegther
1281008
sleeve)
yed




P
Under | | Polo Whpeor
72 |Armor . 4 X Large Navy Blue NO BID NO BID $41.79
Shirt (short Hegther
128100
sleeve)
Under g:;rr?'gljegofi?g White or
73 |Armor - X Large Tall Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
i g?lzriicliegoffgl)g White or
74 |Armor . 2 X Large Tall Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
Linder g?rzrr?’}eb(ljegoliolg White or
75 |Armor : 3 X Large Tall Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
nder [C e Polo White or
76 |Armor : 4 X Large Tall Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt (short Heather
1281003
sleeve)
SMOCKS
WearGuard |Smock 3/4 ; .
77 e AFF-631 |Sleeve Small - X large | Navy Blue White $20.00 $20.99 $22.37
WearGuard [Smock 3/4 :
78 o AFF-631 Sl 2 X Large Navy Blue White $20.00 $22.99 $25.98
WearGuard |Smock 3/4 .
9 s AFF-631 |Sleeve 3 X Large Navy Blue White $20.00 $22.99 $25.98
WearGuard [Smock 3/4 s
80 |, AFF-631 |Sleeve 4 X Large Navy Blue White $20.00 NO BID $25.98
JACKETS
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets .
81 3149 (Fleece) Small - X large| Navy Blue White NO BID 33.99 $65.69
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets )
82 1149 (Fleece) 2 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID 35.99 $66.69
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets ;
83 1149 (Fleece) 3 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID 35.99 $69.72
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets ;
84 1149 (Fleece) 4 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID 37.99 $70.72
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets ;
85 1149 (Fleece) Large Tall Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $66.69
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets -
86 1149 (Fleece) 1 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $69.72
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets i
87 1149 (Fleece) 2 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $70.72
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets ;
88 3149 (Fleece) 3 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $71.82
Carhartt |Sweat Jackets .
89 1149 (Fleece) 4 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID NO BID




90

Red Kap
JD20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

Small - X large

Navy Blue

White

45.55

46.99

$66.72

91

Red Kap
D20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

2 X Large

Navy Blue

White

49,95

49.99

$77.92

52

Red Kap
D20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

3 X Large

Navy Blue

White

49.95

49.99

$83.42

93

Red Kap
D20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

4 X Large

Navy Blue

White

49.95

54.99

$85.62

94

Red Kap
JD20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

49.99

NO BID

95

Red Kap
D20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

49.99

NO BID

96

Red Kap
JD20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

2 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

54.99

NO BID

97

Red Kap
JD20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

3 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

54.99

NO BID

98

Red Kap
JD20

Zip Front
Hooded Jacket

(Duck)

4 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

99

WearGuard
® AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

Small — X
Large

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

19.99

$16.49

100

WearGuard
® AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

2 X Large

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

21.99

$19.79

101

WearGuard
® AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

3 X Large

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

21.99

$20.89

102

WearGuard
®AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

4 X Large

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

23.99

$21.99

103

WearGuard
®AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

21.99

NO BID

104

WearGuard
®AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

2 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

23.99

NO BID

105

WearGuard
®AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

3 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

23.99

NO BID

106

WearGuard
®AFF-355

Classic
Windbreaker

4 X Large Tall

Navy Blue

White

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




WearGuard

3 Season

Small - X

107 |®WEB- Jacket Large Navy Blue White $52.00 $35.99 $28.59
1445
WearGuard
3 Season .
108 |®WEB- 2 X Large Navy Blue White $54.00 $39.99 $29.69
Jacket
1445
WearGuard
3 Season .
109 |®WEB- 3 X Large Navy Blue White $56.00 $39.99 $30.79
Jacket
1445
WearGuard
3 Season ,
110 |®WEB- 4 X Large Navy Blue White $58.00 $39.99 $31.89
Jacket
1445
WearGuard
3 Season .
111  |®WEB- X Large Tall Navy Blue White $56.00 $39.99 $29.69
Jacket
1445
WearGuard
3 Season .
112 |®WEB- 2 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White $58.00 $44.99 $30.79
Jacket
1445
WearGuard s gy
113 |®WEB- 3 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White $60.00 $44.99 NO BID
Jacket
1445
WearGuard 3 Season
114 |®WEB- 4 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White $62.00 NO BID NO BID
Jacket
14‘(}15
Under
115  [Armor OK:?:";:;Z?" ST::' . X | Navy Blue White NOBID | $28.99 $65.99
13093362 9
Under
116  [Armor O;:L";’:;Zf“ 2Xlarge | Navy Blue White NOBID | $30.99 $65.99
130933627
Under
117 |Armor Ogﬁ:Log’:cizza" 3XLlarge | Navy Blue White NOBID | $30.99 $74.89
13093367
Under
118 |Armor OEZ?'S’?;C.S(Q?” 4Xlarge | NavyBlue | White NOBID | $32.99 NO BID
13093367
Under
119 |Armor OE‘;?S’:;Z?” X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NOBID | $28.99 NO BID
13093367
Under
120 |Armor O:;irLO(J):cire]te" 2 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID $30.99 NO BID
13093367
Under
121 |Armor OEET?S’S;Z?" 3 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NOBID | $30.99 NO BID
13093367
Under
122 |Armor OK:LOS’:C}S(ZS" 4 X Large Tall| Navy Blue White NOBID | NOBID NO BID
13093367
Insulated
g3 |Cohatt o e Small=X | yowBe | White NOBID | $49.99 $135.30
102702 Large
Jacket
Insulated
Carhartt 2 ;
124 Shoreline 2 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID $54.99 $135.30
102702
Jacket
ot Insulat.ed .
125 102702 Shoreline 3 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID $54.99 NO BID

Jacket




Carhartt Insulated
126 Shoreline 4 X Large Navy Blue White NO BID $54.99 NO BID
102702
Jacket
Carhartt Insulated
127 Shoreline X Large Tall Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $142.18
102702
Jacket
Carhartt Insulated
128 Shoreline 2 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID $142.18
102702
Jacket
Carhartt Insulated
129 Shoreline 3 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID NO BID
102702
Jacket
Carhartt Insulated
130 Shoreline 4 X Large Tall | Navy Blue White NO BID NO BID NO BID
102702
Jacket
WearGuard ) Small = X
131 ®Web-801 Rainwear Large Yellow None NO BID $17.99 $17.29
WearGuard .
132 ®Web-801 Rainwear 2 X Large Yellow None NO BID $19.99 $17.79
WearGuard -
133 ®Web-801 Rainwear 3 X Large Yellow None NO BID $19.99 $18.29
WearGuard .
134 ®Web-801 Rainwear 4 X Large Yellow None NO BID $21.99 NO BID
WearGuard .
135 ®Web-801 Rainwear X Large Tall Yellow None NO BID NO BID NO BID
135 [WeNGURN L, o 2 X Llarge Tall |  Yellow None NOBID | NOBID NO BID
®Web-801 9
j3y |WearGuard .  vear 3X Large Tall |  Yellow None NOBID | NOBID NO BID
®Web-801 9
WearGuard .
138 ®Web-801 Rainwear 4 X Large Tall Yellow None NO BID NO BID NO BID
COVERALLS
. Uninsulated
Dickies Small = X y
139 33999 Coverall (short Large Navy Blue White $32.85 $26.99 $31.48
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
140 33999 Coverall (short |2 X Large Navy Blue White $32.85 $29.99 $31.48
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
141 33999 Coverall (short |3 X Large Navy Blue White $34.25 $29.99 $36.78
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
142 33999 Coverall (short |4 X Large Navy Blue White $34.25 $32.99 NO BID
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
143 33999 Coverall (short | X Large Tall |Navy Blue White $34.25 $29.99 $33.98
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
144 33999 Coverall (short | 2 X Large Tall [Navy Blue White $34.25 $32.99 $33.98
sleeve)




Dickies Uninsulated
145 33999 Coverall (short | 3 X Large Tall |Navy Blue White $34.25 NO BID $39.38
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
146 33999 Coverall (short | 4 X Large Tall [Navy Blue White $34.25 NO BID NO BID
sleeve)
UNINSULATED COVERALLS
- Uninsulated
147 | Dickies | veralis (long [P3! ~X Navy Blue white | $3475 | $27.99 $34.25
4861 Large
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
148 4861 coveralls (long]2 X Large Navy Blue White $35.75 $29.99 $34.25
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
149 4861 coveralls (long]3 X Large Navy Blue White $38.75 $29.99 $36.98
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
150 4861 coveralls (long 4 X Large Navy Blue White $38.75 $32.99 $36.98
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
151 4861 coveralls (long |X Large Tall Navy Blue White $38.75 $29.99 $36.98
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
152 4861 coveralls (long |2 X Large Tall Navy Blue White $38.75 $32.99 $36.98
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
153 4861 coveralls (long |3 X Large Tall Navy Blue White $38.75 $32.99 $41.28
sleeve)
Dickies Uninsulated
154 4861 coveralls (long |4 X Large Tall Navy Blue White $38.75 $38.99 $41.28
sleeve)
INSULATED COVERALLS
L Insulated
155 | DIKESTVZ {eo eralls (iong 7™ =X INavy Blue White $63.75 | $87.99 $75.98
39 Large
sleeve)
TR Insulated
156 D'Ck'BeQSTVZ Coveralls (long [2- X Large  |Navy Blue White $63.75 | $92.99 $75.98
sleeve)
vz Insulated
157 D'Ckfgswz Coveralls (long |3 X Large ~ |Navy Blue White $68.75 | $92.99 $82.21
sleeve)
_ Insulated
158 D'Ckfswz Coveralls (long |4 X Large Navy Blue White $68.75 $97.99 $82.21
sleeve)
- i Insulated
159 D'Ckgegswz Coveralls (long |2 X Large Tall |Navy Blue White $68.75 $97.99 $82.21
sleeve)
s Insulated
160 D'Ck';_fwz Coveralls (long |3 X Large Tail [Navy Blue White $7470 | $97.99 $82.21
sleeve)
¢ g Insulated
161 D'Ck'ng Coveralls (long |4 X Large Tall |Navy Biue White $74.70 | NOBID $82.21
sleeve)




INSULATED BIB COVERALLS

Dickies Insulated Bib |Small — X
162 TB839 Coveralls |Large Navy Blue NONE $57.00 $46.99 $61.75
Dickies Insulated Bib
163 TB839 Covaralls 2- X Large Navy Blue NONE $57.00 $49.99 $61.75
Dickies Insulated Bib
164 TB839 Coveralls 3 Xlarge Navy Blue NONE $61.00 $49.99 $67.16
Dickies Insulated Bib
165 TB839 Covarills 4- X Large Navy Blue NONE $61.00 $54.99 $67.16
Dickies Insulated Bib
166 TB839 Pom— 2 X Large Tall | Navy Blue NONE $61.00 $54.99 $67.16
Dickies Insulated Bib
167 TB839 i 3 X Large Tall Navy Blue NONE $66.00 $54.99 $67.16
Dickies Insulated Bib
168 TB839 P 4 X Large Tall Navy Blue NONE $66.00 NO BID $67.16
HATS
SUMMER HATS
Wearguard . One Size Fits | Navy Blue or :
169 ® AFF-936 Poplin All Royal Blue White NO BID $8.99 $7.81
WINTER HATS
Wearguard ; One Size Fits | Navy Blue or ;
170 ® 31069 Low Profile Al Royal Blue White NO BID 8.99 $6.87
BALL CAPS
pork Camouflage |One Size Fits
171 Authority ) g Mossy Oak White $11.40 $12.99 $8.52
Series All
C855
pg | Harkartt Men's  |OneSiZeFits |y v Blue White NO BID 9.99 $12.23
A18 All
SPORT -TEK CAP
Sport-Tek ? One Size Fits |Royal Blue & .
173 STC11 Men'’s All White White $11.40 NO BID $8.79
BACK SUPPORT
174 |Uline H-441|Lumbar Belt f\)l?e SRS Black None $11.00 | NOBID $39.79
TOTAL (ITEMS 1 THROUGH 174) $2,999.75 |$3,921.74$4,917.71
ONE -TIME SET-UP FOR EMBROIDERY $30.00 INO CHARGH $30.00
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