
Bishop Bus 

Service

Chesapeake 

Charter
ParTrans

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

PER BUS PER BUS PER BUS

(ROUND TRIP) (ROUND TRIP) (ROUND TRIP)

6/18/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 ~No Bid~

6/20/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:00 a.m. [1] 2:15 p.m. $500.00 $525.00 $

6/25/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

6/27/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:30 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $550.00 $525.00 $

7/2/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/5/2019 Climb Zone 9:45 a.m. 3:00 p.m. $725.00 $595.00 $

7/9/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/11/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:00 a.m. 
¹ 2:15 p.m. $500.00 $525.00 $

7/16/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/18/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:30 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $550.00 $525.00 $

7/23/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/25/2019 Sky Zone 9:00 a.m. 
[2]

 
and

 
[3] 12:30 p.m. $550.00 $575.00 $

7/30/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

8/1/2019 Watkins Regional Park 9:30 a.m. 2:30 p.m. $700.00 $550.00 $

8/6/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:00 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

8/8/2019 Six Flags 9:00 a.m. 4:30 p.m. $950.00 $550.00 $

$8,225.00 $8,570.00 ~No Bid~

[1] Varies based on movie times.

[2]  Stop 1:15 p.m. at Hallowing Point Park for lunch – depart at 2:00 p.m. to return to camp location(s).

[3] Contingent on weather.

BID Tabulation

ITB 2019-136
Summer Camp Transportation - Cool Kids Camp

DATE TRIP DESTINATION
EXPECTED 

DEPARTURE TIME

EXPECTED RETURN 

TIME

SUBTOTAL A – NORTHERN AREA 

A.          NORTHERN AREA 

http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23772


BID Tabulation

ITB 2019-136
Summer Camp Transportation - Cool Kids Camp

Bishop Bus 

Service

Chesapeake 

Charter
ParTrans

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

PER BUS PER BUS PER BUS

ROUND TRIP ROUND TRIP ROUND TRIP

6/18/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

6/20/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:00 a.m. 2:15 p.m. $450.00 $525.00 $1,275.00 

6/25/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

6/27/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:45 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $450.00 $525.00 $800.00 

7/2/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

7/5/2019 Climb Zone 9:35 a.m. 3:00 p.m. $675.00 $625.00 $1,300.00 

7/9/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

7/11/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:00 a.m.
¹ 2:15 p.m. $450.00 $525.00 $800.00 

7/16/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

7/18/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:45 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $450.00 $525.00 $800.00 

7/23/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

7/25/2019 Sky Zone 9:15 a.m.² ³   12:30 p.m. $450.00 $595.00 $1,200.00 

7/30/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

8/1/2019 Watkins Regional Park 9:30 a.m. 2:30 p.m. $625.00 $575.00 $1,200.00 

8/6/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:15 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $1,200.00 

8/8/2019 Six Flags 8:50 a.m. 4:30 p.m. $900.00 $575.00 $1,275.00 

$7,650.00 $8,670.00 $18,250.00 

DATE TRIP DESTINATION

EXPECTED 

DEPARTURE 

TIME

EXPECTED RETURN 

TIME

SUBTOTAL B – CENTRAL AREA

A.          CENTRAL AREA

http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23772


BID Tabulation

ITB 2019-136
Summer Camp Transportation - Cool Kids Camp

Bishop Bus 

Service

Chesapeake 

Charter
ParTrans

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

PER BUS PER BUS PER BUS

ROUND TRIP ROUND TRIP ROUND TRIP

6/18/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 ~No Bid~

6/20/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:15 a.m. 
¹ 2:15 p.m. $375.00 $550.00 $

6/25/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

6/27/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:30 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $425.00 $550.00 $

7/2/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/5/2019 Climb Zone 9:15 a.m. 3:00 p.m. $650.00 $650.00 $

7/9/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/11/2019 Flagship Premium Cinemas 11:15 a.m.
¹ 2:15 p.m. $375.00 $550.00 $

7/16/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/18/2019 Lord Calvert Bowling 10:30 a.m. 2:00 p.m. $425.00 $550.00 $

7/23/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

7/25/2019 Sky Zone 9:00 a.m. ² and ³ 12:30 p.m. $425.00 $625.00 $

7/30/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

8/1/2019 Watkins Regional Park 9:00 a.m. 2:30 p.m. $625.00 $595.00 $

8/6/2019 Cove Point Park Pool 11:45 a.m. 4:00 p.m. $400.00 $525.00 $

8/8/2019 Six Flags 8:40 a.m. 4:30 p.m. $875.00 $595.00 $

$7,375.00 $8,865.00 ~No Bid~

Bishop Bus 

Service

Chesapeake 

Charter
ParTrans

$8,225.00 $8,570.00 ~No Bid~

$7,650.00 $8,670.00 $18,250.00 

$7,375.00 $8,865.00 ~No Bid~

$23,250.00 $26,105.00 $18,250.00 

SUBTOTAL A – NORTHERN AREA

SUBTOTAL B – CENTRAL AREA 

A.          SOUTHERN AREA

SUBTOTAL C – SOUTHERN AREA

TOTAL

DATE TRIP DESTINATION

EXPECTED 

DEPARTURE 

TIME

EXPECTED 

RETURN TIME

SUBTOTAL C – SOUTHERN AREA

BID SUMMARY

http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23772
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23770
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23771
http://www.co.cal.md.us/DocumentCenter/View/23772

