ITB 2019-086

ON CALL MARINE CONTRACTOR SERVICES

BID COMPARISON

Bidder

Unit of

Description Measure

McKenzie
Contracting

Edwin A. and
John O.
Crandell, Jr.

S E Davis
Construction

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Foreman per Hour

$50.00

$90.00

$85.00

l*Worker per Hour

$35.00

$65.00

$70.00

Dump Back , Ten (10) Ton Net Weight Load, Capacity

Including Power, and Operator per Hour

$95.00

$120.00

$125.00

Excavator, Hydraulically Operated, Truck Mounted, Diesel
Powered, Self-Propelled, Remote Controls, Telescopic,
Rotating Boom, 3/4 Cubic Yard Minimum Bucket, 2' Wide
Minimum Digging Bucket; Gradall G-660 Or Approved
Equal, Including Accessories, Power. and Operator

per Hour

$160.00

$170.00

$150.00

Front Shovel (Loader), Tire or Crawler Mounted. Diesel
Powered, 75 HP, 1.5 Cubic Yard Minimum Capacity;
Caterpillar 914G or Equal, Including Accessories, Power,
and Operator

per Hour

$130.00

$135.00

$105.00

|[Dozer, Trawler Mounted, Diesel Powered, 70 HP, 6-Way
Angle Blade, 8-Foot Wide Blade Minimum, Caterpillar D3C
or Approved Equal, Including Accessories, Power, and
Operator

per Hour

$175.00

$135.00

$105.00

HP, John Deere 4475 or Approved Equal, Including Mini
Hoe, Grapple, Rake, Box Grader, Rack, Bush Hog, Power
Broom, and Other Accessories, Power, and Operator

Utility Tractor (Skid Steer): Wheel Mounted, Minimum 25
per Hour

$110.00

$100.00

$100.00

Powered, 1.0 Cubic Yard Minimum Capacity Bucket, 14'
Digging Depth; Caterpillar 416c or Approved Equal, with
Accessories Including Grapple and Vibratory Hoe-Pack, and
Other Accessories, Power, Operator

Hydraulic Excavator (Backhoe), Crawled Mounted, Diese!
per Hour

$160.00

$105.00

$100.00

|[Crane, Crawler, or Cable, Truck or Barge Mounted, Fixed or
Swinging Lead, Minimum 40-Ton Capacity at 12' Radius,
Capacity to Drive Maximum 50-Foot Vertical or Better Pile,
Including Accessories, Power, and Operator.

per Hour

No Bid

$250.00

$390.00

Clamshell Crawler or Barge Mounted, Minimum 1/2-Cubic

Yard Bucket, Including Accessories, Power, and Operator REf-Haar

No Bid

$245.00

$500.00

Pile or Sheeting Driver (Large), Air or Diesel Hammer,
Minimum 2,500 Feet-Lbs., MKT#6 or Approved Equal, er Hour
Including Leaders, Caps, Cushions, Helmets, Templates, P

Power, and Operator

No Bid

$150.00

$750.00

Minimum 300 Feet-Lbs., Vulcan DGH-100 or Approved per Hour

Equal, Including Accessories, Power, and Operator

’P_r or Sheeting Driver (Small), Air or Drop Hammer,

No Bid

$100.00

$650.00

Pile Extractor, Vibratory, Minimum 25 Ton Pull, Vulcan
1400 or Approved Equal, Including Accessories, Power, and
Operator

per Hour

No Bid

$150.00

$1,000.00

Barge, Minimum 20-Feet X 40-Feet, for Material Transport,
Staging, or Pile Driving, Including Push/Pull Tug Boat,
Power, and Operator

per Hour

No Bid

$300.00

$300.00
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

Bidder
Description Unit of McKenzie Ed‘;’;: ::"d S E Davis
Measure Contracting ’ Construction
Crandell, Jr.
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
|Floating Work Platform, Minimum 5-Feet x 20 Feet, Steel or 5
Timber, Including Accessories, and Operator e Hou HE Bl #70.00 A
Hydro Seeder, Truck or Trailer Mounted with Truck, 10,000
Gallon Minimum Capacity, Including Accessories, Power, per Hour $160.00 $155.00 $125.00
and Operator
|Mulcher, Including Flatbed Truck, Ford F700 or Approved
Equal, Including Accessories, Power, and Operator per Haur $135.00 FL0G.00 FL50.00
Air Compressor, Wheel, Trailer, or Truck Mounted,
Silenced, 100 CFM Free Air at 100 psi Pressure Minimum, per Hour $110.00 $26.00 $30.00
Including Hoses, Attachments, Accessories, and Power
|Generator, Gasoline or Diesel Operated, 10 KW Minimum,
Including Battery, Charger, and Accessories per Hour $75.00 42000 $20.00
Mechanical Compactor, Rammer Type, Gas Powered,
Manually Guided, Caterpillar 825 or Approved Equal, per Hour No Bid $75.00 $80.00
Including Accessories, Power, and Operator
Weld Machine, Arc Welder, Minimum 200 Amperes, with
Rods, Fillets, Torches, Accessories, Power, and Operator per Haur 19000 L2540 150,00
Chainsaw: Minimum 18" Chain Bar, Including Chains, Files,
Accessories, Power, and Operator perHour ¥73:00 L L
Under Water Chain Saw, Capable of Cutting Timber Piles
and Sheeting, Includes Chains, Files, Accessories, Power, per Hour $110.00 $437.00 $175.00
and Operator
Power Saw, Capable of Cutting Wood, Metal, Concrete,
Asphalt, etc., Including Blades, Sharpeners, Accessories, per Hour $75.00 $75.00 $75.00
Power, and Operator
Power Drill, Rotary Impact, or Minimum 1" Core in Timber,
Steel or Concrete (6" Slab), Including Bits, Accessories, per Hour $130.00 $73.00 $95.00
Power, and Operator
Power Nailer, Impact, Pneumatic, Including Accessories, per Hour $65.00 $68.00 $80.00
Power, and Operator
Power Wrench, Impact, Pneumatic, Including Accessories, per Hour $65.00 $73.00 $75.00
Power, and Operator
Water Pump, Hand Operated, 2" Minimum Discharge, 3.5 per Hour $85.00 $26.00 $105.00

HP Minimum, Including Accessories, Power, and Operator
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

Bidder
Description Unit of McKenzie Ed\;v;:r‘Aband S E Davis
Measure Contracting i Construction
Crandell, Jr.
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
I1Concrete Pump, Truck Mounted, 4" Line, 10-Foot Boom, :
Including Truck, Accessories, Power, and Operator pes-Hour NoGd ¥280:00 el
Concrete Placer-Spreader, Minimum 250-HP, Including .
Accessories, Power, and Operator RN No Bid 25000 ¥500.00
Concrete Vibrator, Minimum 3-HP, Including Accessories,
ower. e Ororator g per Hour $75.00 $75.00 $80.00
Asphalt Paver, Tire Mounted, 8-Foot Wide, Includin :
Acgessories 1 rerster 9 per Hour No Bid $400.00 $700.00
Boat Pilot perpzlf’s.‘fi o $75.00 $150.00 $100.00
Project Manager perp';fslg; Pe $80.00 $150.00 $100.00
Carpenter perpg‘;’;i per $50.00 $130.00 $75.00
Laborer perp’zfs‘g:: per $35.00 $60.00 $70.00
[IDiver perpgfslgf] per No Bid $125.00 $130.00
Diver Supervisor perP:‘;r:: per No Bid $160.00 $100.00
Dive Tender e Hou/pes No Bid $125.00 $75.00
Person
Rescue Diver per Houripey No Bid $125.00 $130.00
Person
gl;)rgnga:g(r)nn{_i%ernn;oggiatlon, Including but tnot Limited to Daily No Bid $4.700.00 $7,500.00
TOTAL $2,505.00 $10,279.00 $15,678.00
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BID COMPARISO

N (continued)

Description

Bidder
MUnit of McKenzie Ed‘;:::band S E Davis
easure . . 2
Contracting Crandell, Jr. Construction
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

ADDITIONAL MANPOWER AND/OR EQUIPMENT NOT COVERED UNIT PRICING

|[(Contractor was requested to provided any additional manpower and equipment information and pricing with their bid

which may or may not be used. Items are in addition to those requested in the bid.)

(Not Required.)

6-Wheel Dump Truck per Hour $95.00

Pick-Up Truck with Trailer per Hour $110.00

4-Crew Member Dive Team 8-Hour Day $3,800.001
[Tugboat per Hour $300.00
||Boat Captain per Hour $150.00L
Safety Boat per Day $100.00|
Flatbed Dump Truck with Driver per Hour $100.00
30 x 90 Deck Barge per Day $620.00l!
30 x 90 Deck Barge per Month $4,000.00"
“Crawler Crane with Operator under 40-Ton Capacity per Hour $200.00
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