Description

RS Hughes
443-853-7767

Wurth Wood Group
240-755-9046

Performance Safety
636-326-4688

Global Geeks
800-421-6603

Moreya Biomedical
646-450-0178

Readan
301-204-5566

Strothers Nursing
301-266-3439

Unit of Measure/Price

Case = 10 Pack - Did not
Leather Palm Gloves | |Pack = 12 Pairs Case =6 Eacks Pack = 1 Pair Case = 48 . Pack = 12 Pairs| Packs of 12 Case = 72 Show Unit of Case = 72
of 12 Pairs Packs of 1 Pair . Packs per Case Packs
Pairs . Measure
. . Did not Offer
Large $28.95 $173.70 $7.45 $357.60 No Bid No Bid $37.20 $372.00 Price $225.81 $2.58 $185.71
X-Large $31.05 $186.30 $9.27 $444.96 $37.20 $372.00 $242.91 $2.95 $212.85
XXX-Large $32.85 $197.10 N/A N/A $37.20 $372.00 $256.23 $3.14 $226.01
_ Case = 10 _ Pack - Did not _
Safety Glove Pack = 1 Pair |Case = 72 Pairs Pack = 1 Pair Case = 144 ) _ Pack = 12 Pair |Packs of 12 Did not Offer Case = 72 Show Unitof | <35¢ =72
Packs of 1 Pair No Bid No Bid . Packs per Case Packs
Pairs Price Measure
Large $5.92 $425.99 $0.89 $128.16 $110.40 $1,104.00 $585.00 $7.06 $508.47
Case = 10 Case = 10 Case = 10 Case = 10
Nitrile Latex Free GIoveJ Pack = 50 Pairs Packs of 50 | |Pack = 100 Paifl Packs of 100 | | Pack - 50 Pair | Packs of 50 Pack - 50 Pair | Packs of 50 Case = 10 Pack = 100 Case = 10
. ; . . Boxes Eacb Packs
Pairs Pair Pair Pair
Small No Bid Cannot Provide $19.99 $199.90 $19.99 $199.90 $12.95 $129.50 Did Not Offer $156.00 $16.00 $1,600.00
Medium (Not Requested) $11.63 $116.30
Large $11.63 $116.30 $19.99 $199.90 $19.99 $199.90 $12.95 $129.50 $156.00 $16.00 $1,600.00
For Further Comparison Purposes - Breakdown per Pair Based on Unit of Measure Offered at Unit Price
Leather Palm Gloves Per Pair
Large $2.41 $2.41 7.34 $7.45 $3.10 $3.10 $3.14 $2.58 $2.58
X-Large $2.59 $2.59 9.27 $9.27 No Bid No Bid $3.10 $3.10 Did not Offer $3.37 $2.95 $2.96
XXX-Large $2.74 $2.74 n/a n/a $3.10 $3.10 $3.56 $3.14 $3.14
Safety Glove
$5.92 $5.92 $0.89 $0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.20 $9.20 Did Not Offer $8.13 $7.06 $7.06
Large
Nitrile Latex Free GIoveJ
i Cannot Provide Small $0.20 $0.20 $0.40 $0.40 $0.26 $0.26 $15.60 $0.32 $0.80
Sma
No Bid Did Not Offer
Medium (Not Requested) $0.23 $0.23
Large $0.23 $0.23 $0.20 $0.20 $0.40 $0.40 $0.26 $0.26 $15.60 $0.32 $0.80




