Bid Comparison
RFQ: 2021-048 - Uniform Apparel

Reauest for Quote: Mi-Hub AA C db. Nati I Ink and Stitch
. . 1-Hu orp dba ational Ink an itch,
2021-048 Chesapeake Uniform Hanover Uniform CO Affinity Apparel LLC Eagle Group
Uniform Apparel
Description Item ID # I:er;ICL Substitute :I:JI::.I-E Substitute :I:JI::.I-E Substitute :I{‘I::.I-E Substitute :I{‘I::.I-E Substitute
A-1|T-SHIRT(S) — Unisex Gildan G2300 A-1.1 $12.95 SavMar PC55P $6.97 $10.80 $9.00 $8.75
Gildan G2300 A-1.2 $14.50 SavMar PC55P $9.70 $13.93 $11.00 $9.75
Gildan G2300 A-1.3 $14.50 SavMar PC55P $11.78 $15.15 $12.00 $10.75
Gildan G2300 A-1.4 $14.90 SavMar PC55P $11.83 $15.15 $12.50 $12.75
A-2|WORK SHIRT(S) — Unisex Red Kap SY50KH A-2.1 $29.90 $19.74 $25.22 $27.00 Red Kap SP14 $26.50 Red Kap 5450
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.2 $32.75 $23.70 $29.66 $29.00 Red Kap SP14 $28.50 Red Kap 5450
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.3 $32.75 $23.70 $29.66 $30.00 Red Kap SP14 $29.50 Red Kap 5450
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.4 No Bid $39.50 (Custom) No Bid $31.00|Red Kap SP14 $32.50|Red Kap 5450
A-3|WORK SHIRT(S) — Unisex Red Kap SY60KH A-3.1 $28.65 $17.42 $22.62 $42.00 Red Kap SP2L $29 $26.50
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.2 $31.50 $20.90 $26.53 $44.00 Red Kap SP2L $31 $28.50
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.3 $31.50 $20.90 $26.53 $45.00 Red Kap SP2L $32 $29.50
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.4 No Bid $34.85 (Custom) No Bid $46.00|Red Kap SP2L $33 $32.55
A-4|POLO SHIRT(S) — Unisex Jerzee 437MSR A-4.1 $13.85 SavMar KPSS $6.70 $10.53 $13.00 $9.88
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.2 $15.85 SavMar KPSS $10.12 $13.71 $15.00 $10.88
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.3 $16.85 SavMar KPSS $11.62 $16.59 $16.00 $12.88
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.4 $19.25 SavMar KPSS $13.02 $16.59 $17.00 $13.88
B-1|SWEATSHIRT(S) — Unisex Dickies TW382 B-1.1 $51.75/SavMar C5620 $42.00 Berne SZ101 $40.31 Berne SZ101 $50.00|Cornerstone CS620 $42.00
Dickies TW382 ||B-1.2 $52.75/SavMar C5620 $42.00 Berne SZ101 $44.03 Berne SZ101 $52.00Cornerstone CS620 $44.00
Dickies TW382 ||B-1.3 $54.75 SavMar C5620 $47.60 Berne SZ101 $44.03 Berne SZ101 $53.00Cornerstone CS620 $46.00
Dickies TW382 |B-1.4 $56.75 SavMar C5620 $48.50 Berne SZ101 $45.87 Berne SZ101 $54.00 Cornerstone CS620 $48.00
B-2|JACKET(S) — Unisex Dickies T1350 ||B-2.1 $69.90 SavMar C5J41 $46.80 $67.96 Berne HI601 $56.00|Cornerstone J763H $52.00
Dickies T1350 ||B-2.2 $70.90 SavMar C5J41 $46.80 $71.68 Berne HI601 $58.00|Cornerstone J763H $54.00
Dickies T1J350 ||B-2.3 $73.90 SavMar C5J41 $56.00 $71.68 Berne HI601 $59.00 | Cornerstone J763H $56.00
Dickies T1350 |B-2.4 $76.35 SavMar C5J41 $56.00 $73.56 Berne HI601 $60.00 Cornerstone J763H $58.00
B-3||JACKET(S) — Unisex Dickies JT75 ||B-3.1 $41.75 Red Kap JT50Brown $32.40 Dickies TJ55DB $44.24 Dickies TJ55 $65.00|Cornerstone J763 $50.00
Dickies JT75 ||B-3.2 $46.35 Red Kap JT50Brown $32.40 Dickies TJ55DB $48.48 Dickies TJ55 $67.00|Cornerstone 1763 $52.00
Dickies JT75 ||B-3.3 $46.35 Red Kap JT50Brown $35.70 Dickies TJ55DB $48.48 Dickies TJ55 $68.00|Cornerstone 1763 $54.00
Dickies JT75 B-3.1 No Bid $35.70 Dickies TJ55DB $48.48 Dickies TJ55 $69.00 Cornerstone 1763 $58.00
C-1{CARGO PANTS Wrangler 70L3 C-1.1 $33.50 RothCo 5935 $32.00 Wrangler 3W045LD $39.01 Kontoor 3WA66 $36.00 Dickies 5549 $21.00
Wrangler 70L3 C-1.2 $33.90 RothCo 5935 $34.00 Wrangler 3W045LD $42.80 Kontoor 3WA66 $38.00 Dickies 5549 $23.00
C-2(BIB OVERALL PANTS Dickies DB100 C-2.1 $41.75 Berne B1068 $35.00 Berne B1067 $45.60 Berne B1068 $75.00 Carhartt CT102776 $42.00
Dickies DB100 C-2.2 $44.90 Berne B1068 $39.00 Berne B1067 $50.16 Berne B1068 $80.00 Carhartt CT102776 $44.00
Dickies DB100 C-2.3 $47.95 Berne B1068 $42.00 Berne B1067 $54.72 Berne B1068 $82.00 Carhartt CT102776 $46.00
Dickies DB100 Cc-2.4 $47.95 Berne B1068 $44.00 Berne B1067 $54.72 Berne B1068 $85.00 Carhartt CT102776 $48.00
C-3(BIB OVERALL PANTS Dickies TB244 C-3.1 $53.25 Berne B415 $51.50 Berne B415 $50.75 Berne B215 $85.00 Dickies TB839 $52.00
Dickies TB244 C-3.2 $53.25 Berne B415 $51.50 Berne B415 $52.27 Berne B215 $87.00 Dickies TB839 $54.00
Dickies TB244 C-3.3 $56.50 Berne B415 $56.20 Berne B415 $55.30 Berne B215 $88.00 Dickies TB839 $56.00
Dickies TB244 C-3.4 $56.50 Berne B415 $61.50 Berne B415 $55.30 Berne B215 $90.00 Dickies TB839 $56.00
C-4|COVERALL PANTS Dickies 48611 C-4.1 $27.00/Red Kap CT10 $35.93|VF ImageWear CT10 No Bid $48.00
Dickies 48611 C-4.2 $31.35/Red Kap CT10 $35.93|VF ImageWear CT10 No Bid $50.00
Dickies 48611 C-4.3 $52.50|(Custom) $35.93|VF ImageWear CT10 No Bid $52.00
Dickies 48611 C-4.4 $55.50/(Custom) $42.51 VF ImageWear CT10 No Bid $54.00
C-5(|COVERALL PANTS Dickies TV239 C-5.1 $65.25 Berne 1417 $63.78 Berne B415 No Bid $98.00
Dickies TV239 C-5.2 $65.25 Berne 1417 $69.84 Berne B415 No Bid $99.00
Dickies TV239 C-5.3 $71.75 Berne 1417 $75.90 Berne B415 No Bid $99.00
Dickies TV239 C-5.4 $71.50 Berne 1417 $75.90 Berne B415 No Bid $99.00
D-1(KNIT HAT Port Authority C908 D-1.1 $9.95 $4.20 $6.80 $8.00 $12.00
D-2|BALL CAP Port Authority C926 [D-2.1 $10.95 $5.60 $7.56 $9.00 $11.00
D-3(BALL CAP Port Authority C930 |D-3.1 $10.95 $5.60 $7.56 $9.00 $11.00
| | $1,452.50 $1,706.55 $1,879.74 $1,882.50 $2,012.57
Lisa G. Tolomei - 410-535-1600 ext. 2522 or
Lisa.Tolomei@CalvertCountyMD.gov Page 1of2 2/2/2021



Bid Comparison

RFQ: 2021-048 - Uniform Apparel

Request for Quote: Uniforms . .
Manufacturing of Impressive Promotional RIDDELL / ALL
2021-048 ! 9 Products LLC AMERICAN
Uniform Apparel Arizona LLC
Description Item ID # I:er;ICL Substitute I:jI:‘I:Z.I-E Substitute I:er;ICL Substitute
A-1|T-SHIRT(S) — Unisex Gildan G2300 A-1.1 $11.87 $10.95/Port & Company PC61P $9.58
Gildan G2300 A-1.2 $14.56 $13.95| Port & Company PC61P $11.58
Gildan G2300 A-1.3 $15.60 $13.95| Port & Company PC61P $12.58
Gildan G2300 A-1.4 $15.60 $13.95|Port & Company PC61P $14.58
A-2|WORK SHIRT(S) — Unisex  |Red Kap SY50KH A-2.1 $22.88 $28.95 Red Kap SP14 $27.61/Red Kap RKSP14G1
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.2 $26.55 $31.95 Red Kap SP14 $28.31/Red Kap RKSP14G1
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.3 $26.55 $31.95 Red Kap SP14 $28.31/Red Kap RKSP14G1
Red Kap SY50KH A-2.4 $41.21 $31.95 Red Kap SP14 No Bid
A-3|WORK SHIRT(S) — Unisex  |Red Kap SY60KH A-3.1 $20.73 $25.95 Red Kap SP24 $23.27/Red Kap SP24
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.2 $23.96 $28.95 Red Kap SP24 $25.54 Red Kap SP24
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.3 $23.96 $28.95 Red Kap SP24 $25.54 Red Kap SP24
Red Kap SY60KH A-3.4 $36.91 $28.95 Red Kap SP24 No Bid
A-4/POLO SHIRT(S) — Unisex Jerzee 437MSR A-4.1 $12.50 $11.95 Port & Company KP55 $12.28 Jerzee 437M
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.2 $15.53 $14.95 Port & Company KP55 $12.75|Jerzee 437M
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.3 $15.91 $14.95 Port & Company KP55 $14.14 Jerzee 437M
Jerzee 437MSR A-4.4 $15.37 $14.95 Port & Company KP55 $15.54 Jerzee 437M
B-1|SWEATSHIRT(S) — Unisex Dickies TW382 B-1.1 $49.68 $59.95 $52.99|Cornerstone CS620
Dickies TW382 B-1.2 $49.68 $62.95 $54.39/Cornerstone CS620
Dickies TW382 |B-1.3 $55.84 $62.95 $57.19/Cornerstone CS620
Dickies TW382 |B-1.4 $58.23 No Bid $61.37 Cornerstone CS620
B-2(JACKET(S) — Unisex Dickies TJ350 B-2.1 $80.65 $94.95 No Bid
Dickies TJ350 B-2.2 $80.65 $104.95 No Bid
Dickies TJ350 |B-2.3 $90.37 $104.95 No Bid
Dickies TJ350 |B-2.4 $89.52 $104.95 No Bid
B-3{JACKET(S) — Unisex Dickies JT75 [B-3.1 $31.37 $64.95 No Bid
Dickies JT75 |B-3.2 $31.37 $67.95 No Bid
Dickies JT75 |B-3.3 $34.09 $67.95 No Bid
Dickies JT75 B-3.1 $34.09 No Bid No Bid
C-1{CARGO PANTS Wrangler 70L3 Cc-1.1 No Bid $59.95| Dickies WP80 No Bid
Wrangler 70L3 Cc-1.2 No Bid $64.95 Dickies WP80 No Bid
C-2(BIB OVERALL PANTS Dickies DB100 Cc-2.1 $73.70 Berne B415 $59.95 No Bid
Dickies DB100 C-2.2 $73.70 Berne B415 $64.95 No Bid
Dickies DB100 C-2.3 $80.49 Berne B415 $64.95 No Bid
Dickies DB100 C-2.4 $80.49 Berne B415 No Bid No Bid
C-3(BIB OVERALL PANTS Dickies TB244 Cc-3.1 $73.70 Berne B415 $95.95 No Bid
Dickies TB244 Cc-3.2 $73.70 Berne B415 $104.95 No Bid
Dickies TB244 C-3.3 $80.49 Berne B415 $104.95 No Bid
Dickies TB244 C-3.4 $80.49 Berne B415 No Bid No Bid
C-4{COVERALL PANTS Dickies 48611 C-4.1 $48.02 $64.95 No Bid
Dickies 48611 C-4.2 $48.02 $69.95 No Bid
Dickies 48611 Cc-4.3 $48.02 $69.95 No Bid
Dickies 48611 Cc-4.4 $48.02 $69.95 No Bid
C-5{COVERALL PANTS Dickies TV239 C-5.1 $98.54 $120.95 No Bid
Dickies TV239 C-5.2 $117.07 $125.95 No Bid
Dickies TV239 C-5.3 $117.07 $125.95 No Bid
Dickies TV239 C-5.4 $117.07 No Bid No Bid
D-1{KNIT HAT Port Authority C908 D-1.1 $11.45 $12.95 $15.75 Dome ASTRO
D-2|BALL CAP Port Authority C926 [D-2.1 $12.76 $14.95 $19.50
D-3(BALL CAP Port Authority C930 |D-3.1 $12.76 $14.95 $15.75 Port Authority C807
I I $2,320.79 $2,454.80 $538.55
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