
Hanover

1 Red Kap PT60
Men's Elastic Insert Work 

Pant
27-36, 37 unhemmed 28-42 Navy Blue $20.45

2 Red Kap PT60
Men's Elastic Insert Work 

Pant
27-36, 37 unhemmed 44-56 Navy Blue $20.45

3 Red Kap PX60
Men's Cargo Utility Pant with 

MIMIX
27-36, 37 unhemmed 28-42 Navy Blue $31.25

4 Red Kap PX60
Men's Cargo Utility Pant with 

MIMIX
27-36, 37 unhemmed 44-56 Navy Blue $31.25

5 Red Kap PX62
Men's Flat Front Pro Pant 

with MIMIX
27-36, 37 unhemmed 28-42 Navy Blue $37.25

6 Red Kap PX62
Men's Flat Front Pro Pant 

with MIMIX
27-36, 37 unhemmed 44-56 Navy Blue $37.25

7 Red Kap PX61
Women's Cargo Utility Pant 

with MIMIX
26-33, 34 unhemmed 2-20 Navy Blue $31.25

8 Red Kap PX61
Women's Cargo Utility Pant 

with MIMIX
26-33, 34 unhemmed 22-24 Navy Blue $31.25

9 Carhartt B111
Loose Fit Washed Duck 

Flannel-Lined Utility Pant
30-36 28-44 Carhartt Brown $40.00

10 Carhartt B111
Loose Fit Washed Duck 

Flannel-Lined Utility Pant
30-36 46-54 Carhartt Brown $45.00

11 Carhartt 103279
Rugged Flex Relaxed Fit 

Duck Utility Pants
30-36 28-44

Carhartt Brown, 

Navy Blue
$32.65

12 Carhartt 103279
Rugged Flex Relaxed Fit 

Duck Utility Pants
30-36 46-54

Carhartt Brown, 

Navy Blue
$37.65

13 Carhartt 102213
Women's Fleece Lined 

Crawford Pants

2-18 

Short,Regular,Tall
2-18 Black $43.50

$439.20

Hanover

14 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt      

(long sleeve)
Small-X Large Grey Navy Blue $20.95

15 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt         

(long sleeve)
2XL - 6XL Grey Navy Blue $23.95

16 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt             

(long sleeve)
Small-X Large Long Grey Navy Blue $20.95

17 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt            

(long sleeve)
2XL - 6XL Long Grey Navy Blue $23.95

18 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt           

(long sleeve)

Small-X Large     

Extra Long
Grey Navy Blue $35.85

19 Red Kap SP14 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt            

(long sleeve)

2XL - 6XL             

Extra Long
Grey Navy Blue $38.85

20 Red Kap SP24 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt            

(short sleeve)
Small-X Large Grey Navy Blue $18.50

21 Red Kap SP24 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt           

(short sleeve)
2XL - 6XL Grey Navy Blue $21.50

22 Red Kap SP24 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt           

(short sleeve)
Small-X Large Long Grey Navy Blue $18.50

23 Red Kap SP24 - SOLID
Industrial Work Shirt           

(short sleeve)
2XL - 6XL Long Grey Navy Blue $21.50

24 Red Kap SK92
Performance Knit Polo        

(Short Sleeve)
Small-X Large

Navy Blue, Grey, 

White
White, Navy Blue $28.80

25 Red Kap SK92
Performance Knit Polo       

(Short Sleeve)
2XL - 6XL

Navy Blue, Grey, 

White
White, Navy Blue $31.80

26 Red Kap SK6L
Performance Knit Polo         

(Long Sleeve)
Small-X Large

Navy Blue, Grey, 

White
White, Navy Blue $26.20

27 Red Kap SK6L
Performance Knit Polo    

(Long Sleeve)
2XL - 6XL

Navy Blue, Grey, 

White
White, Navy Blue $29.20

28 Red Kap SX11
Women's Industrial Work 

Shirt (Long Sleeve)
Small-X Large Grey Navy Blue $33.80

29 Red Kap SX11
Women's Industrial Work 

Shirt (Long Sleeve)
2XL - 4XL Grey Navy Blue $36.80

30 Red Kap SX21
Women's Industrial Work 

Shirt (Short Sleeve)
Small-X Large Grey Navy Blue $31.00

31 Red Kap SX21
Women's Industrial Work 

Shirt (Short Sleeve)
2XL - 4XL Grey Navy Blue $34.00

$496.10
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32 Gildan 5000
Heavy Cotton T-Shirt         

No Pocket (Short Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $9.00

33 Gildan 5000
Heavy Cotton T-Shirt         

No Pocket (Short Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $11.80

34 Gildan 5000
Heavy Cotton T-Shirt         

No Pocket (Short Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $13.45

35 Gildan 5000
Heavy Cotton T-Shirt         

No Pocket (Short Sleeve)
4XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $13.45

36 Gildan 5000
Heavy Cotton T-Shirt         

No Pocket (Short Sleeve)
5XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $13.45

37 Gildan 5400L
Women's 100% Cotton        

T-Shirt (Long Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $12.60

38 Gildan 5400L
Women's 100% Cotton        

T-Shirt (Long Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $14.90

39 Gildan 5400L
Women's 100% Cotton        

T-Shirt (Long Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $17.55

40 Gildan 5000L
Women's 90% Cotton/ 10% 

Poly T-Shirt (Short Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $10.17

41 Gildan 5000L
Women's 90% Cotton/ 10% 

Poly T-Shirt (Short Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $12.25

42 Gildan 5000L
Women's 90% Cotton/ 10% 

Poly T-Shirt (Short Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $13.30

43 Gildan 8300
Cotton Blend T-Shirt with 

Pocket (Short Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $13.10

44 Gildan 8300
Cotton Blend T-Shirt with 

Pocket (Short Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $16.65

45 Gildan 8300
Cotton Blend T-Shirt with 

Pocket (Short Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $18.40

46 Gildan 2400
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt No 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $12.75

47 Gildan 2400
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt No 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $15.55

48 Gildan 2400
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt No 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $18.40

49 Gildan 2400
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt No 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
4XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $18.40

50 Gildan 2400
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt No 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
5XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $18.40

51 Gildan 2410
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt With 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
Small - XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $16.20

52 Gildan 2410
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt With 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
2XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $18.20

53 Gildan 2410
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt With 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
3XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $20.25

54 Gildan 2410
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt With 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
4XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $20.25

55 Gildan 2410
Ultra Cotton T-Shirt With 

Pocket (Long Sleeve)
5XL Sport Grey Navy Blue $20.25

56 Gildan PP2025L
Women's Prime + Preux 

Energy Polo (Short Sleeve)
XS - XL White, Navy Blue Navy Blue, White NO BID

57 Gildan PP2025L
Women's Prime + Preux 

Energy Polo (Short Sleeve)
2XL White, Navy Blue Navy Blue, White NO BID

58 Gildan PP2025L
Women's Prime + Preux 

Energy Polo (Short Sleeve)
3XL

Gray, White, 

Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White NO BID

59 Gildan 72800L
Women's Double Pique Sport 

Polo (Short Sleeve)
Small - XL

Gray, White, 

Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White $17.10

60 Gildan 72800L
Women's Double Pique Sport 

Polo (Short Sleeve)
2XL

Sport Grey, 

White, Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White $20.15

61 Gildan 72800L
Women's Double Pique Sport 

Polo (Short Sleeve)
3XL

Sport Grey, 

White, Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White $20.15

62 Red Kap TP31 Women's Smock 3/4 Sleeve Small - XL Navy Blue White $25.90

63 Red Kap TP31 Women's Smock 3/4 Sleeve Small - XL Navy Blue White $45.75

64 Red Kap JD20
Zip Front Hooded Jacket 

(Duck)
Small - XL

Brown Duck, 

Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White $72.40

65 Red Kap JD20
Zip Front Hooded Jacket 

(Duck)
2XL - 5XL

Brown Duck, 

Navy Blue
Navy Blue, White $75.40

66 Red Kap JP68 Deluxe Soft-Shell Jacket Small - XL Black, Navy Blue White $76.10

67 Red Kap JP68 Deluxe Soft-Shell Jacket 2XL - 4XL Black, Navy Blue White $79.10

68 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket Small - XL Navy Blue White $42.75

69 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket 2XL - 6XL Navy Blue White $45.75
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70 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket Small - XL Long Navy Blue White $42.75

71 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket 2XL - 6XL Long Navy Blue White $45.75

72 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket
Small - XL             

Extra Long 
Navy Blue White $42.75

73 Red Kap JT38-7.25 Perma-Lined Team Jacket
2XL - 6XL                     

Extra Long
Navy Blue White $79.50

74 Red Kap JP70 HeavyWeight Parka Small - XL Black, Navy Blue White $116.20

75 Red Kap JP70 HeavyWeight Parka 2XL - 5XL Black, Navy Blue White $119.20

76 Red Kap JP70 HeavyWeight Parka Small - XL Long Black, Navy Blue White $116.20

77 Red Kap JP70 HeavyWeight Parka 2XL - 5XL Long Black, Navy Blue White $119.20

78 Red Kap J67
Women's Deluxe Soft-Shell 

Jacket
Small - XL Black White $76.10

79 Red Kap J67
Women's Deluxe Soft-Shell 

Jacket
2XL - 3XL Black White $79.10

80 Red Kap HJ10
Performance Work Hoodie 

Sweatshirt
Small - XL Navy Blue White $58.90

81 Red Kap HJ10
Performance Work Hoodie 

Sweatshirt
2XL - 4XL Navy Blue White $61.90

82 Red Kap HJ10
Performance Work Hoodie 

Sweatshirt
Small - XL Long Navy Blue White $58.90

83 Red Kap HJ10
Performance Work Hoodie 

Sweatshirt
2XL - 4XL Long Navy Blue White $61.90

84 Carhartt 104053
Women's Loose Fit Washed 

Duck Insulated Jacket
XS - XL

Brown Duck, 

Navy, Black
Navy Blue, White $93.75

85 Carhartt 104053
Women's Loose Fit Washed 

Duck Insulated Jacket
2 XL

Brown Duck, 

Navy, Black
Navy Blue, White $93.75

86 Carhartt 104053
Women's Loose Fit Washed 

Duck Insulated Jacket
1X - 3X

Brown Duck, 

Navy, Black
Navy Blue, White $93.75

87 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
Small - XL Brown Duck Navy Blue $88.65

88 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
2 XL Brown Duck Navy Blue $95.90

89 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
3XL - 5XL Brown Duck Navy Blue $95.90

90 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
Med - XL Tall Brown Duck Navy Blue $95.90

91 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
2XL Tall Brown Duck Navy Blue $95.90

92 Carhartt J140
Loose Fit Firm Duck Insuated 

Flannel-Lined Active Jacket
3XL - 4XL Tall Brown Duck Navy Blue $95.90

93 Carhartt 104440

Rain Defender Loose Fit 

Heavyweight Full -Zip Mock 

Neck Sweatshirt

Small - XL Black, Navy Blue White $49.50

94 Carhartt 104440
Rain Defender Loose Fit 

Heavyweight Full -Zip Mock 
2 XL Black, Navy Blue White $54.50

95 Carhartt 104440
Rain Defender Loose Fit 

Heavyweight Full -Zip Mock 
3XL - 4XL Black, Navy Blue White $54.50

96 Carhartt 104440
Rain Defender Loose Fit 

Heavyweight Full -Zip Mock 
Large - 3XL Tall Black, Navy Blue White $54.50

97 Carhartt 102703
Rain Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Soft Shell Jacket
Small - XL Black White $85.75

98 Carhartt 102703
Rain Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Soft Shell Jacket
2XL Black White $93.00

99 Carhartt 102703
Rain Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Soft Shell Jacket
3XL Black White $93.00

100 Carhartt 102703
Rain Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Soft Shell Jacket
Large - 2XL Tall Black White $93.00

101 Carhartt 100247
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Lightweight Rain Jacket
Small - XL Black None $49.50

102 Carhartt 100247
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Lightweight Rain Jacket
2 XL Black None $54.50

103 Carhartt 100247
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Lightweight Rain Jacket
3XL - 4XL Black None $54.50

104 Carhartt 100247
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Lightweight Rain Jacket
Large - 3XL tall Black None $54.50
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105 Carhartt 103510
Storm Defender Loose Fit 

Midweight Rain Jacket
Small - XL Black None $64.00

106 Carhartt 103510
Storm Defender Loose Fit 

Midweight Rain Jacket
2 XL Black None $69.00

107 Carhartt 103510
Storm Defender Loose Fit 

Midweight Rain Jacket
3XL - 4XL Black None $69.00

108 Carhartt 103510
Storm Defender Loose Fit 

Midweight Rain Jacket
Large - 3XL tall Black None $69.00

109 Carhartt 103507
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Rain Pant
Small - XL Back None $64.00

110 Carhartt 103507
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Rain Pant
2XL Back None $69.00

111 Carhartt 103507
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Rain Pant
3XL - 4XL Back None $69.00

112 Carhartt 103507
Storm Defender Relaxed Fit 

Midweight Rain Pant
Large - 3XL Tall Back None $69.00

113 Red Cap CC14
Snap-Front Cotton Coveralls 

(Lightweight)

36-50           

(Regular, Long)
Navy Blue White $46.75

114 Red Cap CC14
Snap-Front Cotton Coveralls 

(Lightweight)

52-58           

(Regular, Long)
Navy Blue White $46.75

115 Red Kap CT30
Insulated Twill Coveralls 

(Heavyweight)

Small - XL             

(Short,Regular,Long)
Navy Blue White $77.65

116 Red Kap CT30
Insulated Twill Coveralls 

(Heavyweight)

Small - XL             

(Short,Regular,Long)
Navy Blue White $77.65

117 Red Kap BD30
Insulated Blended Duck Bib 

Overalls
Small - XL Navy Blue None $113.15

118 Red Kap BD30
Insulated Blended Duck Bib 

Overalls
2XL - 5XL Navy Blue None $113.15

119 OttoCap 31-358
Cotton Twill Five Panel Pro 

Style Cap
One Size Fits All Navy Blue White NO BID

120 OttoCap 32-287
Cotton Twill Five Panel Pro 

Style Mesh Back Cap
One Size Fits All Navy Blue White NO BID

121 Port Authority C855 Pro Camoflauge Series Cap One Size Fits All RealTree Edge White $8.80

122 Carhartt A18 Knit Cuffed Beanie One Size Fits All
Navy, Black,    

Coal Heather
White $15.35

123 Carhartt 104485 Knit Insulated Face Mask One Size Fits All
Black,             

Coal Heather
None $21.15

$1,062.40

$5,605.47

$0.00

Hanover

25%
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