RFQ 2022-042

BID COMPARISON

PAGE 1 OF 3

RFQ 2022-042 SOLID WASTE UNIFORMS

BID COMPARISON
PRODUCTS Bidder
CINTAS | MEes,INC. | cHesapeake | A&A sales
ITEM # MFR . AND ITEM # DESCRIPTION INSEAM size (WAIST)|  coLor
UNIT PRICE
PANTS
1 |Dickies 874" Original 874 Work Pants 27-36, 37 unhemmed 28-44 Dark Ng;’gén"'““ter $30.00 $30.55 $28.20 $24.75
2 |Dickies 874! Original 874 Work Pants 27-36, 37 unhemmed 44-50 Dark Ng;’g’énH““ter $32.00 $30.55 $28.20 $24.75
3 |Dickies 874! Original 874 Work Pants 27-36, 37 unhemmed 52-58 Dark Ng;’gén"'““ter $50.00 $66.55 $28.20 $24.75
4 Dickies 774 Women's Original 774 Pants | Petite, Regular, Tall 2-24 Dark Navy $32.00 $30.36 $20.00 $35.99
SHIRTS
ITEM # MFR . AND ITEM # DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR EMZ';?:;ERY CINTAS | MES, INC. | CHESAPEAVE | ARA Sales
UNIT PRICE
s |Forester 9051 g::::ﬁgﬂif"’e Short Small - 2XL Safety Green Black NO BID $30.00 $18.90 $13.60
6 |Forester 9051 g::::ﬁ:ﬂff"e Short 3XL - 5XL Safety Green Black NO BID $32.73 $18.90 $13.60
7 |Forester 9051LONG g::::ﬁgﬂif"’e Long Small - 2XL Safety Green Black NO BID $33.64 $18.90 $14.60
8 |Forester 9051LONG g::::ﬁ:ﬂif"’e Long 3XL - 5XL Safety Green Black NO BID $35.45 $18.90 $14.60
9 |aildan 2000 G200 gl';;avecoﬁgucizt"; (Short Small - XL Safety Green Black $16.50 $13.35 $8.75 $7.95
10 |Gildan 2000 G200 gl';;avec",t\fgr;gdfzt"; (Short XL Safety Green Black $19.50 $17.29 $8.75 $10.10
11 |Gildan 2000 G200 gl';;avecoﬁgucizt"; (Short 3XL Safety Green Black $21.50 $19.95 $8.75 $11.50
12 |Gildan 2000 G200 gl';;avecoﬁgrégcizt"; (Short axL Safety Green Black $21.50 $19.95 $8.90 $11.50
13 |Gildan 2000 G200 gl';;avecoﬁgucizt"; (Short 5XL Safety Green Black $21.50 $19.95 $8.90 $11.50
14 |Gildan 2400 G240 gl';;avecoﬁgrégcizt"; (Long Small - XL Safety Green Black $20.00 $17.89 $10.90 $10.20
15 |Gildan 2400 G240 gl';;avec",t\fgr;gdfzt"; (Long XL Safety Green Black $22.00 $21.71 $10.90 $12.40
16 |Gildan 2400 G240 gl';;avecoﬁgucizt"; (Long 3XL Safety Green Black $23.00 $24.58 $10.90 $14.20
17 |Gildan 2400 G240 gl';;avec",t\fgr;gdfzt"; (Long axL Safety Green Black $23.00 $24.58 $8.90 $14.20
18 |Gildan 2400 G240 gl';;avecoﬁgucizt"; (Long 5XL Safety Green Black $23.00 $24.58 $8.90 $14.20
19 |Port Authority K500P g:'ekezgu\fv’} f,g'c"kéf)hm XS - XL Dark Green White $25.00 $26.35 $18.75 $14.99
20 |Port Authority K500P g:'ekezgu\fv’} f,g':’kéf)h"” XL Dark Green White $27.00 $28.16 $18.75 $15.99
21 |Port Authority K500P z:g‘ejgu‘i"} F;Z'C"kéf;“"t 3XL Dark Green White $29.00 $31.80 $18.75 $17.99
22 |Port Authority K500P gi'ekezgu\fv’} f,g':’kéf)h"” 4xL Dark Green White $30.00 $33.62 $18.75 $18.99
PAGE 1 SUBTOTAL| $466.50 | $613.50 | $349.75 $352.35
NOTES ! DICKIES 974 WORK PANTS IN HUNTER GREEN ARE $35.99 FOR A&A SALES' ITEMS 1, 2, AND 3
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PRODUCTS Bidder
ITEM # MFR . AND ITEM # DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR EM%';?_L'fRY CINTAS | MES, INC. | CHESAPEAKE | A%A Sales
UNIT PRICE
SHIRTS CONTINUED
23 |Port Authority K500P g:'ekezgu\fv’} f,g'cc’kéf)hm SXL Dark Green White $31.00 $37.25 $15.05 $20.99
24 |Port Authority K500P g:'ekezgu\fv’} f,g':’kéf)h"” 6XL Dark Green White $32.00 $39.07 $15.05 $21.99
25 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘(LKPTO “’:‘;‘:t‘)%'" (Long Sleeve, XS - XL Dark Green White $28.00 $29.98 $22.75 $17.99
26 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘('JKPTO “’:‘;‘:t‘)%'" (Long Sleeve, XL Dark Green White $30.00 $31.80 $22.75 $18.99
27 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘('JKPTO “’:‘;‘:t‘)%'" (Long Sleeve, 3XL Dark Green White $32.00 $35.44 $22.75 $20.99
28 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘('JKPTO “’:‘;‘:t‘)%'" (Long Sleeve, 4xL Dark Green White $33.00 $37.25 $22.75 $21.99
29 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘('JKPTO “’:‘;‘:t‘)%'" (Long Sleeve, 5XL Dark Green White $34.00 $40.89 $17.00 $23.99
30 |Port Authority K500LS ;‘('JKPTO ‘;‘;‘;’t‘)P""’ (Long Sleeve, 6XL Dark Green White $35.00 $42.71 $17.00 $24.99
31 [RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(:gs;;ei'js 3 Work Medium - XL F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $82.99 $111.84 $39.00 $64.50
32 [RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(:gs;;ei'js 3 Work XL F'Oiﬁzsve"t Black $85.99 $111.84 $39.00 $65.50
33 [RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(:gs;;ei'j‘s 3 Work 3XL F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $85.99 $111.84 $39.00 $66.50
34 |RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;;.\r/tls(zg::;ece?s 3Work | ledium - XL LONG! F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $85.99 $111.84 $39.00 $67.50
35 [RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(:gs;;ei'j‘s 3 Work 2XL LONG F'Oxﬁf"t Black $88.99 $111.84 $39.00 $67.50
36 |RedKap SS14-HV-TRC3 ;";I\r’t's(:gs;;ece'js 3 Work 3XL LONG F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $88.99 $148.13 $39.00 $67.50
37 [RedKap SS24-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(sng;;ge'i: 3 Work Medium - XL F'Oiﬁzsve"t Black $79.99 $109.27 $37.00 $63.00
38 [RedKap SS24-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(sngi;ge'i: 3 Work XL F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $84.99 $109.27 $37.00 $64.00
39 [RedKap SS24-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(sng;;ge'i: 3 Work 3XL F'Oiﬁzsve"t Black $84.99 $109.27 $37.00 $65.00
40 |RedKap SS24-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(sngi;ge'i: 3Work | viegium - XL LONG F'Oxﬁzsve"t Black $82.99 $109.27 $37.00 $66.00
41 |RedKap SS24-HV-TRC3 ;":I\r’t's(sng;;fe'i: 3 Work 2XL LONG F'Oiﬁzsve"t Black $85.99 $109.27 $37.00 $66.00
42 |RedKap S524-HV-TRC3 ;":L\r’t's(;ggiglge'i: 3 Work 3XL LONG F'Oxizsve"t Black $85.99 $144.67 $37.00 $66.00
OUTERWEAR
43 |Forester C3SWME zlrr:v]lveN\Zig:\fvs;:;:t Hi-Vis Medium - XL Grei:'/:?(tgllow Black NO BID $50.36 $26.95 $30.00
44 |Forester C3SWME f':'r’:-a'veN‘g’igsh\fvs:t‘:ili Hi-Vis 2XL - 3XL Gre::'/:?(tgllow Black NO BID $54.00 $27.95 $30.00
45 |Forester C3HOODDS-S ag‘gézr’gf:attgﬁs 3 Hi-vis Small - XL Grei:'/:?(tgllow Black NO BID $61.73 $37.50 $31.00
46 |Forester C3HOODDS-S f";‘g('jzt‘j"’se\'f:attiﬁs 3 Hi-vis 2XL - 8XL Gre::'/:?(tgllow Black NO BID $71.82 $38.50 $31.00
47 |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Cth’Lced Visibility Challenger XS - XL Safety Yellow Black $65.00 $76.78 $59.50 $55.00
48 |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Chkae’Lced Visibility Challenger XL Safety Yellow Black $67.00 $78.60 $59.50 $56.00
49 |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Cth’Lced Visibility Challenger 3XL Safety Yellow Black $69.00 $82.24 $60.50 $58.00
50  |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Cth’Lced Visibility Challenger 4xL Safety Yellow Black $70.00 $84.05 $50.00 $59.00
51 |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Chkae’Lced Visibility Challenger 5XL Safety Yellow Black $72.00 $87.69 $40.00 $61.00
52 |Port Authority SR1754 JE:Cth’Lced Visibility Challenger 6XL Safety Yellow Black $74.00 $89.51 $40.00 $62.00
53 |Port Authority 37995 Q::\fy%gﬂ?ss;k:afew XS - XL Safety Yellow Black $130.00 | $157.95 $118.75 $110.00
54 |port Authority 37995 Q::iyts;gci:?ss;k:afety XL Safety Yellow Black $135.00 | $159.76 $118.75 $111.00
55 |Port Authority 17995 Q::\fy%gﬂ?fafk:afew 3XL Safety Yellow Black $137.00 | $163.40 $118.75 $112.00
56 |Port Authority 37995 Q::\fy%gﬂ?ss;k:afew 4xL Safety Yellow Black $138.00 | $165.22 $90.00 $114.00
57 |Forester 7252G f;iiifa&;{;'” Suit - S-XL Yelli\?vffgeen None NO BID $54.45 $39.00 $35.00
PAGE 2 SUBTOTAL| $2,235.88 | $3,130.30 | $1,536.75 | $1,915.92
NOTES ' MEDIUM UNAVAILABLE FOR CHESAPEAKE'S ITEM 34
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PRODUCTS Bidder
CINTAS MES, INC. | CHESAPEAKE | A&A Sales
ITEM # MFR . AND ITEM # DESCRIPTION SIZE COLOR EM?;?}.R!ERY
UNIT PRICE
OUTERWEAR CONTINUED
Class 3 Hi-Vis Rain Suit - Safety
58 Forester 7252G Jacket and Pants 2XL Yellow/Green None NO BID $56.27 $39.00 $35.00
Class 3 Hi-Vis Rain Suit - } Safety
59 Forester 7252G Jacket and Pants 3XL - 8XL Yellow/Green None NO BID $65.45 $39.00 $44.00
60 Safetyline ACY119SC3 ANSI Class 3 Coverall Small - XL Yellow Black NO BID $115.20 $136.95 $196.00
61 Safetyline ACY119SC3 ANSI Class 3 Coverall 2XL Yellow Black NO BID $115.20 $136.95 $201.00
62 Safetyline ACY119SC3 ANSI Class 3 Coverall 3XL Yellow Black NO BID $115.20 $136.95 $206.00
63 Safetyline ACY119SC3 ANSI Class 3 Coverall 4XL Yellow Black NO BID $115.20 $100.00 $211.00
64 Safetyline ACY119SC3 ANSI Class 3 Coverall 5XL Yellow Black NO BID NO BID $100.00 $216.00
SHOES
17" Rubber Hi-Vis Slush
65 Cordova BYS Boots Over-Shoe Style 6-18 Yellow None NO BID $47.65 $29.50 $28.95
VESTS
66  |Forester PRSURV Forester Hi-Vis Class 2 M-3XL Safety Yellow None NO BID $20.91 $29.45 $15.95
Sleeveless Vest
HATS
Forester Hi-Vis Stocking Hat ’
67 Forester 00794R with Reflective Stripe One Size Safety Green None NO BID $11.11 $12.75 $8.95
PAGE 3 SUBTOTAL $0.00 $662.19 $760.55 $1,162.85
TOTAL (ITEMS 1-67)| $2,702.38 | $4,406.08 $2,647.05 $3,431.12
ONE-TIME SET-UP FOR EMBROIDERY $50.00 None $250.00 None
SUMMARY
COMPARISON FOR ITEMS BID BY ALL PARTIES
(1-4, 9-42, 47-56) COMPARISON FOR ALL BID ITEMS
ONE-TIME
BIDDER TOTAL BIDDER TOTAL EMBROIDERY TOTAL BID
CHESAPEAKE UNIFORM $1,641.00 CHESAPEAKE UNIFORM $2,647.05 $250.00| $2,897.05
A&A SALES $2,054.87 A&A SALES $3,431.12 $0.00| $3,431.12
CINTAS $2,702.38 MES, INC. $4,406.08 $0.00| $4,406.08
MES, INC. $3,319.71 CINTAS DID NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS




