
Item # MD Standard
Unit of 

Measure
Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1-1   352.01 B-48 Each 1 $4,458.00 $4,458.00 $7,975.00 $7,975.00
1-2   352.01 B-54 Each 1 $5,655.00 $5,655.00 $9,178.00 $9,178.00
1-3   352.01 B-60 Each 1 $6,050.00 $6,050.00 $10,021.00 $10,021.00
1-4   354.01 15-Inch Each 1 $875.00 $875.00 $1,070.00 $1,070.00
1-5   354.01 18-Inch Each 1 $950.00 $950.00 $1,222.00 $1,222.00
1-6   354.01 24-Inch Each 1 $1,258.00 $1,258.00 $1,733.00 $1,733.00
1-7   354.01 30-Inch Each 1 $1,638.00 $1,638.00 $2,208.00 $2,208.00

  Traffic Bearing Precast Box Culvert                    
  (Epoxy Rebar Required)

Item # MD Standard
Unit of 

Measure
Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

2-1   374.04 (Standard WR) (3.5 Vertical Feet) Each 1 $950.00 $950.00 $1,214.00 $1,214.00

2-1-A   374.04 (Standard WR) Vertical Foot 1 $295.00 $295.00 $270.00 $270.00

2-2   374.04 (374.02 Curbhead Only) Each 1 $250.00 $250.00 $395.00 $395.00

2-3   374.04 (374.03 Frame and Grate Only) Each 1 $2,568.00 $2,568.00 $3,110.00 $3,110.00

2-4   374.05 (Standard WRM) (3.5 Vertical Feet) Each 1 $1,898.00 $1,898.00 $3,621.00 $3,621.00

2-4-A   374.05 (Standard WRM) Vertical Foot 1 $535.00 $535.00 $449.00 $449.00

2-5   374.06 (Single WR)  (3.5 Vertical Feet) Each 1 $800.00 $800.00 $734.00 $734.00

2-5-A   374.06 (Single WR) Vertical Foot 1 $195.00 $195.00 $163.00 $163.00

2-6   374.06 (Frame and Grate Only) Each 1 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 $1,545.00 $1,545.00

2-7   374.08 (Triple WR) Each 1 $2,122.00 $2,122.00 $3,475.00 $3,475.00

2-7-A   374.08 (Triple WR ) Vertical Foot 1 $750.00 $750.00 $707.00 $707.00

2-8
 374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 5-Foot Trough  
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $1,707.00 $1,707.00 $2,885.00 $2,885.00

2-8-A  374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-9
  374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 10-Foot Trough    
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $3,126.00 $3,126.00 $3,754.00 $3,754.00

2-9-A   374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 10-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-10
  374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 15-Foot Trough  
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $3,749.00 $3,749.00 $4,629.00 $4,629.00

2-10-A   374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 15-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-11
  374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 20-Foot Trough   
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $5,430.00 $5,430.00

2-11-A   374.51 (Rectangular/Round COG) 20-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-12
  374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 5-Foot                                                     
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $1,707.00 $1,707.00 $2,885.00 $2,885.00

2-12-A   374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 5-Foot Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-13
  374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 10-Foot Trough              
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $3,126.00 $3,126.00 $3,754.00 $3,754.00

2-13-A   374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 10-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-14
 374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 15-Foot     (6.17 
Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $3,794.00 $3,794.00 $4,629.00 $4,629.00

2-14-A   374.61 (Rectangular/Round COS) 15-Foot Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-15
  374.61 (Rectangular/Road COS) 20-Foot Trough    
(6.17 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $5,430.00 $5,430.00

2-15-A   374.61 (Rectangular/Road COS) 20-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $240.00 $240.00 $292.00 $292.00

2-16
  374.66 (Shallow COG) 5-Foot Trough                    
(3.5 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $1,723.00 $1,723.00 $1,733.00 $1,733.00

2-16-A   374.66 (Shallow COG) 5-Foot Trough                        Vertical Foot 1 $250.00 $250.00 $244.00 $244.00

2-17
  374.66 (Shallow COG) 10-Foot Trough                           
(3.5 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $2,456.00 $2,456.00 $2,916.00 $2,916.00

2-17-A   374.66 (Shallow COG) 10-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $410.00 $410.00 $410.00 $410.00

Bidder

$20,884.00

80 NO BID NO BID

$33,407.00

  1.  Precast Headwalls/Box Culverts

                                                                                   Subtotal 1

ITB 2024-038

PRECAST STRUCTURES, FRAMES, COVERS, AND GRATES

2.  Precast Inlets                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     
Inlet Pricing Based on 3.5 Vertical Feet                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

Inlets 2.9-2.15 Based on 6.17 Vertical Feet                                                                                                                                                                                        
Line Item #'s with an "A" Shown shall be Based on per Vertical Foot

BID COMPARISON

Description
Superior Tank, Inc. Concrete Pipe & Precast LLC

1-8 Cubic Yard NO BID NO BID



Bid Comparison

ITB 2024-038

Page 2 of 2

Item # MD Standard
Unit of 

Measure
Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

2-18
  374.67 (Shallow COS) 5-Foot Trough                                
(3.5 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $1,957.00 $1,957.00 $1,733.00 $1,733.00

2-18-A   374.67 (Shallow COS) 5-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $230.00 $230.00 $244.00 $244.00

2-19
  374.67 (Shallow COS) 10-Foot Trough                                   
(3.5 Vertical Feet)

Each 1 $2,551.00 $2,551.00 $2,916.00 $2,916.00

2-19-A   374.67 (Shallow COS) 10-Foot Trough Vertical Foot 1 $276.00 $276.00 $410.00 $410.00

2-20   374.68 (COG/COS Opening) 5-Foot Each 1 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,781.00 $1,781.00

2-21   374.68 (COG/COS Opening) 10-Foot Each 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,955.00 $2,955.00

2-22   374.70 (Type S) (3.5 Vertical Feet) Each 1 $833.00 $833.00 $1,094.00 $1,094.00

2-22-A   374.70 (Type S) Vertical Foot 1 $190.00 $190.00 $243.00 $243.00

2-23   378.11 (K Inlet) (3.5 Vertical Feet) Each 1 $657.00 $657.00 $1,058.00 $1,058.00

2-23-A   378.11 (K Inlet) Vertical Foot 1 $161.00 $161.00 $230.00 $230.00

2-24   378.11 (Grate Only) Each 1 $1,158.00 $1,158.00 $951.00 $951.00

2-25   381.01 (Yard Inlet )  (3.5 Vertical Foot) Each 1 $557.00 $557.00 $663.00 $663.00

2-25-A   381.01 (Yard Inlet ) Vertical Foot 1 $120.00 $120.00 $151.00 $151.00

2-25-B   381.01 (Yard Inlet Traffic Bearing Grate Only ) Each 1 $330.00 $330.00 $299.00 $299.00

Item # MD Standard
Unit of 

Measure
Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

3-1   383.01 48-Inch - 4-Foot Vertical Base Each 1 $555.00 $555.00 $660.00 $660.00

3-2   384.13 48-Inch Diameter Drip Stone Landing Each 1 $225.00 $225.00 $257.00 $257.00

3-3   383.01 48-Inch Vertical Foot Riser Each 1 $120.00 $120.00 $101.00 $101.00

3-4   383.01 48-Inch Diameter 3-Foot Vertical Cone Each 1 $310.00 $310.00 $303.00 $303.00

3-5   383.01 Flat Top Each 1 $225.00 $225.00 $257.00 $257.00

3-6   384.03 60-Inch – 4-Foot Vertical Base Each 1 $1,165.00 $1,165.00 $1,445.00 $1,445.00

3-7   384.03 60-Inch – 4-Foot Vertical Base Each 1 $385.00 $385.00 $532.00 $532.00

3-8   384.03 60-Inch Diameter Vertical Foot Riser Each 1 $185.00 $185.00 $225.00 $225.00

3-9   384.17 60-Inch Diameter 3-Foot Cone Each 1 $525.00 $525.00 $675.00 $675.00

3-10   384.15 60-Inch Diameter Flat Top Each 1 $475.00 $475.00 $532.00 $532.00

3-11   383.61 Calvert County Storm Drain (Stamped) Each 1 $385.00 $385.00 $621.00 $621.00

3-12   383.61 Calvert County Sanitary Sewer (Stamped) Each 1 $385.00 $385.00 $621.00 $621.00

3-13   Coating of Manholes for Sewer Installation Each 1 $75.00 $75.00 $31.00 $31.00

BID COMPARISON (continued)

Description

TOTAL BID $83,680.00 $111,113.00

Bidder

Superior Tank, Inc. Concrete Pipe & Precast LLC

                                                                                   Subtotal 3 $5,015.00 $6,260.00

 3.  Precast Manholes

2.  Precast Inlets (continued)                                                                                                                                                                                                                       
Inlet Pricing Based on 3.5 Vertical Feet                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           
Inlets 2.9-2.15 Based on 6.17 Vertical Feet                                                                                                                                                                                        
Line Item #'s with an "A" Shown shall be Based on per Vertical Foot

                                                                                   Subtotal 2 $57,781.00 $71,446.00


