
Description
Per Ton 

Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total Description

Per Ton 
Price

Revenue 
Share

Annual 
Tons

Total

Processing Charge ($125.00)  - 1,831 ($228,875.00) Processing Charge ($125.00)  - 114 ($14,250.00)

Paper - 35% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $67.50 5% 641 $2,163.38
Mixed Rigid Plastic 
with Metal

$10.00 0% 114 $0.00

Cardboard - 65% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $110.00 10% 1,190 $13,090.00 ($14,250.00)
($213,621.63)

Description
Per Ton 

Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total

Processing Charge ($125.00)  - 1,037 ($129,625.00)
Glass - 25% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($15.00) 100% 259 ($3,885.00)
Aluminum Cans – 10% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $1,560.00 10% 104 $16,224.00
Plastic - 45% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($20.00) 0% 466 $0.00
Steel Cans – 15% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $155.00 5% 156 $1,209.00
Residue – 5% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $0.00 0% 52 $0.00

($116,077.00)

ITB 2025-026
DUAL STREAM PAPER, COMMINGLE, AND PLASTIC RECYCLING SERVICES

(Values based on annual value times estimated annual tonnage)

PROPOSAL #1 – MIXED PAPER & CARDBOARD RECYCLING PROPOSAL #3 - MIXED RIGID PLASTIC RECYCLING

PROPOSAL #2 - COMMINGLE RECYCLING

Adjusted Total

Adjusted Total

WB WASTE SOLUTIONS, LLC

Adjusted Total



Description
Per Ton 

Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total Description

Per Ton 
Price

Revenue 
Share

Annual 
Tons

Total

Processing Charge $115.00  - 1,831 $210,565.00 Processing Charge $115.00  - 114 $13,110.00

Paper - 35% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $67.50 75% 641 $32,450.63 Mixed Rigid Plastic with Metal $10.00 75% 114 $855.00
Cardboard - 65% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $110.00 75% 1,190 $98,175.00 $13,965.00

$341,190.63

Description
Per Ton 

Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total

Processing Charge $115.00  - 1,037 $119,255.00
Glass - 25% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($15.00) 75% 259 ($2,913.75)
Aluminum Cans – 10% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $1,560.00 75% 104 $121,680.00
Plastic - 45% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($20.00) 75% 466 ($6,990.00)
Steel Cans – 15% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $155.00 75% 156 $18,135.00
Residue – 5% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $0.00 75% 52 $0.00

$249,166.25

Adjusted Total
Adjusted Total

PROPOSAL #2 - COMMINGLE RECYCLING

Adjusted Total

ITB 2025-026
DUAL STREAM PAPER, COMMINGLE, AND PLASTIC RECYCLING SERVICES

(Values based on annual value times estimated annual tonnage)

WM RECYCLE AMERICA, LLC

PROPOSAL #1 – MIXED PAPER & CARDBOARD RECYCLING PROPOSAL #3 - MIXED RIGID PLASTIC RECYCLING



Description Per Ton Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total Description

Per Ton 
Price

Revenue 
Share

Annual 
Tons

Total

Processing Charge $120.67  - 1,831 $220,946.77 Processing Charge NO BID  - 114 NO BID

Paper - 35% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $67.50 90% 641 $38,940.75 Mixed Rigid Plastic with Metal $10.00  - 114 NO BID
Cardboard - 65% of Total Mixed Paper Weight $110.00 90% 1,190 $117,810.00 NO BID

$377,697.52

Description Per Ton Price
Revenue 

Share
Annual 

Tons
Total

Processing Charge $123.15  - 1,037 $127,706.55
Glass - 25% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($15.00) 90% 259 ($3,496.50)
Aluminum Cans – 10% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $1,560.00 90% 104 $146,016.00
Plastic - 45% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight ($20.00) 90% 466 ($8,388.00)
Steel Cans – 15% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $155.00 90% 156 $21,762.00
Residue – 5% of Total Mixed Commingled Weight $0.00 90% 52 $0.00

$283,600.05

Adjusted Total
Adjusted Total

PROPOSAL #2 - COMMINGLE RECYCLING

Adjusted Total

ITB 2025-026
DUAL STREAM PAPER, COMMINGLE, AND PLASTIC RECYCLING SERVICES

(Values based on annual value times estimated annual tonnage)

BFI TRANSFER SYSTEMS OF VIRGINA, LLC

PROPOSAL #1 – MIXED PAPER & CARDBOARD RECYCLING PROPOSAL #3 - MIXED RIGID PLASTIC RECYCLING


