BID NUMBER - PURCH 206-037 - REVERSIBLE BLUE/GRAY T-SHIRTS

BID COMPARISON
OPTION #1 - STYLE: V-NECK
Item #1 Item #2 Jtem #3 Item #4
Bidder Youth - Small Youth - Medium Youth - Large Adult - Small
Unit Price Sitv Total Price | Unit Price fzsttv Total Price | Unit Price E)St:! Total Price| Unit Price| Est. Qty |Total Prioe'
1|American Soccer Company, Inc. $11.93| 216 $2,576.88 $11.93 198 $2,362.14 $11.93| 216] $2,576.88 $11.93 180 $2,147.40|
2|International Promotional Ideas $20.25| 216 $4,374.00 $20.25 198 $4,009.50 $20.25| 216 $4,374.00 $20.25 180 $3,645.00F
3|Varcity Apparel No Bid
OPTION #1 - STYLE: V-NECK (continued)
Item #5 Item #6 Item #7 Item #8
Bidder Adult - Medium Adult - Large Adult - X-Large Adult - XOX(-Large
. Est. Est. . Est. . L
Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price Total Price] Unit Price| Est. Qty [Total Price|
oty Qty_ Qty
1|American Soccer Company, Inc. $11.93] 132 $1,574.76 $11.93 174 $2,075.82 $11.93| 108 $1,288.44 $12.93 1 $12.93
2|International Promotional Ideas $20.25| 132 $2,673.00 $20.25 174 $3,523.50 $20.25( 108 $2,187.00 $23.95 1 $23.95
3|Varcity Apparel No Bid
OPTION #1 - STYLE: V-NECK
(continued)
Bidder Item #9 Total Bid Based on Estimated
- Quantities
Adult - Medium
Unit Price Est. Total Price
oty
1|American Soccer Company, Inc. $13.93 1 $13.93 $14,629.18
2|International Promotional Ideas $25.55 1 $25.55 $24,835.50
3|varcity Apparel No Bid
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BID COMPARISON
OPTION #2 - STYLE: CREW NECK
Ttem #1 Ttem #2 Item #3 Ttem #4
Bidder Youth - Small Youth - Medium Youth - Large Adult - Small
Unit Price ;st:’ Total Price | Unit Price zst'\:r Total Price | Unit Price Est:; Total Price| Unit Price| Est. Qty |Total Price|
1|Varcity Apparel $12.50| 216 $2,700.00 $12.50 198 $2,475.00 $12.50| 216 $2,700.00 $12.50 180| $2,250.00
2{International Promotional Ideas $17.25| 216 $3,726.00 $17.25 198 $3,415.50 $17.25| 216| $3,726.00 $17.25 180| $3,105.00
3|American Soccer Company, Inc. No Bid
OPTION #2 - STYLE: CREW NECK (continued)
Item #5 Item #6 Item #7 Item #8
Bidder Aduilt - Medium Adult - Large Adult - X-Large Adult - XX-Large
Unit Price =35 Total Price | Unit Price Est. Total Price | Unit Price Est. Total Price| Unit Price| Est. Qty |Total Price
Qty Qty Qty
1|Varcity Apparel $12.50] 132 $1,650.00 $12.50 174 $2,175.00 $12.50; 108| $1,350.00 $12.50 1 $12.50
2|International Promational Ideas $17.25 132 $2,277.00 $17.25 174 $3,001.50 $17.25| 108| $1,863.00 $19.95 1 $19.95
3|American Soccer Company, Inc. Mo Bid
OPTION #2 - STYLE: CREW
NECK (continued)
Bidder Item #9 Total Bid Based on Estimated
- Quantities
Adult - Medium
unit Price| £t | Total Price
Qty
1|Varcity Apparel $12.50 1 $12.50 $15,325.00
2|International Promotional Ideas $21.55 1 $21.55 $21,155.50
3|American Soccer Company, Inc. No Bid




