CCG PURCH RFQ 2016-048
UNIFORMS
BUILDINGS & GROUNDS DIVISION

UNIT PRICES AND SUBSTITUTE/EXCEPTION INFORMATION

Chesapeake
Uniform Rental .
Cintas | Masterman's LLC
Ttem Substitution dba Lord
# Baltimore
Total Unit Price with Embroidery if Applicable
Item #1 - Work Pants
1a Not Allowed $13.50 $19.99 $17.44
ib $13.50 $21.99 $20.74
Item #2 - Jean Cut Work Pants
2a $14.50 $21.99 $18.99
Not Allowed
2b $14.50 $23.99 $22.02
Item #3 - Ranger Pants
3a $29.50| No Bid No Bid
3b Not Allowed $29.50| No Bid No Bid
1. Chesapeake Uniform - took an
Exception and Bid on Rothco 5935
Item #4 - Industrial Work Shirt, Long Sleeve
4a $15.80 $14.50 $18.23
4b Not Allowed $16.80 $16.50 $20.63
4b $20.80 $16.50 $20.63
Item #5 - Industrial Work Shirt, Short Sleeve
5a $13.80 $12.50 $16.23
5b Not Allowed $14.80 $14.50 $18.23
5¢ $15.80 $14.50 $18.23
Item #6 - Sweat Jacket, Fleece
6a $55.00 $52.99 $54.98
6b Not Allowed $70.00 $54.99 $54.98
6¢c $75.00 $56.99 $58.73

Exception. New Style Carhartt
100632 (not J149)
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Chesapeake
Uniform Rental . .
Item Substitution dba Lord Cintas | Masterman's LLC
# .
Baltimore
Total Unit Price with Embroidery if Applicable
Item #7 - Performance Knit Shirt, Short Sleeve
7a $19.50/ No Bid No Bid
7b Not Allowed $24.50( No Bid No Bid
7c $27.50] No Bid No Bid
1. Chesapeake Uniform - Took
Exception. New Style Sanmar K500L5
Item #8 - Flannel Lined Work Pants
8 Not Allowed $27.65| $32.99 $27.82
1. Chesapeake Uniform - Noted this
only goes to size 44 not to 48
Item #9 - Pique Polo, Long Sleeve
9a $21.50/ No Bid No Bid
9b Not Allowed $26.50( No Bid No Bid
9c $29.50/ No Bid No Bid
1. Chesapeake Uniform - Took
Exception. WearGuard only sold by
Aramark. Substituting Blue Gen 7208
Item #10 - Pique Polo, Long Sleeve
10a $18.00/ No Bid No Bid
10b Not Allowed $23.50( No Bid No Bid
10c $25.50/ No Bid No Bid
1. Chesapeake Uniform - Took
Exception. WearGuard only sold by
Aramark. Substituting Blue Gen 7206
Item #11 - T-Shirt, 3/4 Sleeve
11a $11.35 $8.00 $12.16
11b|Permitted - None Taken By Any Bidder $13.50 $9.50 $14.90
1ic $13.95 $10.00 $15.72
Item #12 - T-Shirt, Long Sleeve
12a $11.35 $10.00 $13.07
12b|Permitted - None Taken By Any Bidder $13.50 $11.50 $15.10
12c $13.95 $12.00 $15.91
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Chesapeake
Uniform Rental . .
Item Substitution dba Lord Cintas | Masterman's LLC
# .
Baltimore
Total Unit Price with Embroidery if Applicable
Item #13 - Women's Deluxe Smock, 3/4 Sleeve

13a $17.50 $19.99 No Bid
13b Permitted $21.50 $21.99 No Bid
13c $23.50 $23.99 No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform - Substitute

Red Kap TP31NV

2. Cintas - Substitute Red Kap TP31

Item #14 - 3-In-1 System Hooded Parka
14a $55.00/ No Bid No Bid
14b Not Allowed $69.00/ No Bid No Bid
14c $75.00/ No Bid No Bid
Item #15 - Industrial Panel Front Jacket

15a $28.50 $42.00 No Bid
15b Permitted $32.50 $44.00 No Bid
15c¢ $33.50 $46.00 No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform - Substitute

Red Kap JT22NV

2. Cintas - Substitute Cintas 970

Item #16 - Nylon Classic Windbreaker

16a $23.50( No Bid No Bid
16b Not Allowed $29.50/ No Bid No Bid
16¢ $34.50( No Bid No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform - Took

Exception. WearGuard only sold by

Aramark. Substituting Sanmar 05T71

Item #17 - Unisex Nylon Crew Jacket

17a $24.85 $32.99 $32.98
17b Not Allowed $34.50 $38.99 $38.33
17c $37.20 $38.99 $38.33
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Chesapeake
Uniform Rental . .
Item Substitution dba Lord Cintas | Masterman's LLC
# .
Baltimore
Total Unit Price with Embroidery if Applicable
Item #18 - 3-Season Jacket
18a $38.90 $55.00 No Bid
18b Permitted $46.65 $57.00 No Bid
18c $49.90 $59.00 No Bid
1. Chesapeake Uniform - Substitute
Tri-Mountain 8800
2. Cintas - Substitute Cintas 80843
Item #19 - Complete Rain Suit
19a $11.95 $17.99 No Bid
19b Permitted $13.50 $19.99 No Bid
19c $15.75 $21.99 No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform - Substitute
Radnor 64055911

2. Cintas - Substitute Cintas 237

Item #20 - Uninsulated Coverall, Short Sleeve

20a $25.30 $40.00 $29.23
20b Not Allowed $32.75 $42.00 $29.23
20c $35.50 $44.00 $31.55
Item #21 - Uninsulated Coverall, Short Sleeve
21a $27.35 $44.99 $31.67
21b Not Allowed $34.85 $46.99 $31.67
21c _ $37.90 $48.99 $34.30
1. Chesapeake Uniform noted Item #
should be 48611 not 4861.
Item #22 - Insulated Coverall, Long Sleeve
22a $61.50 $84.99 $66.61
22b Not Allowed $73.50 $87.99 $66.61
22c $85.50 $89.99 $72.67
Item #23 - Insulated Bib Overall, Long Sleeve
23a $54.25 $79.99 $52.88
23b Not Allowed $57.00 $81.99 $52.88
23c $59.75 $83.99 $58.19
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Chesapeake
Uniform Rental . .
Item Substitution dba Lord Cintas | Masterman's LLC
# .
Baltimore
Total Unit Price with Embroidery if Applicable
Item #24 - Summer Hat

24 Not Allowed $6.95| No Bid | No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform - Took

Exception. WearGuard only sold by

Aramark. Substituting Otto 102-664

Item #25 - Winter Hat (No Buckle Back Closures)

25 Permitted $6.95| No Bid | No Bid

1. Chesapeake Uniform Substitute

Sanmar CP80

2. Cintas 65280

Item #26 - Knit Hat

26 Permitted $6.75  $8.99] $2.00

No Substitutions Taken by Any Bidder

Item #27 - Camouflage Ball Cap
27| Not Allowed $11.90]  $11.99| $5.12
Item #28 - Back Support - Lumbar Belt

28 Permitted $37.50]  $18.99| $8.69

1. Cintas Substitute Ergodyne 30152

2. Mastermans Substitute Occunomia
626




